

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|---|-------|
| 10/01/2002 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON FEDERAL CIRCUIT AMICUS IN CHEROKEE CASE. | 909 |
| 10/02/2002 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON FEDERAL CIRCUIT AMICUS IN CHEROKEE CASE. | 910 |
| 10/03/2002 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK TO FINALIZE AMICUS BRIEF IN FEDERAL CIRCUIT IN CHEROKEE CASE. | 916 |
| 10/04/2002 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON FINALIZING FEDERAL CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 912 |
| 10/06/2002 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON FEDERAL CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 918 |
| 10/07/2002 | 4 | 0.30 | WORK ON FEDERAL CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 919 |
| 12/27/2002 | 4 | 0.75 | FOLLOW-UP ON CHEROKEE MOTION FOR REHEARING; REVIEW DRAFTS OF REHEARING PETITION; E-MAIL. | 963 |
| 01/02/2003 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON REHEARING AMICUS IN CHEROKEE CASE. | 964 |
| 01/03/2003 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF FOR REHEARING IN CHEROKEE; FOLLOW-UP CALLS. | 965 |
| 01/06/2003 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON AMICUS MEMO FOR CHEROKEE DECISION. | 967 |
| 01/07/2003 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS MOTION AND BRIEF RE IDC; REVIEW LLOYD MILLER TELEFAX; EMAIL TO LLOYD MILLER. | 968 |
| 03/23/2003 | 4 | 1.00 | ANALYZE LLOYD MILLER'S FEDERAL CIRCUIT BRIEF; DRAFT E-MAIL COMMENTS. | 1029 |
| 04/16/2003 | 4 | 0.50 | ANALYSIS OPTIONS FOR USING BREACH OF TRUST CONCEPT TO ENHANCE RAMAH BREACH OF CONTRACT CLAIMS ON PENDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION. | 1047 |
| 12/22/2003 | 4 | 2.00 | REVIEW FEDERAL CIRCUIT CERTIORARI PETITION AND TUNICA DECISION IN RE LEGAL ISSUES AFFECTING RAMAH. | 1160 |
| 12/22/2003 | 4 | 1.50 | MEET WITH MIKE GROSS AND ERIC TRIESMAN ON LEGAL ISSUES RE FEDERAL CIRCUIT CERTIORARI PETITION AND CHEROKEE TENTH CIRCUIT CASE. | 1161 |
| 12/23/2003 | 4 | 2.00 | CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE GROSS, ERIC TRIESMAN AND LLOYD MILLER ON FEDERAL CIRCUIT CERTIORARI PETITION AND RAMAH/TUNICA IMPLICATIONS. | 1162 |
| 03/30/2004 | 4 | 1.40 | CONFERENCE CALL ON CHEROKEE NORTON CASES TO U.S. SUPREME COURT. | 1208 |
| 04/30/2004 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF. | 1212 |
| 05/01/2004 | 4 | 0.40 | REVIEW REDLINE OF CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF. | 1213 |
| 05/02/2004 | 4 | 0.20 | FOLLOW-UP ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF. | 1214 |
| 05/03/2004 | 4 | 0.90 | WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS. | 1215 |
| 05/20/2004 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF. | 1217 |
| 05/21/2004 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF TO U.S. SUPREME COURT. | 1218 |
| 05/25/2004 | 4 | 0.25 | FOLLOW-UP CALLS ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF. | 1220 |
| 05/28/2004 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF; DO NEW REDLINE; CONFERENCE CALL WITH DAN AND ERIC T.; DRAFT FURTHER RESPONSE. | 1219 |
| 06/04/2004 | 4 | 1.75 | CONFERENCE CALL AND FOLLOW-UP ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF TO U.S. SUPREME COURT. | 1221 |
| 06/08/2004 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON CHEROKEE BRIEF TO SUPREME COURT. | 1224 |
| 06/09/2004 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON AMICUS BRIEF TO SUPREME COURT IN CHEROKEE CASE. | 1225 |
| 06/10/2004 | 4 | 0.70 | FOLLOW-UP WITH ERIC TREISMAN AND ART LAZARUS ON RAMAH BRIEF; DESCRIPTION ONLY REVISIONS. | 1226 |
| 06/11/2004 | 4 | 0.20 | FOLLOW-UP ON AMICUS BRIEF IN CHEROKEE CASE TO SUPREME COURT. | 1227 |
| 09/06/2004 | 4 | 1.00 | REVIEW AND MAKE COMMENTS ON U.S. BRIEF IN CHEROKEE | 1242 |

EXHIBIT

F

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|---|-------|
| 10/18/2004 | 4 | 1.00 | CASE RE TRIBAL IDC CLAIMS. REVIEW LLOYD MILLER'S CHEROKEE REPLY BRIEF IN SUPREME COURT; NOTE INCONSISTENCY WITH CLASS POSITION. | 1248 |
| 10/20/2004 | 4 | 3.00 | REVIEW AND ANALYZE LLOYD MILLER'S U.S. DISTRICT COURT REPLY BRIEF'S INCONSISTENCIES WITH CLASS POSITION; EXPLORE OPTIONS. | 1249 |
| 10/21/2004 | 4 | 3.00 | CALLS FROM LLOYD MILLER; CALLS TO MIKE GROSS; DO MEMORANDUM ON CAP DEFENSE ISSUES RE LLOYD MILLER'S REPLY BRIEF IN CHEROKEE; WORK ON SUBMISSION TO LLOYD MILLER AND ART LAZARUS, ETC. | 1259 |
| 10/22/2004 | 4 | 1.00 | REVISE/CONSULT ON MEMO TO LLOYD MILLER WITH MIKE GROSS, CHARLIE HOBBS AND GEOFF STROMMER; SEND TO SONOSKY, ETC.; WORK ON MOTION TO SUPREME COURT. | 1258 |
| 10/22/2004 | 8 | 0.30 | REVIEW MEMO TO L. MILLER. | 1260 |
| 10/23/2004 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK WITH MIKE GROSS ON ERRATA CORRECTIONS FOR LLOYD MILLER. | 1257 |
| 10/24/2004 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON ERRATA OPTIONS IN RE LLOYD MILLER CHEROKEE BRIEF. | 1255 |
| 10/25/2004 | 4 | 2.00 | PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL; DO CONFERENCE CALL ON ISSUES RE LLOYD MILLER'S CHEROKEE REPLY BRIEF. | 1256 |
| 10/26/2004 | 4 | 0.50 | DO FAX TO ART LAZARUS, LLOYD MILLER, ETC. ON FURTHER ERRATA ON CHEROKEE BRIEF; FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS. | 1254 |
| 10/27/2004 | 4 | 0.70 | CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE GROSS AND ART LAZARUS ON CHEROKEE ARGUMENT AND ERRATA. | 1253 |
| 11/23/2004 | 4 | 1.00 | ANALYZE CHEROKEE IN RE CONTRACT OUTCOME BY CAP YEAR CLAIMS. | 1264 |
| 03/21/2005 | 4 | 0.50 | CALLS TO HOBBS, STRAUS, DEAN & WALKER, LLP; CALL TO MIKE GROSS; WORK ON EVIDENCE ISSUE IN RE SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION ON CAP YEARS. | 1287 |
| 03/23/2005 | 4 | 0.30 | SCHEDULING/CASE COORDINATION DISCUSSION WITH MIKE GROSS IN RE IHS/BIA CASES AND CHEROKEE RULING AND SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEFING. | 1289 |
| 03/24/2005 | 4 | 0.10 | FOLLOW-UP REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE, SCHEDULING ON RAMAH RE CHEROKEE. | 1290 |
| 04/03/2005 | 4 | 0.70 | INITIAL REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS; ANALYZE ISSUE RE EFFECT OF TUNICA-BILOXI AND IHS CASES ON RAMAH BIA CASE. | 1293 |
| 04/04/2005 | 4 | 0.50 | DISCUSS LEGAL AND STRATEGY ISSUES IN RE MDL MOTION AND IMPACT ON RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER CLASS ACTION. | 1294 |
| 04/07/2005 | 4 | 1.00 | ORGANIZE PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT DOCUMENTS IN RE RAMAH BIA; CALLS IN RE INTERPLAY OF RAMAH, ZUNI, TUNICA SCHEDULING, BRIEFING, CHEROKEE, ETC.; REVIEW LETTERS FROM LLOYD MILLER, DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE AND MIKE GROSS. | 1296 |
| 07/01/2005 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON NEW SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF. | 1298 |
| 07/02/2005 | 4 | 0.75 | WORK ON NEW SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF. | 1297 |
| 07/03/2005 | 4 | 0.20 | REVIEW LLOYD MILLER'S MOTION FOR SEPARATE BRIEF IN RAMAH. | 1301 |
| 07/05/2005 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON RAMAH CLASS POSITION ON TUNICA-BILOXI/ZUNI MULTI-DISTRICT LITIGATION MOTION, ETC. | 1302 |
| 07/07/2005 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON LAST SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF. | 1300 |
| 07/13/2005 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON RAMAH SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF ON "CAPS" ISSUE; CALLS TO MIKE GROSS. | 1305 |
| 07/14/2005 | 4 | 0.75 | WORK ON RAMAH SUPPLEMENTAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT | 1304 |

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|--|-------|
| | | | BRIEF. | |
| 07/15/2005 | 4 | 0.60 | CONFERENCE CALL ON RAMAH SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF AND OTHER RAMAH ISSUES. | 1306 |
| 07/17/2005 | 4 | 1.25 | DISCUSS LEGAL ISSUES WITH MIKE GROSS ON RAMAH CLAIMS; REVIEW DRAFT RAMAH SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEFS FROM LLOYD MILLER AND OURS, ETC. | 1307 |
| 07/18/2005 | 4 | 3.00 | WORK WITH MIKE GROSS AND ERIC TREISMAN ON RAMAH BRIEF; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFTS. | 1308 |
| 07/20/2005 | 4 | 0.40 | WORK ON ORDERS APPROVING CPA PAYMENTS. | 1309 |
| 07/20/2005 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF. | 1310 |
| 07/22/2005 | 4 | 1.50 | LEGAL RESEARCH ON MONEY DAMAGE CLAIMS AND JURISDICTION ISSUES RE CAP YEARS. | 1311 |
| 07/23/2005 | 4 | 1.00 | LEGAL RESEARCH ON RAMAH SUMMARY JUDGMENT LEGAL ISSUES. | 1312 |
| 09/02/2005 | 4 | 2.50 | WORK ON NEW IDC CLAIM CHART FOR RAMAH CLASS; CALL TO MARCEL KERKMANS TO REVIEW CHART; CALL TO MARCEL KERKMANS AND MIKE GROSS TO REVIEW CHART. | 1313 |
| 09/11/2005 | 4 | 0.70 | ANALYSIS OF GOVERNMENT'S BRIEF ON RAMAH SUMMARY JUDGMENT ON CAPS CLAIMS. | 1314 |
| 09/12/2005 | 4 | 1.50 | FURTHER ANALYSIS OF GOVERNMENT'S SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF AND RESPONSE OPTIONS AND MIKE GROSS'S FIRST DRAFT OF REPLY BRIEF; DO MEMO. | 1315 |
| 09/13/2005 | 4 | 0.50 | FURTHER WORK ON RAMAH REPLY BRIEF ON CAP YEARS. | 1317 |
| 09/17/2005 | 4 | 4.00 | WORK ON FINAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF. | 1318 |
| 09/17/2005 | 4 | 4.50 | WORK ON FINAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF. | 1319 |
| 09/19/2005 | 4 | 2.00 | MEET WITH MIKE GROSS/ERIC TREISMAN ON REDRAFT OF FINAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT BR4IEF; FURTHER WORK ON BRIEF. | 1320 |
| 09/21/2005 | 4 | 3.50 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF IN RE SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION. | 1321 |
| 09/22/2005 | 4 | 2.00 | REVIEW AND EDIT RAMAH BRIEF AGAIN; MEETING WITH MIKE GROSS AND ERIC TREISMAN; CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE GROSS, ERIC TREISMAN, DAN MC MEEKEN AND ART LAZARUS. | 1322 |
| 09/24/2005 | 4 | 2.50 | REVIEW/REVISE RAMAH SUMMARY JUDGMENT RESPONSE/REPLY BRIEF. | 1323 |
| 09/25/2005 | 4 | 0.60 | FURTHER WORK ON RAMAH SUMMARY JUDGMENT RESPONSE/REPLY BRIEF. | 1324 |
| 09/26/2005 | 4 | 2.75 | MORE WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT CAPS BRIEF. | 1325 |
| 09/29/2005 | 4 | 0.50 | DISCUSS STRATEGY ISSUES IN RE COORDINATION OF CROWN POINT CASE AND RAMAH CASE RE JUDGMENT FUND AND CAPS QUESTIONS. | 1326 |
| 10/24/2005 | 4 | 0.50 | WORK ON NOTICE OF SUBMISSION AND REQUEST FOR ORAL ARGUMENT. | 1329 |
| 10/25/2005 | 4 | 0.60 | FOLLOW-UP AND FINALIZE NOTICE OF SUBMISSION DOCUMENTS; GET LLOYD MILLER AND KAREN RICHARDSON'S APPROVAL; DISCUSS WITH LLOYD MILLER AND KAREN RICHARDSON. | 1330 |
| 11/02/2005 | 4 | 0.50 | FOLLOW-UP ON BIA'S PROPOSED CSC POLICY/EQUITABLE RELIEF IN RAMAH. | 1335 |
| 12/19/2005 | 4 | 1.00 | REVIEW SHO-BAN DECISION IN RE RELEVANCE TO RAMAH CLAIMS; ANALYZE SETTLEMENT AND EQUITABLE RELIEF OPTIONS AND ISSUES; REVIEW ZUNI SUBMISSIONS RE IHS RELEVANCE TO RAMAH CLAIMS. | 1339 |
| 01/23/2006 | 4 | 0.40 | CALLS TO MIKE GROSS, KAREN RICHARDSON AND CALL AND | 1340 |

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|--|-------|
| | | | FAX TO TIM MARTIN IN RE BIA CSC FA LANGUAGE. | |
| 02/08/2006 | 4 | 0.50 | REVIEW CAHAYUGA CASE AND PROPOSED NOTICE OF SUPPLEMENTAL AUTHORITY. | 1343 |
| 02/15/2006 | 4 | 0.50 | CALL FROM LLOYD MILLER ON BIA-DIRECT CSC POLICY AND 2006-2007 APPROPRIATIONS ISSUE. | 1345 |
| 02/15/2006 | 4 | 1.00 | ANALYSIS OF SOUTHERN UTE CASE IN RE POSSIBLE IMPACT ON RAMAH; CALL TO MIKE GROSS. | 1346 |
| 02/18/2006 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON NOTICE AND PARTY ADMISSIONS EXHIBITS. | 1349 |
| 02/19/2006 | 4 | 1.00 | LEGAL RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS IN RE US DOJ STATEMENTS IN SOUTHERN UTE BRIEF AS TO PARTY ADMISSIONS. | 1350 |
| 02/20/2006 | 4 | 3.00 | LEGAL RESEARCH AND DRAFTING AND E-MAILS RE PARTY ADMISSION ISSUES RE SOUTHERN UTE AND RAMAH. | 1351 |
| 02/22/2006 | 4 | 3.00 | FURTHER WORK ON NOTICE RE PARTY ADMISSIONS AND ATTACHMENTS. | 1352 |
| 02/22/2006 | 4 | 4.00 | LEGAL RESEARCH; WORK ON NOTICE IN RE PARTY ADMISSIONS FROM SOUTHERN UTE CASE; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS, LLOYD MILLER AND ERIC TRIESMAN, AND LATER WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER. | 1353 |
| 02/23/2006 | 4 | 4.00 | WORK ON MOTION AND MEMO RE PARTY ADMISSIONS, ETC. RE CSC. | 1354 |
| 02/24/2006 | 4 | 0.50 | WORK ON MOTION/MEMO RE PARTY ADMISSIONS. | 1355 |
| 02/25/2006 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON MEMO IN RE GOVERNMENT'S PART ADMISSIONS. | 1356 |
| 02/26/2006 | 4 | 0.50 | MORE WORK ON RAMAH MOTION/MEMO IN RE PARTY ADMISSIONS. | 1357 |
| 02/27/2006 | 4 | 0.90 | CALLS/WORK ON MOTION/MEMO ON PARTY ADMISSIONS. | 1358 |
| 03/23/2006 | 4 | 0.40 | WORK ON REPLY RE PARTY ADMISSIONS. | 1359 |
| 03/24/2006 | 4 | 0.75 | WORK ON SOUTHERN UTE ADMISSIONS RESPONSE. | 1360 |
| 03/25/2006 | 4 | 0.50 | WORK ON REPLY IN RE RAMAH/SOUTHERN UTE CASE PARTY ADMISSIONS. | 1361 |
| 03/28/2006 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON REPLY RE RAMAH PARTY ADMISSIONS. | 1362 |
| 04/03/2006 | 4 | 0.75 | CALL IN RE IDC ISSUES RE RAMAH CASE. | 1363 |
| 05/08/2006 | 4 | 2.00 | ANALYZE MARCEL KERKMANS DEPOSITION IN TUNICA-BILOXI CASE IN RE POTENTIAL IMPACT ON RAMAH CLASS ACTION CLAIMS. | 1366 |
| 05/30/2006 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK WITH MARCEL KERKMANS ON DEPOSITION CORRECTIONS. | 1367 |
| 06/07/2006 | 4 | 0.20 | DISCUSSION WITH RICH MYERS, DEPARTMENT OF INTERIOR, IN RE RAMAH CASE ISSUES/STATUS. | 1368 |
| 06/09/2006 | 4 | 0.50 | E-MAIL REPORTING ON DISCUSSIONS WITH RICH MYERS ON RAMAH CASE STATUS AND ISSUES. | 1369 |
| 06/16/2007 | 4 | 0.70 | ANALYZE SOUTHERN UTE DOCUMENT IN RE IMPACT ON RAMAH CAP YEAR CLAIMS; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS. | 1465 |
| 10/19/2007 | 4 | 0.60 | CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE GROSS, ERIC TREISMAN AND DAN MACMEEKEN ON SOUTHERN UTE CASE IMPACT ON RAMAH CLAIMS. | 1512 |
| 01/17/2008 | 4 | 0.20 | REVIEW; ANALYZE SUSANVILLE CASE IN RE RELEVANCE TO RAMAH CLAIMS. | 1537 |
| 09/11/2008 | 4 | 1.00 | FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS ON RAMAH APPEAL ISSUES/LEGAL ARGUMENT ISSUES. | 1639 |
| 09/12/2008 | 4 | 1.00 | LEGAL ANALYSIS IN RE RAMAH APPEAL ARGUMENTS. | 1641 |
| 09/12/2008 | 4 | 0.60 | LEGAL ANALYSIS IN RE RAMAH APPEAL OPTIONS. | 1642 |
| 09/17/2008 | 4 | 0.60 | CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE GROSS AND DAN MACMEEKIN ON RAMAH APPEAL AS IMPACTED BY SOUTHERN UTE APPEAL. | 1643 |

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|---|-------|
| 09/18/2008 | 4 | 0.50 | ADDITIONAL CONFERENCE CALL ON RAMAH APPEAL-SOUTHERN UTE IMPACT/STRATEGY. | 1644 |
| 09/19/2008 | 4 | 3.00 | LEGAL ANALYSIS OF BRIEFS/ARGUMENTS IN TENTH CIRCUIT IN SOUTHERN UTE AS BEARING ON RAMAH APPEAL STRATEGY. | 1645 |
| 09/21/2008 | 4 | 3.00 | WORK ON RAMAH APPELLATE BRIEFING ISSUES; FURTHER LEGAL ANALYSIS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH LLOYD MILLER AND MIKE GROSS. | 1646 |
| 09/22/2008 | 4 | 3.50 | ANALYZE TUNICA-BILOXI RULING AND CLAIMS' COURT RAMAH NAVAJO SCHOOL BOARD RULING AND ITS IMPACT ON RAMAH CLASS ACTION APPEAL. | 1647 |
| 09/24/2008 | 4 | 0.75 | FURTHER LEGAL ANALYSIS IN RE EFFECT OF TUNICA AND RAMAH NAVAJO SCHOOL BOARD RULINGS ON RAMAH APPELLATE ARGUMENTS. | 1648 |
| 09/26/2008 | 4 | 0.40 | FOLLOW-UP LEGAL ANALYSIS IN RE RAMAH APPEAL ISSUES AND IMPACT OF SOUTHERN UTE APPEAL. | 1649 |
| 10/20/2008 | 4 | 3.00 | WORK ON DRAFT APPEAL BRIEF AND DOCKETING STATEMENT IN RAMAH CLASS ACTION. | 1650 |
| 10/25/2008 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON RAMAH LEGAL ARGUMENT AND DOCKETING STATEMENT. | 1652 |
| 10/26/2008 | 4 | 0.40 | FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS AND EMAIL ON QUESTION PRESENTED FOR RAMAH. | 1653 |
| 10/30/2008 | 4 | 0.20 | CONFERENCE CALL ON DOCKETING STATEMENT AND ENTRIES OF APPEARANCE WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER. | 1654 |
| 11/04/2008 | 4 | 1.50 | (APPEAL) WORK ON CERTIFICATE OF FILING AS APPELLANTS COUNSEL AND ECF FILING ISSUES. | 1656 |
| 11/10/2008 | 4 | 0.40 | WORK ON STATEMENT OF ISSUES FOR DOCKETING STATEMENT IN RAMAH APPEAL. | 1658 |
| 11/13/2008 | 4 | 0.70 | REVIEW SA HEADING BRIEF ISSUES AND CONTRACTIBLE, BUT NOT DIVISIBLE; FORT MOJAVE. | 1657 |
| 11/17/2008 | 4 | 0.40 | FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS ON APPELLATE ARGUMENTS/STRATEGY. | 1659 |
| 11/18/2008 | 4 | 0.50 | WORK ON RAMAH APPELLATE ARGUMENTS/ISSUES. | 1660 |
| 11/18/2008 | 4 | 0.75 | DISCUSS SOUTHERN UTE CASE AND RELATED ISSUES IN RE RAMAH APPEAL. | 1661 |
| 11/23/2008 | 4 | 4.50 | WORK ON BRIEF ON APPEAL FOR RAMAH CLASS. | 1662 |
| 11/24/2008 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON RAMAH APPEAL LEGAL ARGUMENTS. | 1663 |
| 11/25/2008 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON RAMAH APPEAL LEGAL ARGUMENTS. | 1664 |
| 11/26/2008 | 4 | 0.75 | WORK ON RELEASE DOCUMENT AND CONFERENCE CALLS RE SOUTHERN UTE CASE IMPACT ON RAMAH APPEAL AND STRATEGY/OPTIONS. | 1665 |
| 11/30/2008 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON APPEAL BRIEF. | 1666 |
| 12/01/2008 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON RAMAH BRIEF. | 1667 |
| 12/02/2008 | 4 | 3.50 | WORK ON RAMAH BRIEF ON APPEAL. | 1668 |
| 12/03/2008 | 4 | 5.50 | WORK ON APPEALS BRIEF IN RAMAH. | 1669 |
| 12/04/2008 | 4 | 4.50 | CONFERENCE CALLS ON RAMAH MEDIATION; DO MEDIATION CALL. | 1670 |
| 01/10/2009 | 4 | 3.25 | ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR CONGRESSIONAL MEETINGS ON RAMAH SETTLEMENT; WORK WITH MIKE GROSS; CALL TO LLOYD MILLER ON MEETING PREPARATION. | 1700 |
| 01/11/2009 | 4 | 2.50 | ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO WASHINGTON, D.C. ON RAMAH CLASS ACTION AND CSC FUNDING ISSUES (SHARED TIME). | 1679 |
| 01/12/2009 | 4 | 4.00 | STRATEGY SESSIONS/MEETINGS WITH VARIOUS | 1680 |

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|--|-------|
| | | | SENATORS/SENATE STAFF ON STRATEGY SESSIONS/MEETINGS WITH VARIOUS SENATORS/SENATE STAFF ON | |
| 01/13/2009 | 4 | 3.50 | STRATEGY SESSIONS/MEETINGS WITH VARIOUS SENATORS/SENATE STAFF ON SETTLING RAMAH CASE AND SECURING INCREASE IN CSC FUNDING. | 1681 |
| 01/14/2009 | 4 | 2.00 | STRATEGY SESSIONS/MEETINGS WITH VARIOUS SENATORS/SENATE STAFF ON SETTLING RAMAH CASE AND SECURING INCREASE IN CSC FUNDING. | 1682 |
| 01/14/2009 | 4 | 2.50 | ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM WASHINGTON, D.C. TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO (SHARED TIME). | 1684 |
| 01/15/2009 | 4 | 0.60 | FOLLOW-UP ON CSC FUNDING/RAMAH SETTLEMENT INITIATIVE. | 1687 |
| 01/23/2009 | 4 | 0.40 | FOLLOW-UP/REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO SALAZAR FROM TOM UDALL. | 1692 |
| 01/25/2009 | 4 | 0.40 | FURTHER WORK ON DRAFT POSITION PAPER. | 1693 |
| 01/26/2009 | 4 | 0.70 | FOLLOW-UP ON POSITION PAPER AND SALAZAR MEETING, ETC. | 1694 |
| 01/28/2009 | 4 | 0.70 | MEETING WITH JENETTE GYNAN IN RE UDALL LETTER AND REQUEST SALAZAR MEETING ON RAMAH CHAPTER. | 1696 |
| 01/28/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | MEETING WITH NCAI REPRESENTATIVES IN RE LOGISTICS FOR PSA-III TRAINING AND NCAI CONTRACTS. | 1697 |
| 01/29/2009 | 4 | 1.50 | REVIEW/FINALIZE POSITION PAPER FOR RAMAH MEDIATION. | 1698 |
| 01/30/2009 | 4 | 0.60 | FURTHER WORK ON AND CALLS ON RAMAH MEDIATION POSITION PAPER. | 1699 |
| 02/02/2009 | 4 | 0.75 | FOLLOW-UP ON NCAI TRAINING PROPOSAL, ISSUES AND OPTIONS. | 1702 |
| 02/05/2009 | 4 | 0.60 | FURTHER CALLS ON RAMAH CLASS CSC FUNDING AND SETTLEMENT EFFORT. | 1704 |
| 02/05/2009 | 18 | 0.50 | LEGAL RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS RE: 25 USC SEC. 450J-1 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY. | 1718 |
| 02/08/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | LEGAL RESEARCH IN RE 450J-1(G) AND 1988 AND 1994 AMENDMENTS IN RE 10TH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1707 |
| 2/23/2009 | 4 | 3.00 | DRAFT BRIEF TO TENTH CIRCUIT ON RAMAH APPEAL. | |
| 2/24/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | CONFERENCE CALL ON BRIEF AND MEDIATION | |
| 02/25/2009 | 4 | 1.50 | FURTHER WORK ON BRIEF | 1719 |
| 02/26/2009 | 4 | 2.90 | PREPARE FOR MEDIATION CONFERENCE CALL; DO MEDIATION CONFERENCE CALL AND FOLLOW-UP. | 1720 |
| 03/02/2009 | 4 | 2.50 | LEGAL ANALYSIS; DISCUSSIONS WITH MIKE GROSS AND DAN MACMEEKIN ON RAMAH APPEALS AND BRIEF. | 1724 |
| 03/10/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON APPROPRIATIONS ACT LANGUAGE. | 1728 |
| 03/28/2009 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1733 |
| 03/29/2009 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1734 |
| 04/05/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON REVISIONS TO PARTY ADMISSION PART OF TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1736 |
| 04/07/2009 | 4 | 0.75 | WORK ON RAMAH BRIEF TO TENTH CIRCUIT. | 1737 |
| 04/08/2009 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON RAMAH BRIEF TO TENTH CIRCUIT. | 1738 |
| 04/09/2009 | 4 | 0.50 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1741 |
| 04/17/2009 | 4 | 2.00 | REVIEW AND SUGGEST REVISIONS TO RAMAH TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1744 |
| 04/19/2009 | 4 | 2.25 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF FOR RAMAH. | 1746 |
| 04/20/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF AND RELATED CASE ISSUES. | 1747 |
| 04/21/2009 | 4 | 4.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1751 |
| 04/27/2009 | 4 | 1.70 | FOLLOW-UP ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1757 |
| 04/28/2009 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF WITH MIKE GROSS AND DAN | 1759 |

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|---|-------|
| | | | MACMEEKIN; FOLLOW-UP RESEARCH. | |
| 04/30/2009 | 4 | 2.00 | REVIEW/WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF; MEET WITH MIKE GROSS AND DAN MACMEEKIN. | 1760 |
| 04/30/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | REVIEW LLOYD MILLER TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF DRAFT AND FOLLOW-UP EMAIL. | 1761 |
| 05/01/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | FURTHER WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1762 |
| 05/01/2009 | 4 | 0.75 | FURTHER WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1766 |
| 05/04/2009 | 4 | 3.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF; GO OVER CHANGES WITH MIKE GROSS; REVIEW NEW TENTH CIRCUIT SOUTHERN UTE DECISION. | 1763 |
| 05/04/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | DO RECOMMENDED REVISIONS TO TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF IN RE SOUTHERN UTE DECISION. | 1767 |
| 05/05/2009 | 4 | 6.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1768 |
| 05/06/2009 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1769 |
| 05/07/2009 | 4 | 0.90 | FOLLOW-UP ON FILING OF TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1770 |
| 05/27/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | CONFER WITH AND CALL FROM PATTY MARX ON CAPS CAUSED IDC PROBLEMS FOR OGLALA. | 1779 |
| 06/12/2009 | 4 | 2.00 | LEGAL RESEARCH ON PARTY ADMISSION POINT IN TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1783 |
| 06/13/2009 | 4 | 0.70 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF. | 1784 |
| 06/15/2009 | 4 | 0.50 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF FOR TENTH CIRCUIT APPEAL. | 1785 |
| 06/16/2009 | 4 | 3.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT REPLY BRIEF. | 1786 |
| 06/18/2009 | 4 | 0.50 | FURTHER WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1787 |
| 06/21/2009 | 4 | 1.50 | LEGAL RESEARCH RE JUDGMENT FUND ARGUMENT IN APPELLEES' ANSWER BRIEF. | 1788 |
| 06/22/2009 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON SECTION 612 - REIMBURSEMENT ARGUMENT FOR REPLY BRIEF. | 1789 |
| 06/23/2009 | 4 | 1.30 | WORK ON RAMAH REPLY BRIEF. | 1790 |
| 06/29/2009 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON RAMAH REPLY BRIEF. | 1792 |
| 07/01/2009 | 4 | 2.50 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF. | 1795 |
| 07/03/2009 | 4 | 3.00 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF TO TENTH CIRCUIT. | 1797 |
| 07/05/2009 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF. | 1798 |
| 07/09/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF. | 1799 |
| 07/10/2009 | 4 | 4.50 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RAMAH TEAM. | 1800 |
| 07/11/2009 | 4 | 3.50 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RAMAH TEAM. | 1801 |
| 07/12/2009 | 4 | 0.75 | WORK ON REPLY BRIEF. | 1802 |
| 08/03/2009 | 4 | 0.60 | CONFERENCE CALL ON IDC RATE/STATUTORY CONSTRUCTION ISSUES; REDRAFT STATUTE. | 1807 |
| 10/12/2009 | 4 | 0.40 | DISCUSS ORAL ARGUMENT ISSUES WITH MIKE GROSS. | 1815 |
| 10/15/2009 | 4 | 1.00 | CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON PENDING APPEAL AND OTHER ISSUES. | 1817 |
| 10/29/2009 | 4 | 0.20 | WORK ON ORAL ARGUMENT MOOT COURT PANEL PACKAGE AND TRANSMITTAL FOR LEE BERGEN. | 1821 |
| 11/02/2009 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON RAMAH TENTH CIRCUIT ARGUMENT. | 1822 |
| 11/06/2009 | 4 | 2.80 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT ORAL ARGUMENT; PREPARE WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER. | 1823 |
| 11/09/2009 | 4 | 6.50 | LEGAL ANALYSIS; WORK ON ORAL ARGUMENT ISSUES/APPROPRIATIONS LANGUAGE/PRACTICE ARGUMENT WITH MIKE GROSS. | 1824 |
| 11/10/2009 | 4 | 4.50 | WORK ON BULLET POINTS AND REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR | 1825 |

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|--|-------|
| | | | ORAL ARGUMENT. | |
| 11/11/2009 | 4 | 11.00 | PREPARE WITH MIKE GROSS FOR ORAL ARGUMENT/MOOT COURT AND FOLLOW-UP. | 1826 |
| 11/12/2009 | 4 | 0.70 | WORK ON ORAL ARGUMENT REDRAFT. | 1827 |
| 11/12/2009 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON ORAL ARGUMENT; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS. | 1828 |
| 11/13/2009 | 4 | 5.00 | TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO DENVER, COLORADO (MONACO HOTEL) FOR ORAL ARGUMENT. | 1829 |
| 11/13/2009 | 4 | 3.00 | PREPARATION; WORK WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON ORAL ARGUMENT PREPARATION. | 1830 |
| 11/13/2009 | 4 | 4.50 | WORK ON ORAL ARGUMENT; ANALYSIS OF ISSUES. | 1834 |
| 11/14/2009 | 4 | 8.00 | WORK WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON ORAL ARGUMENT PREPARATION. | 1831 |
| 11/15/2009 | 4 | 8.00 | WORK WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON ORAL ARGUMENT PREPARATION. | 1832 |
| 11/16/2009 | 4 | 12.00 | WORK WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON ORAL ARGUMENT PREPARATION; ATTEND ORAL ARGUMENT; TRAVEL FROM DENVER, CO. TO SANTA FE, NM. | 1833 |
| 06/21/2010 | 4 | 1.00 | REVIEW MIKE GROSS' EMAILS/ ANALYSIS ON SECTION 1(b)(4) AMBIGUITY AND LEGISLATIVE HISTORY; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS; RESPOND. | 1875 |
| 06/23/2010 | 4 | 1.50 | ANALYZE/CONSIDER RULE 28(J) LETTER TO INTERIOR AND SUGGEST REVISIONS; DO CONFERENCE CALL. | 1876 |
| 12/15/2010 | 4 | 2.40 | INITIAL ANALYSIS OF ARCTIC SLOPE DECISION IN RE EFFECT ON RAMAH TENTH CIRCUIT CASE. | 1900 |
| 12/16/2010 | 4 | 0.90 | CONFERENCE CALL ON RULE 28(J) LETTER AND FOLLOW-UP. | 1901 |
| 12/17/2010 | 4 | 2.50 | WORK ON RULE 28(J) LETTER. | 1902 |
| 12/20/2010 | 4 | 4.50 | WORK ON RULE 28(J) LETTER. | 1903 |
| 12/22/2010 | 4 | 0.50 | FOLLOW-UP ON COURT'S SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEFING ORDER ON ANSA. | 1904 |
| 12/30/2010 | 4 | 0.50 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF ON ANSA. | 1905 |
| 01/05/2011 | 4 | 0.90 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1906 |
| 01/07/2011 | 4 | 0.30 | DISCUSS LLOYD MILLER'S BRIEF REDRAFT WITH MIKE GROSS. | 1910 |
| 01/08/2011 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT RESPONSE BRIEF. | 1911 |
| 01/12/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1907 |
| 01/12/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | REVIEW AND ANALYZE MIKE'S AND LLOYD'S LAST RAMAH SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF VERSIONS. | 1920 |
| 01/15/2011 | 4 | 1.50 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1908 |
| 01/18/2011 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1912 |
| 01/19/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1914 |
| 01/20/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF. | 1915 |
| 01/21/2011 | 4 | 2.00 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS. | 1916 |
| 01/21/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON RAMAH SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF. | 1917 |
| 01/23/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | WORK ON RAMAH SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF. | 1918 |
| 01/25/2011 | 4 | 0.90 | WORK ON TENTH CIRCUIT BRIEF; READ GOVERNMENT'S BRIEF. | 1919 |
| 05/09/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Initial review and analysis of Tenth Cir. decision; discuss with Mike Gross. | 1923 |
| 05/10/2011 | 4 | 2.00 | Further review and analysis of Tenth Cir. decision. | 1924 |
| 05/16/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Prepare for telecon on next steps/strategy re remand. | 1925 |
| 05/18/2011 | 4 | 2.00 | Prepare for and do conference call on Ramah class issues re Tenth Cir. ruling. | 1926 |
| 05/18/2011 | 4 | 4.00 | Legal research on potential post remand issues. | 1927 |
| 05/19/2011 | 4 | 2.50 | Work on final report to the court on equitable relief, etc. | 1928 |

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|--|-------|
| 05/20/2011 | 4 | 2.00 | Work on final report to court and research on equitable tolling issues. | 1929 |
| 05/23/2011 | 4 | 0.75 | Research on equitable tolling issues. | 1930 |
| 05/23/2011 | 4 | 0.70 | Work on memo/legal research on equitable tolling issues. | 1931 |
| 05/24/2011 | 4 | 0.60 | Work on summary memo in re equitable tolling. | 1932 |
| 05/25/2011 | 4 | 2.00 | Analyze and do memo on legal issues re post-remand proceedings and draft final report to court on equitable relief. | 1933 |
| 05/26/2011 | 4 | 1.50 | Further legal analysis/research on class action legal issues post-Tenth Circuit ruling. | 1934 |
| 05/27/2011 | 4 | 2.50 | Followup emails/discussions/telecon/research on post-Tenth Circuit proceedings and issues and revisions to final report to court. | 1935 |
| 05/28/2011 | 4 | 1.50 | Research on CDA interest rates/SF percentage, etc./more work on final report to the court. | 1936 |
| 05/31/2011 | 4 | 0.40 | Further work on/followup on verifying SF percentage date for FYs 2004-2011; revise and forward SF report. | 1937 |
| 06/01/2011 | 4 | 0.50 | Followup on damage calculation and sf percentages. | 1938 |
| 06/08/2011 | 4 | 0.60 | Review documents on government response in RNSB suit. | 1939 |
| 06/10/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Further research and analysis in re equitable tolling issues. | 1941 |
| 06/18/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Further work on final status report to court. | 1942 |
| 06/20/2011 | 4 | 0.50 | Work on RNC claim issues and final report submissions. | 1943 |
| 06/20/2011 | 4 | 0.70 | Follow up on cost affidavits and damage calculations. | 1944 |
| 06/21/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Follow up on draft final report and settlement issues and equitable relief issues. | 1945 |
| 06/23/2011 | 4 | 0.70 | Follow up work on final report draft; call and email with Mike Gross, etc. | 1946 |
| 06/24/2011 | 4 | 0.60 | Follow up calls/emails on government's motion for rehearing and our response issues/options. | 1947 |
| 06/29/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Review of key 2011 distributions of new CSC money based on increased CSC appropriation and work on final report to the court. | 1948 |
| 07/11/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Work on Ramah response brief on DOJ rehearing petition. | 1949 |
| 07/13/2011 | 4 | 3.00 | Work on response to petition for rehearing. | 1950 |
| 07/14/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Work on response brief to Tenth Circuit. | 1951 |
| 07/15/2011 | 4 | 3.00 | Work on response to government petition for rehearing. | 1952 |
| 07/18/2011 | 4 | 0.50 | Final work on response to rehearing petition. | 1953 |
| 08/01/2011 | 4 | 0.60 | Followup on 10th Circuit's denial of petition for rehearing and rehearing en banc; meet with Mike Gross; calls. | 1954 |
| 08/03/2011 | 4 | 0.50 | Work on motion for additional attorney fees and costs. | 1955 |
| 08/09/2011 | 4 | 1.50 | Work on CDA/claims issues and options; planning re post-mandate issues. | 1956 |
| 08/23/2011 | 4 | 2.25 | Work on final report to the court and motion for fees and costs. | 1957 |
| 08/31/2011 | 4 | 0.50 | Legal research in re certiorari petition issues. | 1958 |
| 09/13/2011 | 4 | 0.70 | Discussion with Mike Gross and later with Lloyd Miller on discussions with DOJ re Ramah case settlement possibilities. | 1964 |
| 09/15/2011 | 4 | 0.60 | Conference call with Mike Gross and Lloyd Miller on developments in Ramah case cert and ASNA. | 1962 |
| 09/19/2011 | 4 | 3.50 | Further work on final report to the Court and cost/fee applications. | 1959 |
| 09/20/2011 | 4 | 1.40 | Follow-up with Lloyd Miller and Mike Gross; circulate to government counsel cost/fee application and final report draft, email and revise and finalize to circulate to government counsel. | 1960 |
| 09/23/2011 | 4 | 1.50 | Calls to U.S. Attorney on final report and cost applications; conference call to prepare for status conference; update other counsel on Ramah case status; call to Jim Todd on status report and cost application. | 1961 |
| 09/25/2011 | 4 | 0.40 | Do Ramah class status conference with U.S. Magistrate. | 1966 |

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|--|-------|
| 09/26/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Followup calls on Ramah cost fee applications/do status conference with Magistrate and followup with Lloyd and Mike. | 1965 |
| 09/27/2011 | 4 | 2.00 | Work on revised cost applications and new separate fee application for Mike Gross. | 1967 |
| 09/28/2011 | 4 | 0.50 | Followup on filing (and get filed) Ramah cost applications. | 1968 |
| 09/29/2011 | 4 | 0.30 | Followup on filings/cost applications. | 1969 |
| 10/19/2011 | 4 | 0.70 | Go to federal courthouse; meet with court clerk on orders taxing costs. | 1970 |
| 10/20/2011 | 4 | 0.40 | Followup with Mike Gross and Judge Hansen's chambers re vacating orders taxing costs. | 1971 |
| 10/24/2011 | 4 | 0.75 | Analyze government's motion for extension of time on certiorari. | 1972 |
| 10/25/2011 | 4 | 0.50 | Further analysis re U.S. Supreme Court certiorari options. | 1973 |
| 11/01/2011 | 4 | 3.00 | Initial review of governments ANSA opposition to cert. and cert. petition in Ramah case. | 1974 |
| 11/03/2011 | 4 | 0.60 | Further work on analysis of cert. petition, etc. | 1975 |
| 11/09/2011 | 4 | 0.60 | Further analysis in re cert. petition. | 1976 |
| 11/10/2011 | 4 | 0.70 | Further notes/analysis on Ramah cert. pet. | 1977 |
| 11/14/2011 | 4 | 0.70 | Review Dan's initial draft cert response and notes. | 1978 |
| 11/16/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Work on legal agreement for cert. app. | 1979 |
| 11/17/2011 | 4 | 0.40 | Calls from Mike and followup on scheduling and extension on cert. pet. response. | 1980 |
| 11/26/2011 | 4 | 1.50 | Discuss cert. response strategy with Mike Gross; further analysis of cert petition and response issues. | 1981 |
| 11/27/2011 | 4 | 4.50 | Work on cert. opposition brief to U.S. Supreme Court. | 1982 |
| 11/28/2011 | 4 | 1.50 | More work on cert. opposition brief to U.S. Supreme Court. | 1983 |
| 11/30/2011 | 4 | 1.50 | Followup work on Ramah class action cert. oppo./conference calls. | 1984 |
| 12/03/2011 | 4 | 3.50 | Work on opposition to cert. | 1986 |
| 12/04/2011 | 4 | 4.20 | Work on opposition to cert. | 1987 |
| 12/04/2011 | 4 | 5.50 | Further work on Ramah cert. opposition brief. | 1988 |
| 12/05/2011 | 4 | 5.50 | Further work on Ramah cert. opposition brief. | 1989 |
| 12/06/2011 | 4 | 2.00 | Work on Opposition to Cert. | 1990 |
| 12/06/2011 | 4 | 5.00 | Work on cert. petition opposition; review and analysis; conference calls and revisions. | 1991 |
| 12/07/2011 | 4 | 3.50 | Work on cert. petition opposition; review and analysis; conference calls and revisions. | 1992 |
| 12/08/2011 | 4 | 1.00 | Conference call on final cert. opposition submission. | 1993 |
| 12/14/2011 | 4 | 0.75 | Work on proof of filing certification oppo and locating oppo in S.Ct. Clerk's office per S.G.'s email and followup. | 1994 |
| 12/15/2011 | 4 | 0.70 | Review/analysis of government's response to our cert. opposition. | 1995 |
| 12/15/2011 | 4 | 0.70 | review/analysis of government response to our cert. opposition. | 2068 |
| 12/22/2011 | 4 | 0.50 | Review/analyze Southern Ute cert. petition filed by DOJ bearing on Ramah case cert. petition. | 1996 |
| 12/22/2011 | 4 | 0.50 | Review/analyze Southern Ute cert. pet. filed by DOJ for bearing on government's Ramah case cert. petition. | 2069 |
| 01/06/2012 | 4 | 1.50 | Conference calls on briefing strategy and amicus options re grant of cert. petition in Ramah. | 1997 |
| 01/13/2012 | 4 | 1.25 | Prepare for and do conference call on NCAI amicus brief in Ramah class supreme court case. | 1998 |
| 01/13/2012 | 4 | 2.00 | Conference call on consult with Carter Phillips in re rule on Ramah case supreme court brief. | 1999 |
| 01/18/2012 | 4 | 0.50 | Work on BIA CSC damage calculation. | 2000 |
| 01/18/2012 | 4 | 0.50 | Further work on damage calculations. | 2001 |
| 01/19/2012 | 4 | 0.50 | Followup work on damage calculations. | 2002 |
| 01/20/2012 | 4 | 0.70 | Followup on damage calculations for settlement and Carter Phillips | 2003 |

CAP YEAR
9/30/2002 - 6/17/2012

| Trans Date | Tmkr | Hours to Bill | Description | Ref # |
|------------|------|---------------|---|-------|
| 01/27/2012 | 4 | 3.00 | arrangements re Ramah class claims; conference calls on same. Conference call and drafting; work on Sidley fee agreement and class counsel fee split agreement. | 2005 |
| 01/29/2012 | 4 | 2.00 | Discussions, analysis and conference call on engagement letter for Sidley firm and fee/cost issues. | 2004 |
| 02/01/2012 | 4 | 0.40 | Discuss Ramah class issues with MPG. | 2006 |
| 02/04/2012 | 4 | 2.00 | Work on joint appendix for U.S. Supreme Court. | 2007 |
| 02/07/2012 | 4 | 1.00 | Review draft of joint appendix information; call Mike Gross; followup emails. | 2008 |
| 02/09/2012 | 4 | 2.25 | Work on joint appendix designation issues with self-governance office. | 2009 |
| 02/13/2012 | 4 | 0.50 | Work on arguments/analysis in re U.S. Supreme Court answer brief. | 2010 |
| 02/15/2012 | 4 | 0.40 | Work on joint appendix issues. | 2011 |
| 02/17/2012 | 4 | 1.00 | Read and analyze government's opening Supreme Court brief. | 2012 |
| 02/19/2012 | 4 | 5.00 | Set out initial reactions and analysis of government's brief; email to team. | 2013 |
| 02/20/2012 | 4 | 1.00 | Meet with Mike Gross to discuss Ramah brief issues/options. | 2014 |
| 02/20/2012 | 4 | 2.00 | More analysis on Ramah class brief, etc.; email to team. | 2015 |
| 02/21/2012 | 4 | 1.00 | Further work on analyzing government's brief. | 2016 |
| 02/22/2012 | 4 | 4.50 | Meetings/conference call/emails/analysis, etc. on Ramah Supreme Court brief. | 2017 |
| 02/24/2012 | 4 | 0.60 | Work on judgment fund payments re Ramah brief. | 2018 |
| 02/27/2012 | 4 | 1.80 | Followup work on Ramah answer brief arguments and options. | 2019 |
| 02/28/2012 | 4 | 1.20 | Further work on Ramah brief issues and arguments/discuss with Mike Gross; conference call with Lloyd Miller and Mike Gross. | 2020 |
| 02/29/2012 | 4 | 1.20 | Research on AFA-CSC clause variations in Bla '638 contracts. | 2021 |
| 03/06/2012 | 4 | 5.50 | Work on responsive brief to U.S. Supreme Court. | 2023 |
| 03/08/2012 | 4 | 0.60 | Work on arguments re response brief to Supreme Court. | 2024 |
| 03/12/2012 | 4 | 0.30 | Followup with Mike Gross on status of U. S. Supreme Court brief. | 2025 |
| 03/13/2012 | 4 | 1.50 | Analysis/work on RNC brief in U.S. Supreme Court. | 2026 |
| 03/14/2012 | 4 | 5.50 | Followup on Ramah Supreme Court case briefing schedule/expedited briefing; review Lloyd Miller's edits/comments on latest draft brief then discuss with Mike Gross. | 2029 |
| 03/15/2012 | 4 | 5.00 | Work on response brief to U.S. Supreme Court; conference calls, etc. | 2028 |
| 03/22/2012 | 4 | 4.50 | Review/analyze draft amicus briefs and identify concerns; conference calls. | 2031 |
| 04/13/2012 | 4 | 1.00 | Prepare for work with Carter Phillips on oral argument. | 2032 |
| 04/16/2012 | 4 | 4.00 | Work with Sidley firm on oral argument preparation for Carter Phillips. | 2035 |
| 04/17/2012 | 4 | 2.00 | Further analysis of core arguments. | 2033 |
| 04/18/2012 | 4 | 13.00 | Prepare for/go to oral argument in Ramah class action/post argument meetings and analysis and travel back to New Mexico. | 2034 |
| 05/04/2012 | 18 | 1.20 | Legal research and analysis for Michael Gross re: awards and damages on Navajo Nation. | 2037 |

 580.90
