

**Affidavit of Class Counsel Michael P. Gross
In Support of Application for Attorney's Fees and Costs
and Final Settlement Agreement**

Exhibit G

**Sidley Austin, LLP
Record of Services Performed on "CAPS" Issue**

SIOLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al.

TIME DETAIL

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-------------|--|-------|
| 01/16/12 | JF Cohn | Emails with C. Phillips regarding arguments in brief | .25 |
| 01/16/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for meeting and meet with M. Gross | 1.75 |
| 01/17/12 | JF Cohn | Confcr with M. Krueger regarding brief | .25 |
| 01/17/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare letter to co-counsel | .25 |
| 01/21/12 | CG Phillips | Review briefs from L. Miller | 1.00 |
| 01/23/12 | CG Phillips | Review materials from co-counsel | 1.25 |
| 01/28/12 | CG Phillips | Review materials from M. Gross, L. Miller | 1.50 |
| 01/29/12 | CG Phillips | Review district court and court of appeals materials | 2.00 |
| 01/30/12 | JF Cohn | Review draft merits brief | 1.00 |
| 01/31/12 | CG Phillips | Review lower court papers and joint appendix | 1.50 |
| 02/01/12 | JF Cohn | Emails with co-counsel regarding case | .25 |
| 02/01/12 | CG Phillips | Read lower court papers | 2.50 |
| 02/02/12 | CG Phillips | Telephone conference with M. Gross; review JA designations | .75 |
| 02/03/12 | CG Phillips | Review joint appendix designation | .75 |
| 02/04/12 | CG Phillips | Review joint appendix materials | .50 |
| 02/05/12 | CG Phillips | Review materials from M. Gross | .75 |
| 02/06/12 | JF Cohn | Meet with L. Miller and D. Simon regarding background; confer with M. Krueger regarding brief/strategy; email schedule regarding brief | 2.75 |
| 02/06/12 | MD Krueger | Meeting with J. Cohn, C. Phillips, L. Miller regarding case strategy in Ramah | 1.50 |
| 02/06/12 | MD Krueger | Prepare for meeting with C. Phillips, J. Cohn, L. Miller | .25 |
| 02/06/12 | CG Phillips | Review materials from M. Gross; prepare for and meet with L. Miller, D. Simon | 3.50 |
| 02/07/12 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding brief, amicus search | .50 |
| 02/07/12 | MD Krueger | Prepare for meeting with C. Phillips, J. Cohn, L. Miller | .50 |
| 02/07/12 | CG Phillips | Review Tenth Circuit joint appendix materials; read lower court briefs; emails regarding joint appendix | 2.00 |
| 02/08/12 | JF Cohn | Revise amicus letter, review court of appeals briefs and outline supreme court brief | 4.75 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-------------|---|-------|
| 02/08/12 | MD Krueger | Gather materials to send to potential amicus | .25 |
| 02/08/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn, J. Fougere regarding strategy for brief | .50 |
| 02/08/12 | MD Krueger | Review case materials | 1.75 |
| 02/09/12 | CA Bates | Meet with M. Krueger to receive case overview | .50 |
| 02/09/12 | CA Bates | Collect briefing materials | .25 |
| 02/09/12 | JF Cohn | Amicus outreach regarding chamber; outline supreme court brief | 8.00 |
| 02/09/12 | MD Krueger | Review case materials and draft outline of brief | 3.25 |
| 02/09/12 | MD Krueger | Meetings with J. Cohn, C. Bates regarding briefing strategy | 1.00 |
| 02/09/12 | CG Phillips | Review materials from M. Gross; emails with M. Gross regarding brief; emails with L. Miller | .75 |
| 02/10/12 | CA Bates | Review background materials | .75 |
| 02/10/12 | JF Cohn | Revise outline to supreme court brief; emails with co-counsel | 2.25 |
| 02/10/12 | MD Krueger | Revise statement of the case | 1.25 |
| 02/10/12 | MD Krueger | Review case materials and draft outline of brief | 4.50 |
| 02/10/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with J. Cohn regarding briefing strategy | .50 |
| 02/10/12 | CG Phillips | Revised amicus solicitation letter to R. Conrad; emails with L. Miller; review Tenth Circuit appendix materials | 2.00 |
| 02/11/12 | CA Bates | Review lower-court briefs and opinions, relevant statutes, and cert-stage briefs in ASNA | 6.25 |
| 02/11/12 | CG Phillips | Read joint appendix materials | 2.00 |
| 02/12/12 | CA Bates | Review lower-court briefs and opinions, relevant statutes, and cert-stage briefs in Ramah | 6.75 |
| 02/13/12 | CA Bates | Review draft outline of brief | .25 |
| 02/13/12 | CA Bates | Meet with M. Krueger to discuss research topics | .50 |
| 02/13/12 | CA Bates | Research case law on illusory contracts | 2.00 |
| 02/13/12 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding research | .25 |
| 02/13/12 | MD Krueger | Review legislative history of appropriations act | .75 |
| 02/13/12 | MD Krueger | Meeting with C. Bates regarding research projects for brief | .50 |
| 02/13/12 | CG Phillips | Review joint appendix materials; review outline, outline argument points | 1.50 |
| 02/14/12 | CA Bates | Research case law on illusory contracts | 3.75 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-------------|---|-------|
| 02/14/12 | CA Bates | Draft language for brief re: illusory contracts | 1.25 |
| 02/15/12 | CA Bates | Draft language for brief re: illusory promises | .50 |
| 02/15/12 | CA Bates | Create digest of contract support cost appropriations provisions with statutory caps | 1.25 |
| 02/15/12 | CA Bates | Research case law on illusory promises | .50 |
| 02/15/12 | CA Bates | Research statutory history of contract support cost appropriations caps | 5.75 |
| 02/15/12 | JF Cohn | Review joint appendix and emails regarding same | .75 |
| 02/15/12 | CG Phillips | Review joint appendix materials; outline briefing arguments; emails with co-counsel | 2.00 |
| 02/16/12 | CA Bates | Research statutory history of contract support cost appropriations caps | .50 |
| 02/16/12 | CA Bates | Review briefs and Federal Register to determine when tribes learned of appropriations shortfalls | 1.75 |
| 02/16/12 | CA Bates | Research case law on notice of breach | 1.25 |
| 02/16/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with M. Krueger re: assignment follow-up | .25 |
| 02/16/12 | JF Cohn | Call with chamber of commerce, emails regarding notice issue and research, confer with M. Krueger regarding same | .75 |
| 02/16/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with L. Miller regarding respondent's brief and legislative history | .75 |
| 02/16/12 | MD Krueger | Review C. Bates research regarding appropriations language | .25 |
| 02/16/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn, C. Bates regarding researching notice issue | .50 |
| 02/16/12 | CG Phillips | Research and draft responsive brief; review joint appendix materials; conference call with Chamber of Commerce regarding amicus solicitation; emails with J. Cohn | 2.00 |
| 02/17/12 | CA Bates | Draft language for brief re: contract repudiation | 1.00 |
| 02/17/12 | CA Bates | Research case law on contract repudiation | 5.75 |
| 02/17/12 | JF Cohn | Review government brief and confer with co-counsel | 2.25 |
| 02/17/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with C. Bates regarding appropriations legislative history | .25 |
| 02/17/12 | MD Krueger | Draft statement of case for respondents' brief | 2.50 |
| 02/17/12 | MD Krueger | Review government's opening brief | 1.75 |
| 02/17/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences and emails with J. Cohn, L. Miller regarding government's brief | .50 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-----------------|--|-------|
| 02/17/12 | CG Phillips | Read United States' brief; emails regarding Chamber amicus issue | 2.00 |
| 02/18/12 | CA Bates | Review opening brief | 1.25 |
| 02/18/12 | CA Bates | Research legislative history of statutory appropriations caps | 2.75 |
| 02/19/12 | CA Bates | Research legislative history of statutory appropriations caps | .50 |
| 02/19/12 | CG Phillips | Study U.S. brief; emails with co-counsel | 2.00 |
| 02/20/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with M. Kruger re: apparent authority | .25 |
| 02/20/12 | CA Bates | Compile and review legislative history of contract support cost appropriations caps | 4.75 |
| 02/20/12 | JF Cohn | Review government brief and confer with M. Krueger; strategize regarding opposition brief | 4.25 |
| 02/20/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn regarding government's brief and strategy | .50 |
| 02/20/12 | MD Krueger | Review government's brief and cases relied upon therein | 1.75 |
| 02/20/12 | MD Krueger | Review C. Bates' research on repudiation and telephone conference with C. Bates regarding research | .50 |
| 02/20/12 | CG Phillips | Study government brief; outline argument points; review co-counsel emails regarding argument issues | 1.50 |
| 02/21/12 | CA Bates | Meet with J. Cohn and M. Krueger re: drafting brief | .75 |
| 02/21/12 | CA Bates | Meet with M. Krueger re: drafting brief | .25 |
| 02/21/12 | CA Bates | Compile and review legislative history of contact support cost appropriations caps | 1.25 |
| 02/21/12 | CA Bates | Review legislative history of Indian Self-Determination Act | 2.75 |
| 02/21/12 | JF Cohn | Review draft brief; revise outline; confer with M. Krueger and C. Bates; email and call with co-counsel regarding brief and research | 4.50 |
| 02/21/12 | MD Krueger | Meetings with J. Cohn, C. Bates regarding respondent's brief | 1.00 |
| 02/21/12 | MD Krueger | Draft respondents' brief | 1.50 |
| 02/21/12 | MD Krueger | Review draft brief from L. Miller and outline respondent's brief | 2.75 |
| 02/21/12 | MD Krueger | Meeting with H. Stanislawski regarding government contracting law | 1.00 |
| 02/21/12 | CG Phillips | Review U.S. brief; review L. Miller draft; review emails from M. Gross; emails with J. Cohn, M. Krueger; emails with H. Stanislawski | 1.50 |
| 02/21/12 | HJ Stanislawski | Review e-mail and related materials received from M. Krueger; | 1.50 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-----------------|---|-------|
| | | discussion with M. Krueger regarding indirect cost issues | |
| 02/22/12 | CA Bates | Review legislative and statutory history of Indian Self-Determination Act | 2.25 |
| 02/22/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with M. Krueger re: drafting brief | .50 |
| 02/22/12 | JF Cohn | Call with co-counsel regarding brief; review research | 2.25 |
| 02/22/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with C. Bates regarding respondents' brief | .50 |
| 02/22/12 | MD Krueger | Review government's brief and cases relied upon therein | .75 |
| 02/22/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with C. Phillips and co-counsel regarding respondents' brief | .50 |
| 02/22/12 | MD Krueger | Review legislative history | 1.50 |
| 02/22/12 | MD Krueger | Research case law regarding Ferris rule | 1.00 |
| 02/22/12 | MD Krueger | Draft statement of case in respondents' brief | 6.25 |
| 02/22/12 | CG Phillips | Read draft briefs; revise; emails regarding argument points, conference call with co-counsel | 4.00 |
| 02/22/12 | HJ Stanislawski | E-mail to team regarding payment of indirect costs | .25 |
| 02/23/12 | CA Bates | Review draft of brief from L. Miller | .75 |
| 02/23/12 | CA Bates | Research case law on applicability of traditional contract principles to government contracts | .75 |
| 02/23/12 | CA Bates | Draft sections I A and B of argument section of brief | 3.00 |
| 02/23/12 | CA Bates | Review text and legislative history of ISDA | 1.00 |
| 02/23/12 | JF Cohn | Review emails and research regarding Supreme Court brief | 2.25 |
| 02/23/12 | MD Krueger | Review legislative history of ISDA and appropriations act | 2.25 |
| 02/23/12 | MD Krueger | Draft respondent's brief | 7.75 |
| 02/23/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with L. Miller regarding ISDA | .50 |
| 02/23/12 | CG Phillips | Read materials from M. Gross; outline argument points | 1.00 |
| 02/23/12 | HJ Stanislawski | Review Nash & Cibinic regarding Ferris; discussion with M. Krueger regarding source materials | .50 |
| 02/24/12 | CA Bates | Draft section I.C of argument section of brief | 4.50 |
| 02/24/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with M. Krueger re: tribal contracts | .25 |
| 02/24/12 | CA Bates | Read tribal contracts | .75 |
| 02/24/12 | CA Bates | Review ISDA legislative history | .25 |
| 02/24/12 | JF Cohn | Review research, statute, contracts | 5.00 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-------------|---|-------|
| 02/24/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences and meetings with J. Cohn regarding record issues | .50 |
| 02/24/12 | MD Krueger | Draft respondent's brief | 7.50 |
| 02/24/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with C. Bates regarding respondent's brief | .25 |
| 02/24/12 | CG Phillips | Emails regarding briefing issues; research | 2.50 |
| 02/25/12 | CA Bates | Draft section I.D of argument section of brief | 7.25 |
| 02/25/12 | CA Bates | Research application of Ferris v. United States | 1.50 |
| 02/25/12 | CA Bates | Revise section I of argument section of brief | 1.00 |
| 02/25/12 | CA Bates | Review GAO Redbook | .50 |
| 02/25/12 | JF Cohn | Call with M. Krueger regarding brief | .25 |
| 02/25/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn, L. Miller regarding respondent's brief | .50 |
| 02/25/12 | MD Krueger | Draft respondent's brief | 8.25 |
| 02/25/12 | MD Krueger | Research case law regarding repeals by implication, legislative history | 1.50 |
| 02/26/12 | MD Krueger | Draft respondent's brief | 8.75 |
| 02/27/12 | CA Bates | Research case law on the Ferris doctrine | .75 |
| 02/27/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with M. Krueger re: draft brief | .25 |
| 02/27/12 | CA Bates | Draft section I of argument section of brief | 6.00 |
| 02/27/12 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding brief | .75 |
| 02/27/12 | MD Krueger | Draft respondent's brief | 7.50 |
| 02/27/12 | MD Krueger | Review and revise draft argument of part I in respondents' brief | 1.25 |
| 02/27/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference and emails with J. Cohn, C. Bates regarding respondents' brief | .50 |
| 02/27/12 | MD Krueger | Research case law regarding actual authority and Indian law canons of construction | 1.25 |
| 02/27/12 | MD Krueger | Analyze cases cited in governments' brief | 1.75 |
| 02/27/12 | CG Phillips | Review argument materials | 1.25 |
| 02/28/12 | CA Bates | Review draft of brief, send edits to M. Krueger | 4.25 |
| 02/28/12 | CA Bates | Proofread draft of brief; send edits to M. Krueger | 2.00 |
| 02/28/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with M. Krueger to discuss draft of brief | .25 |
| 02/28/12 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding brief; call with M. Krueger regarding brief; | 2.00 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-------------|--|-------|
| | | review draft amicus brief | |
| 02/28/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief | 9.75 |
| 02/28/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn, C. Bates regarding respondents' brief | .50 |
| 02/28/12 | CG Phillips | Emails with co-counsel | .50 |
| 02/29/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief | 11.50 |
| 02/29/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief | 3.75 |
| 02/29/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn re: respondents' brief | .75 |
| 03/01/12 | CA Bates | Edit Part I of argument section of brief | 2.50 |
| 03/01/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with J. Cohn and M. Krueger re: draft of brief | .25 |
| 03/01/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief; amicus search | 4.00 |
| 03/01/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn, C. Bates regarding respondents' brief | .75 |
| 03/01/12 | MD Krueger | Research case law regarding Judgment Fund and interpretive canons | 1.50 |
| 03/01/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief | 7.25 |
| 03/01/12 | CG Phillips | Emails regarding merits issues | .75 |
| 03/02/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with M. Krueger to discuss research assignment | .25 |
| 03/02/12 | CA Bates | Research case law applying the Ferris doctrine | 3.50 |
| 03/02/12 | CA Bates | Draft language for brief on the Ferris doctrine | .50 |
| 03/02/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief | 11.50 |
| 03/02/12 | MD Krueger | Meetings and telephone conferences with J. Cohn, C. Bates regarding respondents' brief | 1.25 |
| 03/02/12 | MD Krueger | Draft summary of argument for respondents' brief | 3.25 |
| 03/02/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief | 4.00 |
| 03/02/12 | CG Phillips | Review and revise outline and argument points; emails with L. Miller | .75 |
| 03/03/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief | 3.75 |
| 03/03/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief | .50 |
| 03/03/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with J. Cohn regarding respondents' brief | .25 |
| 03/03/12 | CG Phillips | Review and revise draft; emails with M. Gross, J. Cohn | 1.25 |
| 03/05/12 | JF Cohn | Calls and email regarding brief; review comments to brief | .50 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-----------------|---|-------|
| 03/05/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with J. Cohn regarding respondents' brief | .25 |
| 03/05/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief to incorporate C. Phillip's comments | .50 |
| 03/05/12 | MD Krueger | Review co-counsel's comments on respondents' brief | .50 |
| 03/05/12 | CG Phillips | Review and revise draft brief | 2.00 |
| 03/06/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with M. Krueger re: statutory research | .50 |
| 03/06/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief | 2.75 |
| 03/06/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn, co-counsel regarding respondents' brief | 1.50 |
| 03/06/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with C. Bates regarding researching statutes for respondents' brief | .25 |
| 03/06/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief | .75 |
| 03/06/12 | CG Phillips | Review and revise brief; emails with M. Gross, L. Miller, J. Cohn | 1.75 |
| 03/07/12 | CA Bates | Research statutes tying contract amounts to appropriations | 3.50 |
| 03/07/12 | JF Cohn | Review comments to brief; amicus outreach; emails regarding research, brief; review research; meet with L. Miller regarding brief | 3.75 |
| 03/07/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief | 5.50 |
| 03/07/12 | HJ Stanislawski | Discussion with M. Krueger regarding appropriations and A-87 questions | .50 |
| 03/08/12 | CA Bates | Research statutes tying contract amounts to appropriations | .25 |
| 03/08/12 | CA Bates | Research sources defining indirect costs | .75 |
| 03/08/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief | 9.50 |
| 03/08/12 | MD Krueger | Review and revise respondents' brief | 1.25 |
| 03/08/12 | CG Phillips | Emails with co-counsel; review revised draft | 1.25 |
| 03/09/12 | CA Bates | Obtain record for United States v. Jones | .25 |
| 03/09/12 | JF Cohn | Revise brief, review research | 7.50 |
| 03/09/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences and emails with J. Cohn regarding distinguishing government's cases in respondents' brief | .50 |
| 03/09/12 | CG Phillips | Review and revise draft brief; emails with L. Miller; telephone conference with L. Miller; office conference with J. Cohn | 2.25 |
| 03/10/12 | MD Krueger | Circulate draft brief to counsel for potential amici | .25 |
| 03/11/12 | MD Krueger | Emails with J. Cohn, L. Miller regarding respondents' brief | .50 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-----------------|---|-------|
| 03/11/12 | MD Krueger | Review government's brief and revise respondents' brief | 3.00 |
| 03/12/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief | 5.50 |
| 03/12/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with J. Cohn regarding revising respondents' brief | .50 |
| 03/12/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief | 2.50 |
| 03/12/12 | CG Phillips | Review and revise draft brief | 1.50 |
| 03/13/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief | 7.75 |
| 03/13/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn regarding revisions to respondents' brief | 1.00 |
| 03/13/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief regarding contract authority and Cherokee, and circulate revised brief to co-counsel with cover email | 1.75 |
| 03/13/12 | CG Phillips | Review and revise draft brief | 2.00 |
| 03/13/12 | HJ Stanislawski | Discussion with M. Krueger regarding use of "an amount" and "eligible for" formulations in ISDA provision in question; review related materials | .25 |
| 03/14/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief; review research | 4.50 |
| 03/14/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn regarding S.A. Healy and Leavell cases | .50 |
| 03/14/12 | MD Krueger | Review arguments regarding S.A. Healy and Leavell in respondents' brief | .50 |
| 03/14/12 | CG Phillips | Review proposed revisions and revised draft | .75 |
| 03/15/12 | CA Bates | Proofread brief | 1.25 |
| 03/15/12 | CA Bates | Enter cite-check edits for brief | 2.50 |
| 03/15/12 | CA Bates | Review cite-check edits with M. Krueger | .50 |
| 03/15/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief | 6.00 |
| 03/15/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn regarding revisions to respondents' brief | .50 |
| 03/15/12 | MD Krueger | Review, revise, and re-circulate respondents' brief | 8.50 |
| 03/15/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with co-counsel, C. Phillips, J. Cohn regarding respondents' brief | .75 |
| 03/15/12 | RC Luce | Cite check respondents' merits brief | 2.50 |
| 03/15/12 | CG Phillips | Review proposed revisions; telephone conference with co-counsel | 1.25 |
| 03/16/12 | CA Bates | Phone call with M. Krueger re: proofing brief | .25 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-------------|---|-------|
| 03/16/12 | JF Cohn | Review and revise brief; calls with co-counsel | 2.25 |
| 03/16/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn, L. Miller, M. Gross regarding revisions to respondents' brief | .75 |
| 03/16/12 | MD Krueger | Revise respondents' brief to incorporate edits from co-counsel | 5.25 |
| 03/16/12 | RC Luce | Format and edit respondents' merits brief | 1.00 |
| 03/16/12 | CG Phillips | Review proposed revisions; emails with group | 1.00 |
| 03/17/12 | CA Bates | Proofread brief; suggest edits | 4.50 |
| 03/19/12 | CA Bates | Work with R. Luce to prepare brief for filing | 1.00 |
| 03/19/12 | JF Cohn | Review/revise brief | 5.25 |
| 03/19/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with J. Cohn regarding respondents' brief | .25 |
| 03/19/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with M. Gross regarding respondents' brief | .25 |
| 03/19/12 | MD Krueger | Revise and finalize respondents' brief | 6.25 |
| 03/19/12 | MD Krueger | Email J. Cohn final edits to respondents' brief | .25 |
| 03/19/12 | RC Luce | Cite check respondents' merits brief; format and edit brief; create filing documents; prepare brief for filing; file brief with United States Supreme Court; serve brief by mail; file and serve brief electronically | 7.75 |
| 03/20/12 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding amicus support | .25 |
| 03/20/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with J. Cohn regarding respondents' brief and amicus briefs | .25 |
| 03/20/12 | MD Krueger | Prepare letters seeking parties' consent for ANSA amicus brief | .50 |
| 03/20/12 | RC Luce | Distribute respondents' merits brief to attorneys | .50 |
| 03/21/12 | JF Cohn | Binder for oral argument prep; confer with M. Gross regarding amicus; review NCAI brief | 2.50 |
| 03/21/12 | MD Krueger | Review draft amicus brief from Chamber of Commerce and email C. Phillips, J. Cohn notes on the same | .75 |
| 03/21/12 | MD Krueger | Review and select authorities for C. Phillips' preparation for argument | 1.25 |
| 03/21/12 | CG Phillips | Read amici briefs | 1.00 |
| 03/22/12 | JF Cohn | Review and comment on Chamber brief | 4.50 |
| 03/22/12 | MD Krueger | Meeting with J. Cohn regarding amicus briefs | .50 |
| 03/22/12 | MD Krueger | Review and comment on draft amicus briefs | .50 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number. 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-------------|--|-------|
| 03/22/12 | RC Luce | Create oral argument binder for C. Phillips | 7.75 |
| 03/22/12 | CG Phillips | Review and propose revisions to amici briefs; emails with J Cohn, M. Krueger, et al. | .50 |
| 03/23/12 | JF Cohn | Review comments on Chamber brief; emails regarding NCAI brief | 1.25 |
| 03/23/12 | MD Krueger | Review and revise argument binder for C. Phillips | .50 |
| 03/23/12 | RC Luce | Revise and finish oral argument binder for C. Phillips | 1.00 |
| 03/23/12 | CG Phillips | Telephone conference with J Cohn; emails regarding amici | .25 |
| 03/24/12 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding amicus briefs | .25 |
| 03/26/12 | CG Phillips | Review amici drafts | 1.00 |
| 03/28/12 | RC Luce | Obtain extra copies of respondents brief; mail copies to co-counsel | .50 |
| 03/29/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 2.00 |
| 03/30/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 1.25 |
| 04/03/12 | RC Luce | Mail additional copies of respondents brief to co-counsel | .25 |
| 04/04/12 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding argument | .25 |
| 04/04/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 2.50 |
| 04/05/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 2.00 |
| 04/06/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 1.50 |
| 04/07/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 2.00 |
| 04/08/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | .75 |
| 04/09/12 | MD Krueger | Review parties' briefs and draft potential questions and answers for C. Phillips' argument preparation | 1.00 |
| 04/09/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 1.00 |
| 04/10/12 | JF Cohn | Review Q&A argument prep | 1.25 |
| 04/10/12 | MD Krueger | Draft potential questions and answers for C. Phillips' argument preparation | 2.75 |
| 04/10/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 2.50 |
| 04/11/12 | CA Bates | Review merits briefs | 1.25 |
| 04/11/12 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding government brief; review government brief | 1.25 |
| 04/11/12 | MD Krueger | Review government's reply brief | .50 |
| 04/11/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with J. Cohn regarding government's reply brief | .25 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-------------|--|-------|
| 04/11/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument; read reply, emails with team | 3.00 |
| 04/12/12 | CA Bates | Review merits briefs | 1.75 |
| 04/12/12 | JF Cohn | Argument prep | .75 |
| 04/12/12 | MD Krueger | Meeting with J. Cohn regarding preparing questions and answers for C. Phillips' argument preparation | .25 |
| 04/12/12 | MD Krueger | Draft potential questions and answers for C. Phillips' argument preparation | 6.25 |
| 04/12/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 4.50 |
| 04/13/12 | JF Cohn | Oral argument prep; revise Q&As | 6.50 |
| 04/13/12 | MD Krueger | Draft additional questions and answers for C. Phillips' use in preparing for oral argument | 3.75 |
| 04/13/12 | MD Krueger | Emails with L. Miller regarding data on over- and under-payment of contractors for use in drafting questions and answers for C. Phillips' argument preparation | .50 |
| 04/13/12 | MD Krueger | Analyze cases cited by the government regarding Appropriations Clause and email J. Cohn regarding same | 2.50 |
| 04/13/12 | CG Phillips | Study U.S. reply; prepare for oral argument | 2.50 |
| 04/14/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 2.00 |
| 04/15/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 3.75 |
| 04/16/12 | CA Bates | Attend roundtable with C. Phillips, J. Cohn, M. Krueger, and co-counsel | 2.75 |
| 04/16/12 | CA Bates | Review questions and answers for roundtable | .75 |
| 04/16/12 | JF Cohn | Argument prep; roundtable | 8.25 |
| 04/16/12 | MD Krueger | Review case law and Redbook regarding Appropriations Clause and Judgment Fund in preparation for C. Phillips' roundtable discussion | 1.50 |
| 04/16/12 | MD Krueger | Roundtable with co-counsel for C. Phillips' argument preparation | 2.75 |
| 04/16/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn regarding email to M. Freeman and review of Cherokee briefs | .50 |
| 04/16/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument; roundtable meeting with co-counsel; office conference with J. Cohn; emails with L. Miller | 4.50 |
| 04/17/12 | JF Cohn | Argument prep; emails regarding argument, error in government's reply brief; calls with government and co-counsel regarding error | 1.25 |
| 04/17/12 | CG Phillips | Prepare for oral argument | 7.50 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|----------|-------------|--|-------|
| 04/18/12 | CA Bates | Attend oral argument and de-briefing lunch | 4.50 |
| 04/18/12 | JF Cohn | Review transcript and confer with M. Krueger regarding argument | 1.75 |
| 04/18/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conferences with J. Cohn regarding debriefing from oral argument | .50 |
| 04/18/12 | MD Krueger | Prepare for, attend, and debrief from oral argument | 4.00 |
| 04/18/12 | CG Phillips | Meeting with L. Miller; prepare for and deliver argument in Supreme Court; meeting with clients | 6.50 |
| 04/23/12 | CG Phillips | Emails with co-counsel | .25 |
| 06/18/12 | JF Cohn | Review decision; draft press talking points; calls with co-counsel; amici correspondence; emails with C. Phillips and P. Keisler regarding settlement | 2.50 |
| 06/18/12 | MD Krueger | Review Supreme Court's opinion and circulate analysis | .75 |
| 06/18/12 | CG Phillips | Read Supreme Court opinion; emails with co-counsel | 1.50 |
| 06/19/12 | JF Cohn | Conference call with co-counsel regarding next steps and settlement; email with C. Phillips regarding next steps | .75 |
| 06/19/12 | MD Krueger | Telephone conference with C. Phillips, J. Cohn, L. Miller, M. Gross, B. Rogers regarding strategy for initiating settlement discussions | 1.00 |
| 06/19/12 | CG Phillips | Emails with L. Miller, M. Gross; conference call with co-counsel team | 1.00 |
| 06/29/12 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding settlement, next steps | .25 |
| 07/07/12 | JF Cohn | Review emails regarding settlement | .25 |
| 07/08/12 | CG Phillips | Emails with M. Gross and team | .25 |
| 07/09/12 | JF Cohn | Review emails regarding settlement | .25 |
| 07/11/12 | JF Cohn | Call with M. Gross regarding settlement and DOJ meeting | .25 |
| 07/11/12 | CG Phillips | Emails regarding settlement strategy | .50 |
| 07/12/12 | JF Cohn | Settlement call with government; pre-call meeting with co-counsel; post-call meeting with co-counsel; call with M. Freeman regarding settlement; confer with M. Gross and D. McMeekin regarding call with government | 5.00 |
| 07/23/12 | JF Cohn | Review draft stipulation regarding tolling, damages matrices, emails | .25 |
| 07/24/12 | JF Cohn | Pre-settlement meeting | 2.75 |
| 07/25/12 | JF Cohn | Pre-meet with co-counsel; settlement meeting with government, confer with P. Keisler regarding DOJ settlement | 6.75 |

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 35000385
 Ramah Navajo, Pueblo of Zuni, Oglala Sioux

Salazar v. Ramah Navajo, et al.

| Date | Name | Narrative | Hours |
|--------------------|-------------|--|---------------|
| | | strategy; email C. Phillips summary; call with I. Miller regarding settlement | |
| 07/26/12 | JF Cohn | Review research regarding class certification | .25 |
| 07/30/12 | JF Cohn | Confer with C. Phillips, I. Miller regarding settlement | .50 |
| 07/31/12 | CG Phillips | Review Senators' letter; emails with L. Miller | .25 |
| 08/06/12 | JF Cohn | Review and comment on NCAI memo, related emails | .75 |
| 08/06/12 | CG Phillips | Emails regarding White House outreach efforts | .25 |
| 08/07/12 | CG Phillips | Review "dear colleague" letter; emails with J. Dossett; emails with L. Miller | .50 |
| 08/12/12 | CG Phillips | Review form claims letter | .25 |
| 09/17/12 | JF Cohn | Confer with M. Gross regarding settlement; review emails regarding issues regarding settlement | .50 |
| 09/24/12 | JF Cohn | Review "double dipping" memo; pre-conference meet with co-counsel; settlement conference; post-conference meet with co-counsel; confer with L. Miller regarding settlement strategy; confer with M. Freeman regarding settlement | 6.25 |
| 03/05/13 | JF Cohn | Review emails and letters regarding settlement | .25 |
| 09/30/13 | CG Phillips | Emails regarding settlement issues | .25 |
| 12/26/13 | JF Cohn | Call Mike; email regarding press opportunities | .50 |
| 01/02/14 | JF Cohn | Emails regarding press people | .25 |
| 09/05/14 | JF Cohn | Meet with M. Gross regarding settlement; confer with S. Lehotsky at Chamber regarding editorial | .75 |
| 09/11/14 | JF Cohn | Call with S. Lehotsky at Chamber regarding editorial, review talking points for Chamber | .50 |
| Total Hours | | | 665.00 |