

CLIENT	DATE	CAT.	HRS	WORK DESCRIPTION
300206.002	10/4/2001	4	1.00	WORK ON AMICUS BRIEF IN CHEROKEE CASE.
300206.002	10/4/2001	4	1.00	REVIEW AND REVISE LLOYD MILLER BRIEF TO TENTH CIRCUIT IN CHEROKEE CASE.
300206.002	10/5/2001	4	1.00	WORK ON AMICUS BRIEF IN CHEROKEE CASE IN TENTH CIRCUIT.
300206.002	10/5/2001	4	0.50	CALL TO LLOYD MILLER ON CHEROKEE BRIEF.
300206.002	10/6/2001	4	0.70	WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF.
300206.002	10/14/2001	4	2.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON CHEROKEE BRIEF IN TENTH CIRCUIT.
300206.002	10/20/2001	4	1.50	WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS; TELEPHONE CALL TO MIKE GROSS WITH SUGGESTED CHANGES.
300206.002	10/21/2001	4	2.50	REVIEW AND REVISE CHEROKEE APPEAL BRIEF FOR RECONSIDERATION TO MILLER; TELEPHONE CALL TO LLOYD MILLER; MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; GO OVER HIS COMMENTS.
300206.002	10/22/2001	4	1.00	REVIEW AND RECOMMEND REVISIONS IN NEW CHEROKEE BRIEF IN TENTH CIRCUIT.
300206.002	10/23/2001	4	0.60	REVIEW CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF FOR RAMAH CLASS REPRESENTATIVES.
300206.002	10/24/2001	4	0.80	WORK ON AMICUS BRIEF FOR THE CHEROKEE NATION.
300206.002	10/25/2001	4	1.00	WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF.



300206.002	10/26/2001	4	2.00	WORK WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF; REVIEW LLOYD MILLER'S COMMENTS.
300206.002	10/27/2001	4	0.75	REVIEW FINAL CHEROKEE BRIEF IN RE CSC ISSUES.
300206.002	10/29/2001	4	0.60	WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF; MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; TELEPHONE CALL TO LLOYD MILLER.
300206.002	10/30/2001	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON REVISIONS TO CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF.
300206.002	10/30/2001	4	0.40	REVIEW DRAFT PETITION FOR REHEARING IN RE SHO-BAN IN RE MITIGATING HARM TO RAMAH CLAIMS.
300206.002	10/31/2001	4	0.60	MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON CHEROKEE AMICUS.
300206.002	11/15/2001	4	0.75	REVIEW DRAFT SHO BAN BRIEF ON MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION AND DRAFT AMICUS BRIEF.
300206.002	11/18/2001	4	0.60	REVIEW AND NOTE ISSUES; MAKE RECOMMENDATIONS ON SHO BAN MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION.
300206.002	11/19/2001	4	4.00	FOLLOW-UP/DISCUSSION/ANALYSIS; CALL TO LLOYD MILLER ON SHO-BAN MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION; REVISE AND TELEFAX SUGGESTED REVISIONS.
300206.002	11/20/2001	4	2.00	WORK ON SHO-BAN AMICUS AND ADDITIONAL RECOMMENDED REVISIONS TO LLOYD MILLER'S SHO-BAN BRIEF.
300206.002	11/25/2001	4	0.90	REVIEW LLOYD MILLER'S MARK-UP ON OUR SHO-BAN AMICUS BRIEF; REVIEW LLOYD MILLER'S LATEST DRAFT (REHEARING BRIEF).
300206.002	11/27/2001	4	1.75	REVIEW AND REVISE SHO-BAN AMICUS MOTION AND MEMO; MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON AMICUS BRIEF.

300206.002	1/3/2002	4	0.40 REVIEW GOVERNMENT'S REPLY BRIEF ON CAP YEARS.
300206.002	3/5/2002	4	0.70 REVIEW ST. REGIS IHS CASE DECISION IN RE PENDING RAMAH CLAIMS.
300206.002	3/6/2002	4	1.50 LEGAL RESEARCH; ANALYSIS OF JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES ST. REGIS AND SUSANVILLE CASES IN RE RAMAH CLAIMS.
300206.002	6/24/2002	4	0.30 FOLLOW-UP CALLS ON SCHEDULING ISSUES REGARDING AUGUST 19TH HEARING ON CAPS.
300206.002	7/9/2002	4	2.00 WORK ON PREPARATION FOR DISTRICT COURT ARGUMENTS ON CAP YEARS.
300206.002	7/25/2002	4	0.40 DISCUSS RAMAH ORAL ARGUMENT ISSUES WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	7/31/2002	4	2.00 MEET WITH COUNSEL ON ORAL ARGUMENT ISSUES REGARDING SECOND PSA
300206.002	8/1/2002	4	1.50 REVIEW JUDGE HANSEN'S LETTER; REVIEW CHEROKEE CASE FILE; CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND MILLER; DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE HANSEN; REVIEW ATTORNEY GROSS; DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE HANSEN.
300206.002		4	0.40 FINALIZE LETTER TO COURT; REVIEW ATTORNEYS GROSS AND MILLER'S LETTERS TO COURT ON AUGUST 19TH HEARING.
300206.002	8/5/2002	4	0.20 FOLLOW-UP CALLS ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT ISSUES ON CAP YEARS.
300206.002	8/7/2002	4	2.00 WORK WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON ORAL ARGUMENT FOR AUGUST 19TH HEARING.

300206.002	8/8/2002	4	0.40 FOLLOW-UP WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND MILLER; REVIEW KAREN RICHARDSON'S LETTERS RE CAPS' ARGUMENT SETTING, ETC.
300206.002	8/9/2002	4	0.20 TELEPHONE CALLS ON AUGUST 19TH HEARING --- ON OR OFF; FOLLOW-UP E-MAILS.
300206.002	8/17/2002	4	2.00 REVIEW GOVERNMENT'S BRIEF AND LLOYD MILLER'S DRAFT BRIEF IN CHEROKEE HIS/BICA CASE; DICTATE MEMORANDUM.
300206.002	8/18/2002	4	0.50 FINISH E-MAIL TO LLOYD MILLER ON CHEROKEE FEDERAL CIRCUIT BRIEF.
300206.002	8/19/2002	4	0.40 FURTHER WORK ON CHEROKEE FEDERAL COURT AMICUS BRIEF.
300206.002	8/21/2002	4	1.50 CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS, MILLER AND PERRY ON AMICUS AND MILLER BRIEFS IN CHEROKEE FEDERAL COURT CASE
300206.002	8/23/2002	4	1.50 REVIEW ATTORNEY LLOYD MILLER'S DRAFT 12 OF CHEROKEE FEDERAL CIRCUIT BRIEF AND SEND COMMENTS
300206.002	7/3/2001	4	2.00 CONFERENCE CALL AND ANALYSIS ON IMPACT OF CHEROKEE NATION DECISION ON CAP BRIEF.
300206.002	7/5/2001	4	0.30 MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON THEORETICAL AND FACTUAL ISSUES REGARDING CAP YEAR BRIEF.
300206.002	7/11/2001	4	0.80 REVIEW MARK-UP OF CSC SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF ON CAP YEARS.
300206.002	7/12/2001	4	0.60 DISCUSSION WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF ON CAP YEARS.
300206.002	7/16/2001	4	0.80 WORK ON CAP YEAR SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF AND DEVELOPMENT OF ARGUMENTS.
300206.002	7/18/2001	4	2.00 WORK ON CAP YEARS' BRIEF.
300206.002	7/19/2001	4	0.30 WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF.
300206.002	7/22/2001	4	2.00 WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF RE CAP YEARS.

300206 002	7/23/2001	4	1.00	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF.
300206 002	7/24/2001	4	2.00	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF ON CAP YEARS.
300206 002	7/25/2001	4	0.50	WORK ON BRIEF IN RE IDC CLAIM - CAP YEARS.
300206 002	7/26/2001	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION REGARDING CAP YEARS.
300206 002	7/29/2001	4	0.50	WORK ON CAP YEAR BRIEF.
300206 002	7/30/2001	4	4.50	WORK ON RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER SUMMARY JUDGMENT CAP BRIEF.
300206 002	7/31/2001	4	6.00	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF FOR CAP YEARS.
300206 002	9/25/2001	4	0.50	DISCUSS UPDATED RAMAH THEORY CLAIMS ISSUES WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206 002	10/9/2001	4	4.50	WORK ON RAMAH CAP YEARS ISSUES AND ARGUMENTS.
300206 002	10/10/2001	4	0.40	POTAWATOMI CASE ANALYSIS IN RE ANTI-DEF. OUT ARG. ON CAP CLASS.
300206 002	10/18/2001	4	0.70	CONFERENCE CALL ON IMPACT OF SHO-BAN DECISION ON PENDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT CASE IN RAMAH AND CHEROKEE APPEAL.
300206 002	11/20/2001	4	1.00	START ANALYSIS OF GOVERNOR'S ANSWER BRIEF ON MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT ON CAP YEAR CLAIMS.

300206.002	12/3/2001	4	0.40 FOLLOW-UP ON RAMAH SUMMARY JUDGMENT REPLY BRIEF.
300206.002	12/5/2001	4	0.75 WORK ON CAP YEARS SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF ISSUES.
300206.002	12/6/2001	4	0.50 WORK ON SECOND PSA REPLY BRIEF ON PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT; FOCUS ON 450(j) ISSUES.
300206.002	12/7/2001	4	0.25 REVIEW NORTON RULING IN RE RAMAH SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF.
300206.002	12/9/2001	4	0.50 WORK ON REPLY BRIEF IN RE PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION.
300206.002	12/10/2001	4	2.50 WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT REPLY BRIEF.
300206.002	12/11/2001	4	1.50 WORK ON REPLY BRIEF ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION.
300206.002	1/4/2002	4	0.30 MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL TO KAREN RICHARDSON ON MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT.
300206.002	1/15/2002	4	0.25 ATTEND STATUS CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT AND COUNSEL ON SECOND PSA/CAPS SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION/EQUITABLE RELIEF AND SECOND DISTRIBUTION.
300206.002	3/6/2002	4	0.50 CONFERENCE CALL WITH GEOFF STROMMER AND MICHAEL P GROSS ON ARGUMENTS REGARDING GOVERNMENT'S AUTHORITY IN RELATED CASE.
300206.002	5/18/2002	4	2.75 REVIEW BRIEFS; WORK WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON ORAL ARGUMENT ON CAP YEARS.
300206.002	5/19/2002	4	0.50 WORK ON DRAFT QUESTIONS IN RE ORAL ARGUMENT.

300206.002 5/21/2002 4 0.20 REVIEW AND SUGGEST CHANGES IN CHART ON CONTRACT.

300206.002 2/5/2002 4 1.00 ANALYZE GOVERNMENT'S CHEROKEE BRIEF IN TENTH CIRCUIT IN
RE RAMAH CAP YEAR CLAIMS.

Grant Totals 88.95