

EXHIBIT H

COMPILATION OF HOURS WORKED ON RAMAH CLASS
ACTION BETWEEN 11/30/90 AND 07/28/97:

380.66 HOURS

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
11-30-90	Prepare for meeting on IDC lawsuit; Attend meeting with client; attend OIC meeting; return to Santa Fe	7.00
8-30-91	Calls to Assistant U.S. Attorney on Deposition dates	.10
9-9-91	Work on reply to motion for class Action matter	.60
9-18-91	Work on reply brief re class action Motion	1.00
9-30-91	Work with Mike Gross on prep for Depositions in D.C.	.75
10-29-91	Work with Mike Gross on identifying Other claimants/claims in indirect cost Lawsuit; telephone call with Skip Bridges, to Duckwater, to Turtle Mountain; draft follow-up letters	3.00
10-31-91	Work on identifying other tribes and Other claims regarding indirect cost Lawsuit and how to deal with lump sum Claims; call to Nambe	.60
11-1-91	Work with Mike Gross on appropriations Issues/legal arguments regarding indirect Cost lawsuit.	.50
11-5-91	Legal research; discuss with Mike Gross government's duty to come up with funds to meet statutory duty	.25
11-8-91	Work on summary judgment memorandum	1.00
11-11-91	Locate old OIG memos regarding indirect Costs; analyze how they relate to the motion	1.10
12-2-91	Work on indirect cost brief for summary	

	Judgment	1.00
12-3-91	Work on indirect cost brief for summary Judgment	.40
12-11-91	Review/revise memorandum for summary Judgment	.50
12-12-91	Work on summary judgment brief	.75
1-28-92	Review gov. response brief and brief in Supp. of summary judgment	1.00
1-28-92	Analysis of options re possible intervenors	.30
1-29-92	Further analysis of Ramah Chapter Indirect cost arguments for reply brief	.60
2-10-82	Research regarding OIG statements as Party admissions of governor	.40
2-13-92	Review issues on reply brief with Mike Gross	.20
3-9-92	Review/analyze reply brief	.50
4-16-92	Further work on contract indirect cost Issues for related claims; call to Robin Jasper	.60
10-15-93	Review class action certificate regarding Indirect cost case; dictate draft additions To class action notice	.50
10-28-93	Meet with Mike Gross on arguments for Indirect cost lawsuit	1.00
10-29-93	Go to indirect cost hearing/assist Mike Gross	2.50
6-3-94	Call from Oglala Lakota College	.40
8-1-94	Get enclosures; letter to Cherokee	

	Nation with enclosures	.20
5-23-95	Review/revise reply brief; legal Research	.75
5-24-95	Follow up with Mike Gross on indirect Cost reply brief	.25
11-14-95	Work on oral argument for Tenth Circuit	.60
11-13-95	Work on oral argument preparation for Tenth Circuit	1.00
11-9-95	Review/analyze brief for indirect cost Argument	1.75

31.10

=====

S:\Rogers\RAMAH\Time Entries 082015.doc

Date: 10/01/98

ROTH, VANAMBERG, ROGERS, ORTIZ & FAIRBANKS

Ref#	Client	Tmkr	Cat	Date	H B R			Hours	
					P	C	C Tcode		
12	300206.002	4	1	09/03/98	P		1	0.40	CALLS FROM MIKE REGARDING JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE; FOLLOW-UP CALLS TO ALAMO.
15	300206.002	4	1	09/09/98	P		1	1.50	WORK ON ATTORNEY'S FEE APPLICATION FOR CLASS ACTION.
100	300206.002	4	1	09/13/98	P		1	0.67	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND AND ISSUES CONCERNING INVESTMENT OF SETTLEMENT PROCEEDS.
102	300206.002	4	1	09/14/98	P		1	0.25	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND AND DISTRIBUTION ISSUES AND OPTIONS.
104	300206.002	4	1	09/14/98	P		1	1.20	WORK ON ATTORNEY FEE AFFIDAVIT FOR LAWSUIT; DISCUSS CASE OPTIONS WITH MIKE GROSS.
115	300206.002	4	1	09/16/98	P		1	0.50	WORK ON DRAFT ATTORNEY'S FEE AFFIDAVIT.
163	300206.002	4	1	09/21/98	P		1	2.50	MEETINGS ON JUDGMENT FUND AND ATTORNEY FEE APPLICATION; WORK ON FEE AFFIDAVIT.
171	300206.002	4	1	09/22/98	P		1	0.75	WORK ON ATTORNEY'S FEE AFFIDAVIT.
186	300206.002	4	1	09/23/98	P		1	1.50	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE REGARDING SETTLEMENT
203	300206.002	4	1	09/27/98	P		1	2.00	MEETING TO DISCUSS PREPARATION FOR HEARING AND NOTICE AND FEE APPLICATION.
204	300206.002	4	1	09/28/98	P		1	2.00	WORK ON ATTORNEY FEE APPLICATION.

								13.27	

13.27 +
 5.50 +
 2.70 +
 33.25 +
 41.82 +
 67.40 +
 10.15 +
 63.60 +
 79.27 +
 25.70 +
 4.50 +
 2.40 +

012

349.56G+

Law Offices

Roth, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz, Fairbanks, & Yepa, LLP

P.O. Box 1447

Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504

(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
08/31/98

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
08/01/98 CBR JULY 7, 1998: CALL FROM MIKE GROSS REGARDING JUDGMENT FUND AND OTHER IDC ISSUES CONCERNING SETTLEMENT.	1.00
08/06/98 CBR DISCUSS "SNAGS" IN SETTLEMENT FROM IHS, DHHS INTERFERENCE.	.70
08/10/98 CBR FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS ON DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE DISCUSSIONS REGARDING IHS "SNAG" IN SETTLEMENT.	.70
08/12/98 CBR FOLLOW-UP ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES REGARDING IDC CLASS ACTION.	.50
08/19/98 CBR REVIEW/ANALYZE PROPOSED REVISIONS REGARDING SETTLEMENT.	1.00
08/20/98 CBR CALL MIKE GROSS REGARDING ISSUES ON PROPOSED SETTLEMENT.	.60
08/26/98 CBR REVIEW FAXES; ANALYZE PROPOSED CHANGES IN SETTLEMENT LANGUAGE; CALLS TO MIKE GROSS.	1.00

Law Offices

Both, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz, Fairbanks, & Yepa, LLP

P.O. Box 1447

Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504

(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
07/31/98

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
07/06/98 CBR REVIEW DRAFT STIPULATION AND NOTE DIFFICULTIES.	.50
07/10/98 CBR MEET WITH SENATOR'S DOMENICI'S STAFF AND SENATOR CAMPBELL'S STAFF ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE.	1.20
07/24/98 CBR CALL FROM MIKE GROSS ON UPDATE ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES, STATUS, AND ARGUMENTS.	.40
07/31/98 CBR WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES REGARDING SETTLEMENT.	.60

	2.70

Law Offices
Roth, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz & Fairbanks, LLP
P.O. Box 1447
Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504
(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
06/30/98

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
05/06/98 CBR CALL TO MIKE GROSS ON STATUS; FOLLOW-UP REGARDING SETTLEMENT.	.20
05/07/98 CBR CONFERENCE WITH MIKE GROSS ON FINAL SETTLEMENT LANGUAGE AND DISTRIBUTION ISSUES.	.50
CBR WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE; WORK ON AND PHONE CALLS REGARDING IDC LETTER REGARDING THREE OPTIONS TO FIX BIA SYSTEM PER RAMAH CASE.	1.00
05/10/98 CBR WORK ON SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS AND DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY.	2.50
05/11/98 CBR FURTHER REVIEW/REVISION ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY; TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE; MEET WITH U.S. ATTORNEY ON SETTLEMENT; RETURN TO SANTA FE.	6.50
05/12/98 CBR FOLLOW-UP/WORK ON METHODOLOGY ISSUES.	.20
CBR WORK ON REVISIONS TO PARTIAL SETTLEMENT, DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OIG/REPRESENTATIVES; MEET WITH MIKE GROSS ON REVISIONS.	5.00
05/14/98 CBR WORK ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY; CALL TAMARA AT	

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
OIG.	2.00
05/15/98 CBR WORK ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CALL TAMARA AT OIG.	1.50
05/25/98 CBR REVIEW PSA/APPENDIX D AND NOTICE TO CLASS.	2.50
05/26/98 CBR MEET AND DISCUSS ISSUES AND CHANGES IN PSA, ETC. MEET ON/REVISE PSA AND APPENDIX D.	3.50
05/27/98 CBR REVIEW FINAL PSA AND ATTACHMENTS.	.50
06/02/98 CBR RETURN CALL FROM BOBO DEAN ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES.	.20
06/03/98 CBR WORK ON JUDGMENT FINAL RESPONSE ISSUES REGARDING DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE LETTER TO SENATE.	.50
06/05/98 CBR WORK ON LETTER TO SENATOR CAMPBELL REGARDING JUDGMENT FUND.	.40
06/08/98 CBR ANALYSIS OF CURRENT IDC DEVELOPMENTS IN BIA AND IN CONGRESS AS RELATE TO EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1.00
06/12/98 CBR WORK ON, REVIEW AND REVISE SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS REGARDING LATEST GOVERNMENT RECOMMENDATIONS AND COMMENTS.	1.50
06/22/98 CBR MEET ON FOLLOW-UP WORK NEEDED FOR SETTLEMENT.	1.75
06/23/98 CBR CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING IDC ISSUES AND EFFECT ON LUJAN CASE.	2.00

Law Offices
Roth, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz & Fairbanks, LLP
P.O. Box 1447
Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504
(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
04/30/98

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
04/17/98 CBR PARTICIPATE IN NCAI MEETING ON LAWSUIT AND RELATED IDC CASES.	8.00
04/20/98 CBR WORK ON LANGUAGE REGARDING JUDGMENT FUND PROBLEM.	1.50
04/22/98 CBR REVIEW/FOLLOW-UP ON SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT LANGUAGE AND SETTLEMENT ISSUES.	.67
CBR WORK ON SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS.	3.00
CBR ONE-HALF TIME TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO WASHINGTON, D.C. FOR MEETINGS ON FINAL SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS.	4.75
04/23/98 CBR NEGOTIATIONS REGARDING SETTLEMENT AND RELATED MEETINGS.	10.50
CBR RETURN TRAVEL TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO FROM WASHINGTON, D.C. (ONE-HALF TIME).	3.00
04/24/98 CBR FOLLOW-UP CALLS REGARDING IDC EQUITABLE RELIEF AND BIA FAX.	.40
04/27/98 CBR WORK ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY AND APPENDIX A.	3.00

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
04/28/98 CBR WORK ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY APPENDIX A.	2.00
04/29/98 CBR MEETING ON LANGUAGE OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	1.50
04/30/98 CBR REVIEW/REVISE DRAFT COMMENTS REGARDING BIA IDC OPTIONS.	.50
CBR WORK ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY--APPENDIX A AND PARTIAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT LANGUAGE.	3.00

	41.82

Law Offices
Roth, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz & Fairbanks, LLP
P.O. Box 1447
Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504
(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
03/31/98

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
02/02/98 CBR CALLS TO AND FROM JOHN ZAVITZ REGARDING OPT OUT ISSUE; FOLLOW-UP.	.40
02/03/98 CBR CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY/JUDGMENT FUND AND OTHER SETTLEMENT ISSUES.	2.00
02/04/98 CBR FURTHER ANALYSIS OF DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY AND CAP YEAR ISSUES.	1.00
CBR FOLLOW-UP ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY AND IDC SYSTEMS ISSUES.	.50
02/09/98 CBR MEET WITH BOB FISHER ON LIST OF ALL CLASS MEMBERS BY YEAR AND FOLLOW-UP NOTES.	.75
02/12/98 CBR MEETING WITH MIKE GROSS AND STEVE TUCKER ON DISTRIBUTION/SETTLEMENT/JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES AND FOLLOW-UP.	2.50
02/25/98 CBR WORK ON METHODOLOGICAL EXPLANATION LETTER TO NAVAJO NATION.	2.50

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
02/26/98 CBR WORK ON METHODOLOGY LETTER TO TOM CHRISTY.	.50
03/01/98 CBR PREPARE FOR NEGOTIATIONS; WORK ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY.	6.00
03/02/98 CBR WORK ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY.	2.00
03/03/98 CBR TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE; NEGOTIATIONS; WORK ON DISTRIBUTION LANGUAGE IN EVENING.	11.00
03/04/98 CBR NEGOTIATIONS ON IDC; RETURN TO SANTA FE.	10.00
03/05/98 CBR TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE AND RETURN TO SANTA FE; WORK ON DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	5.50
03/09/98 CBR WORK ON REWRITING SETTLEMENT DISTRIBUTION/ ALLOCATION METHODOLOGY.	2.00
03/10/98 CBR WORK ON SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS AND ISSUES.	1.50
03/11/98 CBR WORK ON SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, ISSUES, AND LANGUAGE.	2.00
03/15/98 CBR WORK ON SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS.	2.50
03/16/98 CBR WORK ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY; MEETING WITH STEVE TUCKER.	2.50
03/17/98 CBR WORK ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY FOR SETTLEMENT.	2.50

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER

Page: 3
03/31/98

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
03/18/98 CBR WORK ON SETTLEMENT DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY.	4.50
03/19/98 CBR WORK ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY FOR SETTLEMENT.	1.50
03/23/98 CBR REVIEW DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE TO MEET WITH COURT CLERK; MEETING WITH COURT CLERK AND RETURN.	3.75

For Current Services Rendered	67.40
Gross Receipts Tax	

Law Offices

Roth, Van Ambem, Rogers, Ortiz & Fairbank, LLP

P.O. Box 1447

Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504

(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
02/28/98

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
02/02/98 CBR CALLS TO AND FROM JOHN ZAVITZ REGARDING OPT OUT ISSUE; FOLLOW-UP.	.40
02/03/98 CBR CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY/JUDGMENT FUND AND OTHER SETTLEMENT ISSUES.	2.00
02/04/98 CBR FURTHER ANALYSIS OF DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY AND CAP YEAR ISSUES.	1.00
CBR FOLLOW-UP ON DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY AND IDC SYSTEMS ISSUES.	.50
02/09/98 CBR MEET WITH BOB FISHER ON LIST OF ALL CLASS MEMBERS BY YEAR AND FOLLOW-UP NOTES.	.75
02/12/98 CBR MEETING WITH MIKE GROSS AND STEVE TUCKER ON DISTRIBUTION/SETTLEMENT/JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES AND FOLLOW-UP.	2.50
02/25/98 CBR WORK ON METHODOLOGICAL EXPLANATION LETTER TO NAVAJO NATION.	2.50
02/26/98 CBR WORK ON METHODOLOGY LETTER TO TOM CHRISTY.	.50

	10.15

Law Offices
Roth, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz & Fairbanks, LLP
P.O. Box 1447
Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504
(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
01/31/98

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
01/05/98 CBR WORK ON LETTER TO COOLEY; MEETING ON IDC CASE/ FOLLOW-UP.	.50
01/06/98 CBR MEETING WITH MIKE GROSS AND STEVE TUCKER ON NEGOTIATIONS.	1.00
01/12/98 CBR WORK ON PREPARATION FOR SUBMISSION TO MEDIATOR.	.60
01/13/98 CBR WORK ON LETTER/SUBMISSIONS TO COOLEY.	.50
01/15/98 CBR WORK ON RAMAH IDC NUMBERS FOR IDC SETTLEMENT.	9.00
01/16/98 CBR WORK ON IDC SETTLEMENT ISSUES.	6.00
01/19/98 CBR WORK ON IDC CALCULATIONS FOR SETTLEMENT.	.50
01/20/98 CBR WORK ON IDC ISSUES/STRATEGY.	5.00
01/22/98 CBR WORK ON CLASS MEMBER LISTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MEDIATOR; FOLLOWUP DISCUSSIONS/STRATEGY.	2.00

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER

Page: 2
01/31/98

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
01/23/98 CBR WORK ON IDC DISTRIBUTION DATA; CALL TO JOHN ZAVITZ; MEET WITH BOB FISHER.	1.50
01/25/98 CBR ONE-HALF TIME TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO PHOENIX, ARIZONA.	2.00
01/26/98 CBR MEETINGS/MEDIATION; WORK ON IDC CASE.	9.00
01/27/98 CBR MEETINGS/MEDIATION; WORK ON IDC CASE.	8.50
01/28/98 CBR MEETINGS/MEDIATION; WORK ON IDC CASE.	9.50
01/29/98 CBR MEETINGS/MEDIATION; WORK ON IDC CASE; ONE-HALF TIME TRAVEL FROM PHOENIX, ARIZONA TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	8.00

	63.60

Law Offices
Roth, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz & Fairbanks, LLP
P.O. Box 1447
Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504
(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
10/31/97

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
10/01/97 CBR TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE; WORK ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND OPTIONS; DO SETTLEMENT SESSION.	11.00
10/02/97 CBR TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE AND RETURN; DO NEGOTIATIONS ON IDC CASE SETTLEMENT AND FOLLOW-UP MEETINGS.	10.67
10/03/97 CBR ANALYZE IDC SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY ISSUES.	.50
10/06/97 CBR CALL TO EARLA BEGAY REGARDING TRAVEL ARRANGEMENTS. CBR WORK ON SETTLEMENT METHODOLOGY. WORK ON DISTRIBUTION AND SETTLEMENT METHODOLOGY ISSUES.	.10 3.00
10/08/97 CBR WORK WITH MIKE GROSS ON METHODOLOGY REGARDING CONTRACT SUPPORT, SETTLEMENT, AND FOLLOW-UP.	.40
10/09/97 CBR LEGAL RESEARCH ON GOVERNMENT'S COST REIMBURSEMENT ARGUMENT.	2.50
10/10/97 CBR MEET WITH ZAVITZ; REVIEW BIA IDC SHORTFALL REPORTS; WORK ON COST REIMBURSABLE ARGUMENT AND	

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTEI

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
RESPONSE.	2.50
10/12/97 CBR WORK ON CLAIMS ANALYSIS.	1.00
10/13/97 CBR WORK ON CLAIMS ANALYSIS AND "MITIGATION" ARGUMENT PAPER REGARDING COSTS INCURRED.	2.50
10/14/97 CBR WORK ON SETTLEMENT ANALYSIS AND DISTRIBUTION ISSUES; WORK ON COST REIMBURSEMENT vs. ENTITLEMENT ISSUES.	4.00
10/15/97 CBR WORK ON CLAMS ISSUE AND COST REIMBURSEMENT CONTRACT ISSUES; REVIEW AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR D.C. NEGOTIATIONS.	5.00
10/16/97 CBR WORK ON FISHER ANALYSIS AND OTHER WORK ON CLAIM AMOUNT ANALYSIS.	2.50
10/17/97 CBR REVIEW INDIRECT COST DATA AND CHARTS FROM FISHER AND OTHER DATA AND DOCUMENTS REGARDING IDC CLAIMS.	2.50
CBR REVIEW RED BOOK ON IDC FROM PORTLAND AREA TRIBES; CALL BOB FISHER ON HIS CHART.	2.00
10/20/97 CBR ONE-HALF TIME TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO WASHINGTON, D.C. CONCERNING BIA/DOJ SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS.	4.00
CBR MEET WITH BOB FISHER; REVIEW FISHER GRAPHS, ETC.; CALLS TO MIKE GROSS.	.60
10/21/97 CBR PREPARE FOR MEETING; DO MEETINGS CONCERNING SETTLEMENT; FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS.	9.50
CBR ONE-HALF TIME TRAVEL FROM WASHINGTON, D.C. TO JACKSON, MISSISSIPPI).	3.75

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
10/22/97 CBR ONE-HALF TIME TRAVEL BACK TO ALBUQUERQUE FROM JACKSON, MISSISSIPPI.	3.25
10/29/97 CBR WORK ON RECONCILING OIG AND BIA IDC POOL NUMBERS.	1.00
10/30/97 CBR WORK ON IDC DATA AND METHODOLOGY.	1.00
10/31/97 CBR SEPTEMBER 30, 1997: ANALYSIS OF CASE ISSUES AND OPTIONS FOR CLASS SETTLEMENT.	4.00
CBR WORK ON SETTLEMENT NUMBERS.	1.50
CBR MEET WITH MIKE GROSS, FISHER, AND TUCKER ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES.	.50

	79.27

Law Offices
Roth, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz & Fairbanks, LLP
P.O. Box 1447
Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504
(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
09/30/97

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
09/02/97 CBR REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND LAW IN PREPARATION FOR INITIAL CLASS SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS.	2.00
09/03/97 CBR PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND INITIAL SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE/DEPARTMENT OF INTERIOR AT MAIN INTERIOR.	3.50
09/08/97 CBR FURTHER ANALYSIS REGARDING OPTIONS FOR INDIRECT COST FORMULA ADJUSTMENTS CONCERNING BIA INDIRECT COSTS.	1.20
09/09/97 CBR ANALYSIS/DISCUSSION/FOLLOW-UP ON IDC CLASS NOTICE AND RELATED ISSUES; TELEPHONE CALLS; FOLLOW-UP REVIEW.	1.30
09/10/97 CBR WORK ON CLASS NOTICE AND CALCULATION CHART LANGUAGE AND INSTRUCTIONS.	2.00
09/11/97 CBR REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND REVISE CLASS NOTICE AND FORMS.	2.50
09/12/97 CBR WORK ON DAMAGES CALCULATIONS METHODOLOGY; LEGAL	

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
RESEARCH ON PARAMETERS FOR SETTLEMENT FOR CLASS ACTION SETTLEMENT.	.40
09/15/97 CBR CONFERENCE CALL WITH JOHN DONHAM AND MICHAEL GROSS TO WORK ON IDC CLAIMS FORM/ERROR CORRECTION METHODOLOGY ATTACHMENT.	2.00
09/16/97 CBR CALLS FOR TEST SAMPLES CONCERNING CORRECTION METHODOLOGY REGARDING IDC RULING.	.40
09/18/97 CBR ANALYSIS/ CALLS REGARDING IHS SHORTFALL DOCUMENTATION; CALL TO IHS AND OTHER TRIBES CONCERNING METHODOLOGY USED BY OIG.	2.00
CBR FURTHER RESEARCH AT LAW LIBRARY ON CLASS ACTIONS/ INTEREST ISSUES.	1.00
09/19/97 CBR ANALYZE/DISCUSS CLASS ACTION ISSUES WITH MIKE GROSS.	.60
09/20/97 CBR REVIEW/MAKE NOTES ON DRAFT LETTER TO FEDERAL MAGISTRATE ON CASE STATUS.	.50
09/23/97 FJR OFFICE CONFERENCE REGARDING RESEARCH.	.50
09/25/97 CBR CASE STATUS AND STRATEGY DISCUSSION WITH MIKE GROSS REGARDING CLASS ACTION.	.80
09/29/97 CBR WORK ON IDC METHODOLOGY; CALLS REGARDING IHS SHORTFALL DATA.	.50
09/30/97 CBR 8/22/97: DISCUSS CLASS ACTION LEGAL ISSUES WITH MIKE GROSS PER SAVITZ MEETING.	.50
CBR 8/30/97: PREPARATION/ANALYSIS FOR DOJ MEETING AT INTERIOR.	1.00
CBR 8/31/97: WORK ON INTEREST/JUDGMENT AND DAMAGES ISSUES FOR SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS.	3.00

	25.70

Law Offices
Roth, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz & Fairbanks, LLP
P.O. Box 1447
Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504
(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
08/31/97

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
08/22/97 CBR DISCUSS CLASS ACTION LEGAL ISSUES WITH MIKE GROSS PER SAVITZ MEETING.	.50
08/30/97 CBR PREPARE ANALYSIS FOR ODJ MEETING AT INTERIOR.	1.00
08/31/97 CBR WORK ON INTERROGATORIES/ PREPARE FOR SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS.	3.00

	4.50

Law Offices

Roth, Van Amberg, Rogers, Ortiz & Fairbanks, LLP

P.O. Box 1447

Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504

(505) 988-8979 / FAX (505) 983-7508

Page: 1
07/31/97

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER
ROUTE 2, BOX 13
RAMAH NM 87321

INDIRECT COST LAWSUIT

	Hours
07/17/97 CBR START ANALYSIS OPTIONS/ISSUES FOR STATUS CONFERENCE.	1.00
7/21/97 CBR LEGAL RESEARCH ON LAW OF THE CASE; FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS REGARDING GOVERNOR'S POSITION ON CLASS DUTY TO EXHAUST.	.80
07/22/97 CBR WORK ON LETTER TO COURT REGARDING IDC CLASS ACTION.	.20
07/28/97 CBR ANALYSIS/REVIEW OF U.S. DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE LETTER TO JUDGE HANSEN ON IDC CASE.	.40

	2.40