

CLIENT	DATE	CAT.	HRS	WORK DESCRIPTION
300206.002	12/30/1998	3	1.50	ANALYZE MICCOSOKEE BRIEF REGARDING 1994-1998 RAMAH ARGUMENT.
300206.002	1/4/1999	3	0.50	DISCUSS CAPS OPTIONS/ISSUES; MICCOSUKEE BRIEF.
300206.002	1/30/1999	3	0.30	LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND FOR SUPPLEMENTA SUBMISSION TO COURT
300206.002	5/20/1999	3	1.00	REVIEW DRAFT MOTION TO AMEND AND PROPOSED AMENDED COMPLAINT.
300206.002	5/25/1999	3	3.50	WORK ON PROPOSED AMENDED COMPL. IN RAMAH CLASS ACTION.
300206.002	5/28/1999	3	0.40	REVIEW REDRAFTED MOTION AND INTERLINEATION COMPLAINT FOR RAMAH.
300206.002	8/16/1999	3	0.75	REVIEW AND REVISE REPLY BRIEF ON MOTION TO AMEND AND TO INTERVENE.
300206.002	9/23/1999	3	1.50	WORK ON RESPONSE TO SUPPLEMENTAL AUTHORITY FILED BY UNITED STATES ON PRE-1994 SF CLAIMS.
300206.002	9/27/1999	3	0.70	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT ORDER ON PENDING MOTIONS TO AMEND ON SECOND TIER CLAIMS ON OGALALA SIOUX TRIBAL INTERVENTION.
300206.002	9/27/1999	3	0.60	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING FY 1992 AND FY 1993 SHORTFALLS IN BIA CSC.
300206.002	10/15/1999	3	1.50	CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEYS MICHAEL P. GROSS AND SEVEN L. TUCKER ON RAMAH IDC CASE OPTIONS/ISSUES/STATUS/FOLLOW-UP.
300206.002	10/28/1999	3	1.50	REVIEW JOHN ZAVITZ LETTER AND ENCLOSURES REGARDING 1994 SETTLEMENT; CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY MICHAEL P. GROSS ON POSITION PAPER REGARDING SECTION 114 AND ON NEGOTIATIONS ISSUES REGARDING EQUITABLE RELIEF.

EXHIBIT

1

300206 002	11/3/1999	3	2.00	WORK ON BREACH OF TRUST CLAIM OPTIONS FOR OST CASE REGARDING CSC.
300206 002	11/4/1999	3	0.75	WORK ON DISCOVERY REGARDING FY 1992, 1993, AND 1994 SHORTFALLS.
300206 002	11/7/1999	3	5.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME, SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO WASHINGTON, D.C.
300206 002	11/8/1999	3	7.50	NEGOTIATIONS, ANALYSIS, AND MEETINGS ON DISCOVERY, STIPULATIONS, AMENDED COMPLAINT, EQUITABLE RELIEF; MEETING.
300206 002	11/9/1999	3	4.50	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME, WASHINGTON D.C. TO ALBUQUERQUE, NM; REVIEW ACCOUNTING PROPOSALS.
300206 002	11/9/1999	3	2.00	MEETING WITH OIG, LEGAL, U.S. ATTORNEY REPRESENTATIVES ON ALTERNATIVE DISTRIBUTIONS SYSTEMS, DATA ISSUE REGARDING SYSTEM; WORK ON AMENDED COMPLAINT AND DISCOVERY.
300206 002	11/11/1999	3	0.60	ANALYZE BOB FISHER'S INTEREST CALCULATION QUESTIONS AND TAX.
300206 002	12/16/1999	3	0.20	FOLLOW-UP WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON DISCOVERY; FOLLOW-UP ON CRIS ACCOUNT.
300206 002	12/23/1999	3	3.50	CONFERENCE ON NOTICE, DISCOVERY AND NEW CLAIMS ISSUES REGARDING OGLALA-RAMAH CLAIM.
300206 002	12/28/1999	3	2.00	WORK WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON PSA NOTICE ISSUE; WORK WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON DISCOVERY AND RELATED ISSUES REGARDING NEW CLAIMS.
300206 002	12/28/1999	3	0.40	REVIEW OF FAXED DRAFT LETTERS FROM ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206 002	1/3/2000	3	1.50	ATTEND MEETING ON DISCOVERY, NOTICE AND RELATED ISSUES ON RAMAH IDC (3/4 NEW; 1/4 OLD).

300206.002	1/7/2000	3	0.10	WORK ON DEPOSITION NOTICE AND SERVICE.
300206.002	1/12/2000	3	0.20	FOLLOW-UP CALLS REGARDING DISCOVERY ON CAP YEARS AND 1992-1993 2ND TIER CLAIMS.
300206.002	2/1/2000	3	0.80	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF REGARDING CAP YEARS CLAIMS.
300206.002	2/2/2000	3	1.00	MEET WITH ATTORNEYS MICHAEL P. GROSS AND ERIC TRIESMAN ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF REGARDING CAP CLAIMS.
300206.002	2/4/2000	3	0.60	WORK ON BRIEF FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION.
300206.002	2/7/2000	3	1.50	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF RE: "CAPS".
300206.002	2/9/2000	3	2.00	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF REGARDING CAP ISSUES.
300206.002	2/13/2000	3	4.50	READ DEPOSITIONS AND WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF REGARDING CAPS YEARS.
300206.002	2/14/2000	3	1.00	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF AND EXHIBIT REFERENCES.
300206.002	2/15/2000	3	1.00	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF.
300206.002	2/16/2000	3	1.00	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION AND REVIEW ANSWER TO SECOND TIER CLAIMS.

300206.002	2/17/2000	3	0.75	WORK ON BRIEF FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT.
300206.002	2/21/2000	3	1.25	WORK ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF.
300206.002	2/23/2000	3	2.50	FINAL EDITS AND COMPLETION OF MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT.
300206.002	3/1/2000	3	2.00	MEET WITH ATTORNEY MICHAEL P. GROSS ON NEW CLAIMS ISSUES IN RE D.C.S./ALT. IHS CLAIMS.
300206.002	3/11/2000	3	2.50	LEGAL ANALYSIS ON 1992 AND 1993 COST ADVANCE PAYMENT YEARS' DAMAGE CLAIMS.
300206.002	3/11/2000	3	0.75	FOLLOW-UP ON DAMAGES ISSUES REGARDING CAP YEARS.
300206.002	3/12/2000	3	1.50	WORK ON BENCHMARKING METHODOLOGY (REVISIONS).
300206.002	3/13/2000	3	5.00	WORK ON DAMAGE ISSUES ON POST 1994 CLAIMS.
300206.002	3/14/2000	3	2.50	MEET WITH MICHAEL P. GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON DAMAGE ISSUES.
300206.002	3/22/2000	3	3.00	WORK ON DAMAGES ISSUE.
300206.002	3/23/2000	3	2.00	CONFERENCE WITH MICHAEL P. GROSS ON DAMAGE ISSUES.
300206.002		3	2.00	WORK ON PREPARATION FOR DAMAGE NEGOTIATIONS.
300206.002	3/27/2000	3	5.50	PRE-NEGOTIATIONS AND NEGOTIATIONS ON DAMAGES AND FOLLOW UP.
300206.002	3/28/2000	3	4.50	BENCHMARKING NEGOTIATIONS; PREPARATION AND ACTUAL NEGOTIATION WITH BIA/DOJ REGULATIONS.
300206.002	3/28/2000	3	2.00	WORK ON PRE-CAP DAMAGE ANALYSIS REGARDING RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER

300206.002	3/29/2000	3	0.40	MEETING WITH PAUL MOREHEAD ON RAMAH CHAPTER JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE.
300206.002	3/29/2000	3	1.50	WORK ON DAMAGE ANALYSIS REGARDING 92, 93 FISCAL YEAR CSC.
300206.002	3/30/2000	3	3.75	TRAVEL BACK TO ALBUQUERQUE FROM HOUSTON REGARDING RAMAH NEGOTIATIONS.
300206.002	4/1/2000	3	1.50	WORK ON DAMAGE ANALYSIS REGARDING 1992, 1993 FISCAL YEAR CSC.
300206.002	4/3/2000	3	0.50	FURTHER WORK ON DAMAGE ANALYSIS.
300206.002	4/5/2000	3	0.75	ANALYSIS OF DAMAGES/SETTLEMENT OPTION.
300206.002	4/8/2000	3	0.75	WORK ON DAMAGES LETTER.
300206.002	4/25/2000	3	0.20	CALL AND OBTAIN PRESIDENT'S BUDGET REQUEST LANGUAGE REGARDING JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	4/26/2000	3	1.00	WORK ON DAMAGES ISSUES - POST 1994 CLAIMS.
300206.002	6/6/2000	3	0.75	LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE.
300206.002	6/13/2000	3	2.00	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE PAPER; TELEPHONE CALLS TO JOE TRUJILLO, ANN Z LAND AND NELL ROGERS. O838XI
300206.002	6/19/2000	3	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE.

300206.002	6/21/2000	3	1.50	TELEPHONE CALLS TO EDITH BLACKWELL AND KAREN RICHARDSON; TELEPHONE CALL FROM MICHAEL P. GROSS ON RAMAH CHAPTER LAWSUIT SETTLEMENT OPTION.
300206.002	6/22/2000	3	1.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE, OIG, BIA ATTORNEYS, AND PLAINTIFFS' TEAM ON SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS; FURTHER ANALYSIS ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	6/27/2000	3	1.50	LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND; TELEPHONE CALLS ON JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	7/6/2000	3	2.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MICHAEL P. GROSS, LLOYD MILLER AND GOVERNMENT'S COUNSEL ON ALL RAMAH CHAPTER ISSUES.
300206.002	7/6/2000	3	0.50	TELEPHONE CALL FROM LLOYD MILLER ON DAMAGE CALCULATION FOR POST-1994 RAMAH THEORY CLAIMS.
300206.002	7/6/2000	3	2.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MICHAEL P. GROSS, LLOYD MILLER AND GOVERNMENT'S COUNSEL ON ALL RAMAH CHAPTER ISSUES.
300206.002	7/24/2000	3	0.50	MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND 1994 DAMAGES.
300206.002	7/29/2000	3	1.00	WORK ON DCSC CLAIMS/ISSUES WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	7/31/2000	3	4.00	TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO, FOR MEETING IN RE PREPARATION FOR STATUS CONFERENCE.
300206.002	8/1/2000	3	6.00	TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO, AND RETURN; PREPARE FOR JUDGE HANSEN STATUS CONFERENCE; ATTEND STATUS CONFERENCE; FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE CALL.
300206.002	8/1/2000	3	6.00	TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO, AND RETURN; PREPARE FOR JUDGE HANSEN STATUS CONFERENCE; ATTEND STATUS CONFERENCE; FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE CALL.
300206.002	8/2/2000	3	2.50	CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND TRIESMAN ON DCSC ISSUES.

300206.002	8/2/2000	3	0.50	FOLLOW-UP CALLS IN RE JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	8/2/2000	3	1.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH LLOYD MILLER AND ATTORNEY GROSS ON DCSC.
300206.002	8/7/2000	3	1.00	PRE-CONFERENCE CALL DISCUSSION WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; CONFERENCE CALL ON SURVEY SAMPLE FOR DCSC WITH ATTORNEY GROSS, KAREN RICHARDSON, AND LLOYD MILLER.
300206.002	8/11/2000	3	0.25	TELEPHONE CALL TO ROGOFF, ERICKSON IN RE STATUS OF DATA COLLECTION.
300206.002	8/16/2000	3	2.00	MEET WITH MICHAEL P. GROSS AND STEVE TUCKER IN RE RAMAH NAVAJO DISTRIBUTION AND JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	8/17/2000	3	1.00	ANALYZE AND DISCUSS JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE.
300206.002	8/22/2000	3	0.40	MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS/OTHER FOLLOW-UP RE MEDIATION FOR PENDING DAMAGE CLAIMS.
300206.002	8/22/2000	3	0.25	MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS/OTHER FOLLOW-UP RE JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	8/24/2000	3	0.25	DISCUSS QUESTIONNAIRE DRAFT IN RE DCSC WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	8/28/2000	3	0.50	REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING DCSC CLAIM.
300206.002	9/3/2000	3	0.40	REVIEW E-MAILS IN RE SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS AND DCSC QUESTIONNAIRE.
300206.002	9/11/2000	3	0.50	STATUS CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND TRIESMAN ON SETTLEMENT/MEDIATION ISSUES.
300206.002	9/12/2000	3	1.00	PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL; ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL ON MEDIATION AND DCSC QUESTIONNAIRE.
300206.002	9/17/2000	3	1.00	REVIEW/COMPLETELY REVISE/DRAFT STATEMENT TO MEDIATOR.

300206.002	9/17/2000	3	1.00	REVIEW/COMPLETELY REVISE/DRAFT STATEMENT TO MEDIATOR.
300206.002	9/18/2000	3	0.25	REVISE DRAFT CLAIMS STATEMENT FOR MEDIATOR.
300206.002	9/18/2000	3	0.25	REVISE DRAFT CLAIMS STATEMENT FOR MEDIATOR.
300206.002	9/19/2000	3	0.40	TELEPHONE CALLS IN RE MEDIATION ISSUES; REVIEW ATTORNEY MICHAEL P. GROSS'S STATEMENT DRAFT.
300206.002	9/19/2000	3	0.40	TELEPHONE CALLS IN RE MEDIATION ISSUES; REVIEW ATTORNEY MICHAEL P. GROSS'S STATEMENT DRAFT.
300206.002	9/20/2000	3	1.50	CONFERENCE CALL ON MEDIATION ISSUES.
300206.002	9/20/2000	3	1.50	CONFERENCE CALL ON MEDIATION ISSUES.
300206.002	9/21/2000	3	0.25	FOLLOW-UP ON MEDIATION ISSUES.
300206.002	9/21/2000	3	0.25	FOLLOW-UP ON MEDIATION ISSUES.
300206.002	9/28/2000	3	1.50	CONFERENCE ON MEDIATION AND ONGOING CLAIMS ISSUES WITH ATTORNEY GROSS AND OTHERS; FOLLOW-UP ON QUESTIONNAIRE.
300206.002	10/3/2000	3	0.75	WORK ON MEDIATION ISSUES.
300206.002	10/4/2000	3	0.75	WORK ON QUESTIONS/DCSC CLAIM.
300206.002	10/5/2000	3	1.50	WORK ON QUESTIONNAIRE, DCS, AND MEDIATION ISSUES.
300206.002	10/9/2000	3	1.00	FOLLOW-UP ON NEW CLAIM SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND SUBMISSION TO MEDIATOR.
300206.002	10/10/2000	3	0.20	WORK ON MEDIATION AND NEW CLAIMS ISSUES.



300206.002	10/12/2000	3	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON MEDIATION AGREEMENT SIGNATURES; TELEPHONE CALL FROM LLOYD MILLER.
300206.002	10/16/2000	3	2.00	LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	10/18/2000	3	0.60	MEMORANDUM TO ATTORNEY GROSS ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	10/18/2000	3	0.50	WORK ON MEDIATION SUBMISSION ISSUES.
300206.002	10/18/2000	3	0.25	MEMORANDUM TO ATTORNEY GROSS ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	10/19/2000	3	0.20	WORK ON SCHEDULING ISSUES REGARDING MEDIATION.
300206.002	10/22/2000	3	3.50	WORK ON MEDIATION STATEMENT.
300206.002	10/23/2000	3	1.00	WORK ON MEDIATION STATEMENT.
300206.002	10/24/2000	3	1.00	CONFERENCE CALL ON MEDIATION SUBMISSION REGARDING PENDING DAMAGE CLAIMS.
300206.002	10/25/2000	3	0.75	MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON MEDIATION ISSUES, SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND JUDGMENT FUND; WORK ON SUBMISSION TO MEDIATORS.
300206.002	10/27/2000	3	2.50	WORK ON SUBMISSION TO MEDIATOR.
300206.002	10/28/2000	3	0.40	WORK ON ISSUE OF DAMAGES RE: RAMAH THEORY.
300206.002	11/2/2000	3	3.50	WORK ON MEDIATION SUBMISSION.
300206.002	11/6/2000	3	1.25	REVIEW GOVERNMENT RESPONSE ON COPY ISSUE (1/2); FOLLOW-UP ON QUITABLE RELIEF (1/4); FOLLOW-UP ON DAMAGES DATA FOR RAMAH THEORY COST ADVANCE PAYMENT CLAIMS. (1/2)

300206.002	11/7/2000	3	2.00	WORK ON DCSC/FICA ISSUES (1 HR.)
300206.002	11/13/2000	3	0.40	LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	11/14/2000	3	3.50	WORK ON 1992/1993 DAMAGES ANALYSIS REGARDING IDC.
300206.002	11/15/2000	3	0.60	REVIEW AND WORK ON QUESTIONNAIRE SAMPLE LIST AND E-MAILS.
300206.002	11/16/2000	3	5.00	PREPARE FOR MEDIATION; WORK ON GETTING OUT NOTICE REGARDING QUESTIONNAIRE.
300206.002	11/17/2000	3	4.00	TELEPHONE CALLS AND FOLLOW-UP IN RE DCSC QUESTIONNAIRE; TELEPHONE CALLS AND LETTER TO SAMPLE TRIBES AND ORGANIZATIONS.
300206.002	11/19/2000	3	7.50	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO WASHINGTON, D.C. FOR DAMAGES MEDIATION (11/21/00) AND BENCHMARKING NEGOTIATIONS. (11/20/00).
300206.002	11/20/2000	3	7.00	MEET TO WORK ON BENCHMARKING DOCUMENTS WITH INTERIOR OFFICIALS; REVISE/CORRECT DOCUMENTS; FOLLOW-UP MEETING WITH INTERIOR OFFICIALS.
300206.002	11/21/2000	3	7.00	MEETING TO PREPARE FOR MEDIATION; ATTEND MEDIATION ON NEW CLAIMS.
300206.002	11/21/2000	3	4.50	TRAVEL FROM WASHINGTON, D.C. TO ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO.
300206.002	11/22/2000	3	0.30	CALLS ON DCSC QUESTIONNAIRE.
300206.002	11/22/2000	3	0.80	LEGAL ANALYSIS ON DAMAGES ISSUES FOR MEDIATION.
300206.002	11/24/2000	3	0.30	DRAFT FOLLOW-UP LETTER ON DCSC QUESTIONNAIRE WITH JOHN DONHAM'S CONTACT NUMBERS.

300206.002	11/24/2000	3	1.00	CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON MEDIATION ISSUES.
300206.002	11/26/2000	3	0.30	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT STATEMENT FOR 12/7/00 MEDIATION.
300206.002	11/26/2000	3	1.00	WORK ON 1992 AND 1993 CLAIMS ANALYSIS AND FOLLOW-UP LETTER TO SENATOR MITCHELL.
300206.002	11/27/2000	3	2.00	MEET ON MEDIATION AND DAMAGES ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP ON DCSC QUESTIONNAIRE CALLS.
300206.002	11/30/2000	3	0.30	FOLLOW-UP WITH ATTORNEY GROSS IN RE MEDIATION AND DOCUMENTS.
300206.002	11/30/2000	3	0.75	WORK ON 1992-1993 DAMAGES ANALYSIS.
300206.002	12/7/2000	3	0.50	FOLLOW-UP WITH PAUL MOREHEAD AND ATTORNEY GROSS ON JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	12/7/2000	3	4.00	TRAVEL TIME FROM JACKSON, MISSISSIPPI, TO WASHINGTON, D.C. FOR RAMAH MEDIATION.
300206.002	12/8/2000	3	1.00	FOLLOW-UP CALLS ON DISTRIBUTION ISSUES AND JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	12/11/2000	3	0.50	FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	12/14/2000	3	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND POSSIBLE LEGISLATION FIX.
300206.002	12/16/2000	3	2.00	MEET ON MEDIATION ISSUES (1/2 HOUR); MEET ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES (1-1/2 HOURS).
300206.002	12/18/2000	3	0.60	FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND AND STATUS CONFERENCE; CALLS TO U.S. ATTORNEY AND COURT PERSONNEL.
300206.002	12/20/2000	3	0.75	MEETING WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; TELEPHONE CALL TO RICH MYERS ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	12/27/2000	3	1.70	MEETING AND LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND; FOLLOW-UP LEGAL RESEARCH.

300206.002	12/29/2000	3	3.00	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES; LEGAL RESEARCH.
300206.002	1/9/2001	3	5.50	WORK ON ORDERS AND EXHIBITS FOR DISTRIBUTION AND COLLATERAL AND EQUITABLE RELIEF AND JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	1/9/2001	3	5.50	WORK ON ORDERS AND EXHIBITS FOR DISTRIBUTION AND COLLATERAL AND EQUITABLE RELIEF AND JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	1/17/2001	3	3.00	FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES; ATTEND MEETINGS AND CONFERENCE CALLS.
300206.002	1/17/2001	3	3.00	FURTHER LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES (IN EVENING).
300206.002	1/18/2001	3	0.50	MEETING WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; FOLLOW-UP RE JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE.
300206.002	1/20/2001	3	0.60	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE.
300206.002	1/20/2001	3	0.70	WORK ON LUMP SUM YEARS' CLAIMS.
300206.002	1/21/2001	3	10.00	WORK ON LUMP SUM YEARS' CSC CLAIMS AND SUBMISSION.
300206.002	1/22/2001	3	1.00	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND LETTER; ATTEND CONFERENCE CALLS.
300206.002	1/22/2001	3	0.50	CONTINUE WORK ON LUMP SUM YEARS' CLAIMS.
300206.002	1/28/2001	3	0.75	PREPARE FOR NEGOTIATION SESSION IN DC; ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR MEDIATION.
300206.002	1/29/2001	3	1.00	FURTHER REVIEW OF BIA PRODUCTION DOCUMENTS IN RE LUMP SUM YEARS AND REPROGRAMMING.
300206.002	1/29/2001	3	4.50	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO WASHINGTON, DC, FOR MEDIATION SESSIONS.

300206.002	1/30/2001	3	8.00	MEET TO PLAN JUDGMENT FUND STRATEGY; MEET WITH CONGRESSIONAL STAFF AND CONGRESSMAN JOE SKEEN IN RE JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	1/31/2001	3	7.50	MEDIATION ON NEW CLAIMS AND JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	2/1/2001	3	4.50	TRAVEL FROM WASHINGTON, DC TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO; WORK ON ORDERS AND CERTIFICATES REGARDING CERTIFICATION OF COLLATERAL ARRANGEMENTS.
300206.002	2/3/2001	3	4.00	LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	2/6/2001	3	0.80	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	2/7/2001	3	0.40	FURTHER FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	2/9/2001	3	1.00	WORK ON MEDIATION; WORK ON NEW DAMAGES ISSUES.
300206.002	2/13/2001	3	0.50	ANALYZE CLASS ACTION RULING IN IHS CASE REGARDING JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	2/14/2001	3	1.50	MEET ON JUDGMENT FUND STRATEGY ISSUES.
300206.002	2/15/2001	3	1.00	TELEPHONE CALL TO LLOYD MILLER AND BILL PERRY ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE; FOLLOW-UP WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	2/15/2001	3	4.50	LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	2/19/2001	3	1.00	CONTINUE RESEARCH ON THE JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	2/19/2001	3	0.50	WORK ON HIGH-LOW SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT.
300206.002	2/20/2001	3	0.70	LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND.

300206.002	2/22/2001	3	0.25	FURTHER REVIEW AND REVISION OF PROPOSED HIGH-LOW SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT.
300206.002	2/22/2001	3	0.20	DISCUSS HIGH-LOW SETTLEMENT DRAFT WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	2/23/2001	3	0.25	FOLLOW-UP WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON HIGH-LOW SETTLEMENT.
300206.002	2/23/2001	3	0.20	FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	2/25/2001	3	1.00	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES; ANALYZE ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS.
300206.002	2/26/2001	3	0.75	FOLLOW-UP ON HIGH-LOW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.
300206.002	2/26/2001	3	1.00	FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	2/27/2001	3	0.75	FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES AND SUBMISSION.
300206.002	3/1/2001	3	4.00	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUE; LEGAL RESEARCH AND WORK ON ADDITIONAL SUBMISSION TO GOVERNMENT.
300206.002	3/2/2001	3	1.00	WORK ON NEW JUDGMENT FUND MEMORANDUM.
300206.002	3/3/2001	3	1.00	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND MEMORANDUM AND ATTACHMENTS.
300206.002	3/6/2001	3	0.60	TELEPHONE CALL TO KAREN RICHARDSON ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES; FURTHER ANALYSIS WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND MILLER.
300206.002	3/6/2001	3	1.20	FOLLOW-UP ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES WITH ATTORNEY GROSS AND KAREN RICHARDSON; FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH LLOYD MILLER.
300206.002	3/7/2001	3	4.50	TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO, AND RETURN; MEET WITH JOHN ZAVITZ ON JUDGMENT FUND.
300206.002	4/16/2001	3	6.00	WORK ON DAMAGES ISSUES RE DCSC/LUMP SUM AND RAMAII THEORY CLAIMS.

300206.002	4/17/2001	3	2.50	ANALYSIS OF JOHN CRUZ LETTER IN RE LUMP SUM YEARS.
300206.002	4/18/2001	3	3.50	MEET ON LUMP SUM YEAR DAMAGES EVALUATION AND ANALYSIS.
300206.002	4/19/2001	3	6.00	1992/1993 DAMAGES DATA ANALYSIS.
300206.002	4/24/2001	3	0.60	ANALYZE SUSANVILLE OPINION IN RE RNC NEGOTIATIONS.
300206.002	4/25/2001	3	2.50	MEETING AND CONFERENCE CALL ON NEW CLAIMS AND DAMAGES ISSUES REGARDING MEDIATION.
300206.002	5/1/2001	3	2.00	MEET ON PENDING DAMAGE CLAIMS AND OPTIONS; DISCOVERY.
300206.002	5/3/2001	3	1.00	CONFERENCE CALL ON MEDIATION AND DAMAGES ISSUES.
300206.002	5/11/2001	3	2.50	CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON FURTHER DISCOVERY AND DAMAGE CLAIMS.
300206.002	5/17/2001	3	1.00	LEGAL RESEARCH ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	5/21/2001	3	0.20	CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON JUDGMENT FUND; FOLLOW-UP.
300206.002	5/21/2001	3	0.50	MEETING WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON NEW DAMAGES DISCOVERY.
300206.002	5/31/2001	3	0.75	CONFERENCE CALL AND MEETING ON DISCOVERY AND MEDIATION ISSUES REGARDING NEW DAMAGE CLAIMS.
300206.002	5/31/2001	3	0.75	CONFERENCE CALL AND MEETING ON JUDGMENT FUND ISSUES.
300206.002	6/12/2001	3	0.20	REVIEW STATUS REPORT LETTER TO SENATOR MITCHELL.
300206.002	6/15/2001	3	2.50	MEET ON MEDIATION ISSUES; START ORGANIZING DOCUMENTS FOR MEDIATION.
300206.002	6/16/2001	3	6.50	PREPARED FOR MEDIATION; DOCUMENT REVIEW AND ANALYSIS.

300206.002	6/17/2001	3	3.00	WORK ON PREPARATION FOR MEDIATION.
300206.002	6/19/2001	3	0.40	FOLLOW-UP WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON PREPARATION FOR MEDIATION.
300206.002	6/19/2001	3	0.60	FOLLOW-UP WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR MEDIATION.
300206.002	6/20/2001	3	5.50	FURTHER PREPARATION FOR NEGOTIATIONS; REVIEW GAO DOCUMENTS; RECALCULATE DAMAGE CALCULATIONS.
300206.002	6/20/2001	3	12.00	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO LOS ANGELES, CALIFORNIA; ANALYZE GAO AND THREE AFFILIATED DOCUMENTS; WORK ON REVISED SETTLEMENT NO. 5 AND SUBMISSIONS; MEET ON SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS AND ISSUES.
300206.002	6/21/2001	3	12.00	PREPARATION FOR MEETINGS; ATTEND MEETINGS AND NEGOTIATIONS ON CSC CLAIMS MEDIATIONS.
300206.002	6/22/2001	3	1.00	2 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH BRYANT ROGERS REGARDING COMMITTEE REPORT REGARDING 98 AMENDMENT. FOUND AND FAXED THEM.
300206.002	6/22/2001	3	10.00	PREPARATION AND MEETINGS AND NEGOTIATIONS ON CSC CLAIMS IN MEDIATION.
300206.002	6/24/2001	3	5.50	RETURN TRAVEL FROM LOS ANGELES, CALIFORNIA, TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.
300206.002	6/28/2001	3	2.00	WORK ON DRAFT SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION AND BRIEF IN RE CAP YEAR CLAIMS.
300206.002	7/2/2001	3	2.00	MEET AND ANALYZE EFFECT OF CHEROKEE NATION RULING ON PRE-CAP YEAR AND PRE-CAP YEAR DOLLAR CLAIMS.
300206.002	7/3/2001	3	0.60	FOLLOW-UP ON EVIDENCE RE DCSC/BIA SETTLEMENT IN RE SOURCE OF MONEY TO COVER BIA EMPLOYEE RETIREMENT.



300206.002	7/11/2001	3	1.00	LEGAL AND FACTUAL RESEARCH IN RE DCSC - HQ ON LOCAL MONEY TO COVER FICA AND RETIREMENT.
300206.002	7/16/2001	3	0.60	WORK ON DCSC PROOF ISSUES.
300206.002	7/17/2001	3	0.90	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER; ANALYSIS OF DATA AND OPTIONS RE PROOFS ON DCSC SETTLEMENT.
300206.002	7/21/2001	3	4.50	RESEARCH OF FFS DOCUMENTS AND FMS AND OPM DOCUMENTS; REVIEW BIA FIN. MGR. HANDBOOK; ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR FURTHER ANALYSIS ON DCSC AND LUMP YEARS CONTINGENT SETTLEMENT.
300206.002	7/23/2001	3	1.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN RE DCSC CLAIM; TELEPHONE CALL TO LLOYD MILLER; TELEPHONE CALL FROM ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	7/24/2001	3	1.00	FURTHER ANALYSIS OF DCSC DOCUMENTS ON PRE-CAP SETTLEMENT.
300206.002	7/26/2001	3	0.60	FOLLOW-UP ON SETTLEMENT ISSUES DATA FOR DISTRIBUTION ON NEW PSA (LUMP SUM YEARS).
300206.002	8/7/31/2001	3	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL T ZAVITZ; WORK ON 1992-1993 SETTLEMENT ISSUES.
300206.002	9/1/2001	3	5.00	REVIEW PROPOSED SECOND PSA AND REVISE; WORK ON NEW APPENDIX D; REVIEW WITH ATTORNEY MICHAEL P. GROSS.
300206.002	9/6/2001	3	0.50	DISCUSS \$29 MILLION SETTLEMENT ISSUES WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	9/14/2001	3	1.50	CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL ON RAMAH CHAPTER SECOND PSA.
300206.002	9/19/2001	3	0.50	TELEPHONE CALL TO ATTORNEY GROSS ON CONTRACT DISPUTE ISSUES REGARDING RNC CLAIMS.
300206.002	10/3/2001	3	1.00	LEGAL ANALYSIS; WORK ON IHS/CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF RE NEW RAMAH CLAIMS/SETTLEMENT.
300206.002	10/6/2001	3	0.35	WORK ON ORGANIZING DOCUMENTS IN RE SECOND PSA AND EQUITABLE RELIEF, ETC.
300206.002	10/14/2001	3	2.00	WORK ON APPENDIX D AND BENCHMARKING PROTOCOL DOCUMENT.

300206.002	10/15/2001	3	1.00	FURTHER WORK ON APPENDIX D DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY.
300206.002	10/22/2001	3	1.00	WORK ON NEW APPENDIX D ON NEW PSA FOR SECOND PARTIAL SETTLEMENT.
300206.002	10/31/2001	3	1.00	WORK ON APPENDIX D REVISIONS FOR SECOND PSA.
300206.002	10/31/2001	3	0.40	WORK ON PROTOCOL AND ISSUES/PROCEDURES REGARDING SECOND DISTRIBUTION FOR FIRST PSA.
300206.002	10/31/2001	3	1.00	WORK ON APPENDIX D REVISIONS WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	11/1/2001	3	1.50	FURTHER REVISIONS TO APPENDIX D TO SECOND PSA.
300206.002	11/2/2001	3	0.50	FURTHER REVISIONS TO APPENDIX D.
300206.002	11/3/2001	3	0.60	WORK ON REVISIONS TO APPENDIX D FOR SECOND PSA.
300206.002	11/9/2001	3	1.50	REVIEW AND NOTE RECOMMENDED REVISIONS IN PROPOSED DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE FORM OF SECOND PSA; REVIEW WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	11/12/2001	3	0.40	TELEPHONE CALL FROM ATTORNEY GROSS AND ERIC TRIESMAN ON SECOND PSA ISSUES.
300206.002	11/13/2001	3	2.40	ATTEND MEETINGS AND CONFERENCE CALL ON DRAFT SECOND PSA AND APPENDIX D.
300206.002	11/14/2001	3	0.20	FOLLOW-UP CALLS IN RE DRAFT SECOND PSA AND RECOMMENDED REVISIONS.
300206.002	11/15/2001	3	1.50	REVIEW SECOND PSA REVISIONS PER STEVE TUCKER; DISCUSS WITH ATTORNEY GROSS BY TELEPHONE CONFERENCE.
300206.002	11/20/2001	3	2.50	WORK ON SECOND PSA REVISIONS.
300206.002	11/21/2001	3	2.00	WORK ON REVISIONS TO SECOND PSA AND TO APPENDIX D (NOW APPENDIX G DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY).
300206.002	11/27/2001	3	3.00	WORK ON REVISIONS TO PROPOSED 29 MILLION DOLLAR SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS AND E-MAIL OUT.

300206.002	12/3/2001	3	0.40 FOLLOW-UP ON RAMAH SECOND PSA.
300206.002	12/5/2001	3	1.50 WORK ON SECOND PSA ISSUES.
300206.002	12/15/2001	3	1.00 WORK ON OPT-OUT AND CLASS NOTICE ISSUES FOR LUMP SUM YEARS.
300206.002	12/17/2001	3	12.00 TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO WASHINGTON, DC FOR RAMAH NEGOTIATIONS; GET MOTION FOR PARTIAL SUMMARY JUDGMENT FILED.
300206.002	12/18/2001	3	12.00 ATTEND NEGOTIATIONS ON SECOND PSA; WORK ON DETAILS OF SECOND PSA AND MOTIONS.
300206.002	12/19/2001	3	9.50 WORK ON NEGOTIATIONS FOR SECOND PSA; TRAVEL FROM WASHINGTON, DC TO BALTIMORE, MARYLAND (SECURITY ALERT DELAYED FLIGHT AND CAUSED ME TO HAVE TO STAY OVER AFTER FOUR HOURS AT AIRPORT).
300206.002	12/20/2001	3	8.00 TRAVEL FROM BALTIMORE, MARYLAND, TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.
300206.002	12/21/2001	3	1.50 WORK ON SECOND PSA, MOTION, ORDER, ETC.
300206.002	12/22/2001	3	2.50 WORK ON REVISED JOINT MOTION AND STIPULATED ORDER ON RAMAH IN RE SECOND PSA.
300206.002	12/23/2001	3	0.75 REVISE APPENDIX G IN RE DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY TO CONFORM TO NEW REVISIONS TO SECOND PSA.
300206.002	12/26/2001	3	4.00 WORK ON SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS FOR SECOND PSA AND PROCEDURAL ORDER.
300206.002	1/1/2002	3	1.00 WORK ON APPENDIX F - DISTRIBUTION METHODOLOGY.
300206.002	1/4/2002	3	0.50 MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL TO KAREN RICHARDSON ON SECOND PSA; WORK WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON APPENDIX F ISSUES REGARDING SCHOOL GRANTEEES.
300206.002	1/15/2002	3	0.50 TELEPHONE CALLS FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE COUNSELS ON SECONDS PSA ISSUES.

300206.002	1/15/2002	3	0.25	ATTEND STATUS CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT AND COUNSEL ON SECOND PSA/CAPS SUMMARY JUDGEMENT MOTION/EQUITABLE RELIEF AND SECOND DISTRIBUTION.
300206.002	1/15/2002	3	1.00	FOLLOW-UP WITH COUNSEL ON SECOND PSA AND RELATED DOCUMENTS; REVISIONS AND EQUITABLE RELIEF.
300206.002	1/21/2002	3	3.50	WORK ON SECOND PSA AND ATTACHMENTS.
300206.002	1/31/2002	3	1.00	WORK ON PLEADINGS AND ORDERS NEEDED FOR SECOND DISTRIBUTION PER FIRST PSA.
300206.002	2/5/2002	3	1.00	MEETING WITH INTERIOR AND DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE ATTORNEYS ON RAMAH LITIGATION
300206.002	2/19/2002	3	1.00	MEET WITH DOJ AND OTHER CLASS ATTORNEYS ON SECOND PSA
300206.002	2/20/2002	3	0.50	WORK ON JUDGMENT FUND PARAGRAPH FOR SECOND PSA.
300206.002	2/21/2002	3	0.50	WORK ON CLASS ACTION - SECOND SETTLEMENT ISSUES.
300206.002	2/23/2002	3	0.60	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT RAMAH SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS; REVIEW LLOYD'S DOCUMENT.
300206.002	3/4/2002	3	0.50	FOLLOW-UP CALLS WITH ATTORNEY GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON SECOND PARTION SETTLE ISSUES.
300206.002	3/14/2002	3	2.00	WORK ON PROCEDURAL ORDERS RE DCSC/ZUNI/RAMAH CHAPTER, ETC.; MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	3/15/2002	3	0.50	FOLLOW-UP ON PROCEDURAL ORDER AND MOTION.
300206.002	3/20/2002	3	0.80	FOLLOW-UP CALLS WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND RICHARDSON ON EXTENSION ON CHECK DISTRIBUTION AND NOTICE ON PROCEDURAL ORDERS.
300206.002	3/21/2002	3	0.50	ATTEND MEETING; TELEPHONE CALLS WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND RICHARDSON; FOLLOW-UP WITH JAN MITCHEL ON SECOND SETTLEMENTS ISSUES.
300206.002	4/2/2002	3	0.50	CONFERENCE CALL AND FOLLOW-UP CALLS WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND RICHARDSON ON SECOND PSA ISSUES.
300206.002	4/25/2002	3	4.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO WASHINGTON, D.C.

300206.002	4/26/2002	3	1.50	MEET WITH DOJ/BIA REPRESENTATIVES AND ATTORNEY GROSS AND M. JAFFE ON SECOND PSA ISSUES.
300206.002	4/26/2002	3	5.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM DOJ IN D.C. TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO
300206.002	4/27/2002	3	1.00	ORGANIZE ALL DOCUMENTS REGARDING SECOND PSA/EQUITABLE RELIEF/JOINT PROCEDURAL ORDER.
300206.002	5/26/2002	3	3.00	WORK ON ATTORNEY FEE AFFIDAVIT IN RE SECOND PARTIAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.
300206.002	6/7/2002	3	0.10	TELEPHONE CALL TO KAREN RICHARDSON ON SECOND PSA STATUS.
300206.002	6/24/2002	3	0.10	FOLLOW-UP CALLS ON SECOND PSA ISSUES.
300206.002	7/12/2002	3	0.30	DISCUSS SETTLEMENT DELAYS AND OPTIONS WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.
300206.002	7/17/2002	3	2.50	REVIEW E-MAILINGS, ETC, AND WORK ON APPENDIX F IN RE GOVERNMENT REVISIONS TO \$29 MILLION SETTLEMENT.
300206.002	7/18/2002	3	0.60	WORK ON APPENDIX F REVISIONS TO \$29 MILLION SETTLEMENT.
300206.002	7/18/2002	3	1.50	REVIEW GOVERNMENT'S PROPOSED REVISION TO SECOND PSA AND ATTORNEY GROSS; DRAFT LETTER; REVISE; FURTHER REVISIONS TO APPENDIX F.
300206.002	7/19/2002	3	0.70	WORK ON SECOND PSA ISSUES AND REVISIONS.
300206.002	7/24/2002	3	0.10	FOLLOW-UP AND CALL ON STATUS OF SECOND PSA IN RE REPORT FROM KAREN RICHARDSON.
300206.002	7/30/2002	3	3.00	MEET WITH GOVERNMENT ON SECOND PSA ISSUES.
300206.002	7/31/2002	3	2.00	MEET WITH GOVERNMENT ON SECOND PSA ISSUES.
300206.002	8/2/2002	3	1.00	WORK ON APPENDIX F REVISIONS.
300206.002	8/3/2002	3	0.40	REVISE AND FINALIZE APPENDIX F TO SECOND PSA.
300206.002	8/21/2002	3	0.20	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ATTORNEY GROSS, MILLER, AND RICHARDSON ON SECOND SETTLEMENT.
300206.002	8/27/2002	3	1.00	FOLLOW-UP WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON SECOND PSA ISSUES; CHECK EMAILS.

300206 002	8/28/2002	3	0.50 FOLLOW-UP ON OPTIONS FOR CONFIRMING SECOND PSA.
300206 002	8/29/2002	3	0.40 TELEPHONE CALL FROM KAREN RICHARDSON AND ATTORNEY GROSS ON SINGLE OPT-OUT FOR SECOND TIER CLAIMS; SEARCH FILES.
300206 002	8/29/2002	3	0.40 FOLLOW-UP ON SECOND PSA AND REVIEW E-MAILS.
<b>Grand Totals</b>			<b>562.45</b>