

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
10/01/2002	4	6.00	PREPARE FOR MEETING ON EQUITABLE RELIEF; WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES, BENCHMARKING AND CARRY FORWARDS WITH MARCEL KERKMANS AND ATTORNEY GROSS.	908
10/02/2002	4	1.50	FOLLOW-UP WITH SUSAN HANSEN ON IF, THEN STATEMENTS IN OIG'S WEBSITE.	911
10/03/2002	4	0.75	FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES IN RE BENCHMARKING AND CARRY FORWARD AND EXPERTS.	915
10/04/2002	4	2.00	WORK ON COST APPLICATIONS AND ORDERS REGARDING EQUITABLE RELIEF AND IMPLEMENTATION AFTER FIRST PSA.	913
10/13/2002	4	0.50	REVIEW OF OIG TEMPLATE, ANALYSIS AND TEMPLATES FROM SUSAN HANSEN AND MARCEL KERKMANS.	924
10/15/2002	4	4.50	FOLLOW-UP TELEPHONE CALLS AND WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF; REVIEW EQUITABLE RELIEF DOCUMENTS; PREPARE FOR NCAI CSC WORK GROUP.	923
10/15/2002	4	3.50	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES AND ANALYSIS.	926
10/16/2002	4	0.75	FOLLOW-UP ON EXPERTS' COST ON EQUITABLE RELIEF AND CLASS MONITOR'S CONTRACT ON SECOND PSA; FOLLOW-UP ON REPORT TO THE COURT ON CRIS AND WELL FARGO ACCOUNTS.	920
10/16/2002	4	10.00	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO TUCSON, ARIZONA, FOR NCAI WORK GROUP AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE SESSION ON EQUITABLE RELIEF; WORK WITH MARCEL KERKMANS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES; MEET WITH GREG ANDERSON, BILL PARKHURST, AND MARCEL KERKMANS ON BENCHMARKING AND CARRY FORWARD ISSUES.	927
10/17/2002	4	12.50	MEET ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES WITH MARCEL KERKMANS, GREG ANDERSON, TOM ALLEN, AND BILL PARKHURST; PRESENT ISSUES TO NCAI CSC WORK GROUP; RETURN TO SANTA FE FROM TUCSON.	928
10/18/2002	4	0.60	FOLLOW-UP DISCUSSIONS AND CALLS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	929
10/20/2002	4	1.50	WORK ON NEW MEMORANDUM ON CARRY FORWARD AND BENCHMARKING PROBLEMS AND NEW PROPOSAL; FURTHER ANALYSIS OF BENCHMARKING AND CARRY FORWARD ISSUES.	930
10/21/2002	4	1.50	REVIEW AND REVISE RAMAH MEMORANDUM ON BENCHMARKING, ETC.; DISCUSS WITH ATTORNEY GROSS.	933
10/22/2002	4	1.50	WORK WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; TELEPHONE CALLS AND CONFERENCES WITH LORI VASSAR ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	931
10/23/2002	4	10.50	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	932
10/25/2002	4	1.00	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ANALYSIS.	934
10/29/2002	4	0.60	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ANALYSIS.	935
10/29/2002	4	5.50	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES/SCHEDULES/TEMPLATES AND ANALYSIS TO SEND TO OIG AND DOJ.	937
10/30/2002	4	12.00	WORK ON MEMO AND TEMPLATES/SAMPLES FOR SUBMISSION TO OIG ON BENCHMARKING AND CARRY-FORWARD.	938
10/31/2002	4	4.00	WORK ON SCENARIOS TO DEMONSTRATE CARRY-FORWARD AND BENCHMARKING ISSUES; WORK ON MEMO REGARDING CARRY-FORWARD AND BENCHMARKING ISSUES; LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW NAVUMSA REPORT.	939
11/01/2002	4	6.00	WORK ON CARRY-FORWARD AND BENCHMARKING ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS; MAKE CORRECTIONS; DRAFT MEMOS.	940



Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
11/02/2002	4	3.50	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF MEMORANDA AND ANALYSIS.	941
11/03/2002	4	1.00	WORK ON BENCHMARKING, CARRY-FORWARD, AND EQUITABLE RELIEF ANALYSIS, ISSUES AND MEMOS.	942
11/03/2002	4	2.00	FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES; ATTEND MEETING WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM TIM MARTIN, BILL PARKHURST, GREG ANDERSON AND MARCEL KERKMANS.	943
11/06/2002	4	1.00	FOLLOW-UP MEMORANDUM ON EXHIBIT E ANALYSIS FROM NAVUMSA REPORT AND THEORETICAL RECOVERY ISSUES.	944
11/07/2002	4	2.00	FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS ON OIG CARRY-FORWARD PROCESS AND TEMPLATE; CONFERENCE WITH MARCEL KERKMANS; FOLLOW-UP MEMORANDUM.	945
11/07/2002	4	1.00	ADDITIONAL WORK TO ANALYZE THE 1, 2, 3 CARRY-FORWARD VARIATIONS IN EACH SAMPLE SETTLEMENT.	946
11/07/2002	4	0.70	FURTHER WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF CARRY-FORWARD ANALYSIS.	947
11/11/2002	4	1.00	WORK ON IDC SCENARIOS AND REVISIONS; EXPLORE OPTIONS FOR FURTHER REVISION IN RE 1, 2, 3 VARIATIONS.	948
11/13/2002	4	0.50	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES IN PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE CALL ON 11/14/02.	950
11/14/2002	4	2.50	CONFERENCE CALL ON BENCHMARKING AND CARRY FORWARD ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP.	951
11/15/2002	4	4.00	DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO DOJ AND OIG ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	952
12/12/2002	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON SCHEDULING ISSUES REGARDING EQUITABLE RELIEF.	961
12/27/2002	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	962
01/08/2003	4	0.80	FOLLOW-UP RE EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES AND AMICUS BRIEF IN CHEROKEE.	969
01/13/2003	4	2.50	ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR EQUITABLE RELIEF DISCUSSION WITH GOVERNMENT REPRESENTATIVES; REVIEW DOCUMENTS.	970
01/15/2003	4	4.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO WASHINGTON, D.C. FOR EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	975
01/15/2003	4	3.00	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	976
01/16/2003	4	10.00	ATTEND MEETINGS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES WITH CLASS EXPERTS AND GOVERNMENT ATTORNEY AND REPRESENTATIVES.	977
01/16/2003	4	8.50	ATTEND MEETINGS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES WITH CLASS EXPERTS AND GOVERNMENT ATTORNEY AND REPRESENTATIVES.	978
01/17/2003	4	8.00	TRAVEL FROM DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE OFFICES IN WASHINGTON, D.C. TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO (FROM EQUITABLE RELIEF MEETINGS).	979
01/21/2003	4	0.60	RETURN CALL ON REDW BILL AND OCTOBER TEMPLATE BENCH-MARKING ISSUE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CALIFORNIA TRIBE.	984
01/24/2003	4	2.50	WORK ON BENCHMARKING ORDER ISSUE WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE AND ATTORNEY GROSS.	983
01/31/2003	4	2.00	MEET ON BENCHMARKING AND EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	987
02/05/2003	4	2.00	WORK ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO KAREN RICHARDSON'S BENCHMARKING LETTER.	991

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
02/06/2003	4	7.50	WORK ON RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE'S EQUITABLE RELIEF LETTER WITH ENCLOSURES.	992
02/06/2003	4	0.90	DISCUSS WITH GREG ANDERSON HIS E-MAIL ON BENCHMARKING.	994
02/08/2003	4	0.30	WORK ON RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE ON EQUITABLE RELIEF; WORK ON OTHER EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES PER EXPERTS' COMMENTS.	995
02/09/2003	4	6.50	FURTHER WORK ON RESPONSE TO KAREN RICHARDSON LETTER ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	997
02/10/2003	4	2.00	REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO KAREN RICHARDSON LETTER ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	998
02/12/2003	4	1.50	WORK ON MY LETTER ON EQUITABLE RELIEF TO KAREN RICHARDSON AND RECOMMEND REVISIONS TO MIKE GROSS' LETTER ON SAME ISSUES.	1000
02/14/2003	4	0.20	TELEPHONE CALL FROM MARCEL KERKMANS ON BENCHMARKING ISSUES AND OPTIONS.	1002
02/15/2003	4	0.75	DISCUSSION OF BENCHMARKING SYSTEM AND ISSUES WITH LLOYD MILLER BY E-MAIL.	1005
02/16/2003	4	0.50	RESPONSES TO LLOYD MILLER AND GREG ANDERSON; FURTHER E-MAILS ON BENCHMARKING AND EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1006
02/19/2003	4	0.40	REVIEW E-MAIL DISCUSSIONS ON BENCHMARKING AND EQUITABLE RELIEF OPTIONS.	1008
03/11/2003	4	2.50	MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE, BIA, NBC REPRESENTATIVES ON EQUITABLE RELIEF AND BENCHMARKING ORDER.	1012
03/14/2003	4	1.00	FOLLOW-UP CALLS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF WITH ATTORNEY GROSS AND KAREN RICHARDSON.	1014
03/15/2003	4	1.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND MILLER ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES; WORK ON LETTER TO THE DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE.	1016
03/16/2003	4	0.90	WORK ON DRAFT LETTER TO KAREN RICHARDSON IN RE EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1017
03/17/2003	4	0.40	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF LETTER TO KAREN RICHARDSON.	1019
03/18/2003	4	1.40	FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF, PROPOSED ORDERS AND LETTER TO KAREN RICHARDSON.	1020
03/19/2003	4	1.00	MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS; TELEPHONE CALL TO LLOYD MILLER ON EQUITABLE RELIEF; DRAFT LETTER TO KAREN RICHARDSON.	1023
03/19/2003	4	1.00	WORK ON FURTHER REVISIONS TO EQUITABLE RELIEF LETTER; TELEPHONE CALLS TO EXPERTS.	1025
03/20/2003	4	1.00	WORK WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF LETTER; MAKE REVISIONS; DISCUSS WITH GREG ANDERSON AND MIKE GROSS.	1026
03/21/2003	4	1.00	CONFERENCE CALL ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF WITH ATTORNEY GROSS AND KENTON KECKLER, CPA.	1028
03/24/2003	4	0.60	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH ATTORNEYS GROSS AND RICHARDSON ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1030
03/31/2003	4	0.40	MEET WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF; DRAFT INTERIM ORDER.	1035
04/04/2003	4	0.50	WORK ON BENCHMARKING INTERIM ORDER.	1038
04/05/2003	4	0.70	WORK WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON INTERIM BENCHMARKING ORDER.	1039

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
04/07/2003	4	0.40	REVIEW DRAFT NO. 3 OF INTERIM BENCHMARKING ORDER FOR RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF; FOLLOW-UP CALL TO ATTORNEY GROSS.	1037
04/14/2003	4	0.30	DRAFT LETTERS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF PAYMENT TO EXPERT; REVIEW EQUITABLE RELIEF STIPULATION.	1041
04/16/2003	4	0.70	REVIEW AND ANALYZE AND RESPOND TO GREG ANDERSON'S NEW COMMENTS ON DRAFT BENCHMARKING ORDER.	1049
04/17/2003	4	0.30	CONFERENCE CALL ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES WITH ATTORNEYS KAREN RICHARDSON AND MIKE GROSS.	1044
04/18/2003	4	0.40	REVIEW FAXES; FOLLOW-UP WITH SUSAN HANSEN ON RAMAH BILLINGS ISSUES RE EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1046
04/25/2003	4	1.00	WORK ON RAMAH BENCHMARKING ORDER; E-MAIL TO MIKE; TELEPHONE CALLS TO KAREN RICHARDSON.	1051
04/29/2003	4	1.00	CALLS TO ATTORNEYS GROSS AND RICHARDSON ON BENCH-MARKING/EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP ON E-MAIL ON BENCHMARKING SPREADSHEET.	1052
05/02/2003	4	2.00	REVIEW KAREN RICHARDSON E-MAIL DOCUMENTS; WORK ON RAMAH BENCHMARKING TEMPLATE AND EXHIBIT A NARRATIVE.	1053
05/03/2003	4	2.00	WORK ON AMENDED EXHIBIT A TO BENCHMARKING ORDER AND BENCHMARKING SPREADSHEET; DRAFT MEMO TO KAREN RICHARDSON; DRAFT OTHER MEMOS.	1054
05/05/2003	4	1.00	REVIEW BILL PARKHURST COMMENTS ON DRAFT BENCHMARKING ORDERS; FOLLOW-UP ON DRAFT AND ORDERS AND MEMO; TELEPHONE CALL RE MARCEL KERKMANS.	1055
05/06/2003	4	1.00	WORK ON RAMAH BENCHMARKING PACKAGE FOR DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE AND BIA, ETC.; TELEPHONE CALLS TO ATTORNEY GROSS AND BILL PARKHURST.	1056
05/07/2003	4	0.60	FOLLOW-UP; E-MAILS; TELEPHONE CALLS TO KAREN RICHARDSON ON INTERIM ORDER REGARDING BENCHMARKING, ETC.	1057
05/08/2003	4	0.40	WORK ON COST REIMBURSEMENT APPLICATIONS REGARDING ATTORNEY GROSS/EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1061
05/18/2003	4	1.00	REVIEW NEW BENCHMARKING DOCUMENTS FROM DOJ.	1062
05/20/2003	4	3.00	WORK ON BENCHMARKING - THIRD STIPULATED ORDER, NARRATIVE AND TEMPLATE; CONFERENCE CALL WITH KAREN RICHARDSON AND MIKE GROSS.	1063
05/22/2003	4	2.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH KAREN RICHARDSON AND INGA MONTICH ON BENCHMARKING SPREADSHEET AND EXHIBIT A NARRATIVE; DRAFT REVISIONS TO ALL BENCHMARKING DOCUMENTS AND E-MAIL EXPLANATION FOR REVISIONS.	1064
05/28/2003	4	1.50	FURTHER WORK ON ATTACHMENT 4 AND ANALYSIS OF PERCENTAGE CHANGE WORDING; TELEPHONE CALLS WITH KAREN RICHARDSON (AND INGA); REVISE AND FINALIZE BENCHMARKING ORDER AND ATTACHMENTS; DRAFT TRANSMITTAL LETTER.	1067
05/29/2003	4	0.60	ANALYSIS AND TELEPHONE CALLS TO MARCEL KERKMANS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH KAREN AND INGA IN RE FINALIZING ATTACHMENT 4 TO THIRD INTERIM ORDER.	1068
06/02/2003	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP/REVIEW ON BENCHMARKING TRANSMITTAL LETTER TO JUDGE HANSEN; WORK ON REVISED ORDER.	1069
06/13/2003	4	0.50	WORK ON LETTERS RE EQUITABLE RELIEF TO 55 TRIBES AND TO UNITED TRIBES TECH COLLEGE.	1070

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
06/18/2003	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES RE UNITED TRIBES TECH COLLEGE LETTER.	1075
06/23/2003	4	0.70	CALLS ON IDC - THIRD STIPULATED ORDER ISSUES WITH TIM MARTIN AND MICHAEL P. GROSS; FOLLOW-UP PER KAREN RICHARDSON'S E-MAIL.	1078
06/27/2003	4	1.20	FOLLOW-UP RE 2003 IDC RATES, 55 TRIBES ISSUE, AND FOOTNOTES ON EXHIBIT 3 TEMPLATE ISSUE.	1083
06/29/2003	4	2.50	FOLLOW-UP ON NBC EXHIBIT 3 FOOTNOTE ISSUE REGARDING EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1085
06/30/2003	4	1.00	MEET WITH MICHAEL P. GROSS ON FOOTNOTE ISSUES RE EXHIBIT 3.	1086
07/01/2003	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP ON 55 TRIBES ISSUE; LETTER TO 55 TRIBES ON PSA-2.	1087
07/01/2003	4	0.50	WORK ON CSF NOTICE AND CARRY-FORWARD ISSUES.	1088
07/02/2003	4	2.00	FOLLOW-UP ON ATTACHMENT 3 (EXHIBIT 3) FOOTNOTE 3 ISSUE; DRAFT MEMO AND REVISE ATTACHMENTS AND SUBMIT TO KAREN RICHARDSON.	1089
07/07/2003	4	0.40	REVISE AND FINALIZE EXHIBIT 3, FOOTNOTE 3 MEMO TO KAREN RICHARDSON; TELEPHONE CALL TO MICHAEL P. GROSS REGARDING BENCHMARKING ON SUBMISSION.	1093
07/08/2003	4	2.00	WORK ON POWER POINT PRESENTATION FOR RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF REPORT TO USET.	1096
07/08/2003	4	0.50	CALL FROM ATTORNEY GROSS AND NW INTER-TRIBAL COUNCIL ON 55 TRIBES' BENCHMARKING TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.	1097
07/14/2003	4	4.50	PRESENTATION ON BENCHMARKING REGARDING RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF TO USET REPRESENTATIVES.	1101
07/14/2003	4	8.00	TRAVEL FROM NASHVILLE, TENNESSEE, TO ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO (RETURN FROM RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF PRESENTATION).	1102
07/18/2003	4	0.50	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ATTORNEY GROSS ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1113
08/04/2003	4	0.50	CALL TO KAREN RICHARDSON ON 1) DATE FOR GLOBAL SETTLEMENT TALKS REGARDING EQUITABLE RELIEF; 2) BIA DISTRIBUTION WITH OLD RATES; AND 3) FOOTNOTE 3 CORRECTION ON ATTACHMENT 3.	1118
08/07/2003	4	0.20	TELEPHONE CALLS IN RE BENCHMARKING AND CFDA NUMBERS.	1119
08/08/2003	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF MEETING, DCSC, FOOTNOTE 3 TO EXHIBIT 3 TEMPLATE.	1121
08/11/2003	4	0.60	FOLLOW-UP ON 55 TRIBES' ISSUE; TELEPHONE CALL FROM FT. BELKNAP.	1122
08/12/2003	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP WITH TRIBE AND KAREN RICHARDSON ON 55 TRIBES' ISSUE, FT. BELKNAP.	1124
08/21/2003	4	0.60	CALLS AND FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1127
09/09/2003	4	0.50	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1130
09/18/2003	4	1.50	ANALYZE EQUITABLE RELIEF CARRY FORWARD ISSUES; PREPARE FOR SACRAMENTO NEGOTIATIONS.	1136
09/19/2003	4	4.50	MEET AND ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1137
09/21/2003	4	4.50	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO SACRAMENTO, CALIFORNIA FOR NEGOTIATIONS.	1139

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
09/22/2003	4	9.00	ATTEND NEGOTIATIONS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1140
09/23/2003	4	15.00	ATTEND NEGOTIATIONS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF; TRAVEL FROM SACRAMENTO, CALIFORNIA, TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	1141
10/30/2003	4	0.20	FOLLOW-UP REVISIONS ON STATUS REPORT TO COURT ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1143
10/31/2003	4	0.20	FOLLOW-UP ON STATUS REPORT TO COURT ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1144
11/07/2003	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP CALLS ON BIA DCSC POLICY DEVELOPMENT AND WORK GROUP MEETINGS.	1145
01/21/2004	4	0.20	FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1169
01/21/2004	4	1.00	PREPARE FOR NEW IDC EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CALLS TO MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS.	1171
01/22/2004	4	2.00	MEETING WITH MICHAEL P. GROSS TO IDENTIFY ISSUES AND PREPARATION FOR EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS IN WASHINGTON, D.C.; FOLLOW-UP WITH LLOYD MILLER AND MICHAEL P. GROSS.	1181
01/25/2004	4	4.00	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO WASHINGTON, D.C. FOR EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS (ONE-HALF TIME).	1172
01/25/2004	4	2.50	PREPARE FOR EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	1173
01/26/2004	4	7.50	MEETINGS AND NEGOTIATIONS ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1174
01/27/2004	4	8.00	MEETINGS AND NEGOTIATIONS ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES; ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM WASHINGTON, D.C. TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	1175
01/31/2004	4	1.00	FOLLOW-UP ON NOTES ON MULTIPLE RATE OPTIONS FOR RAMAH FIX VS. BENCHMARKING (EQUITABLE RELIEF) AND DCSC..	1180
02/06/2004	4	0.20	FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1185
02/19/2004	4	0.40	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1193
02/29/2004	4	1.00	WORK ON INTERNAL DCSC POLICY MEMO TO LLOYD MILLER AND MICHAEL P. GROSS.	1194
03/02/2004	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP EMAIL ON DCSC POLICY ISSUES.	1195
03/03/2004	4	0.60	WORK ON FURTHER ANALYSIS OF DRAFT BIA DCSC POLICY.	1198
03/04/2004	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP RE EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES RE BENCHMARKING IDC RATE.	1199
03/16/2004	4	0.50	WORK ON DCSC AND OTHER EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES; CALLS TO MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER.	1200
03/19/2004	4	1.50	FOLLOW-UP WORK ON DCSC EQUITABLE RELIEF POLICY OPTIONS.	1202
03/24/2004	4	0.50	WORK ON BIA DCSC POLICY ISSUES.	1203
03/25/2004	4	0.75	WORK ON BIA'S DCSC DRAFT POLICY ANALYSIS OF ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1204
03/26/2004	4	0.70	FURTHER WORK ON DCSC ANALYSIS AND ISSUES.	1206
03/27/2004	4	0.40	DICTATE FOLLOW-UP MEMO ON DRAFT DCSC POLICY.	1205
03/29/2004	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP ON DCSC POLICY ISSUES AND POSSIBLE SOLUTIONS.	1207
04/12/2004	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP AND RESPONSE ON BENCHMARKING NEGOTIATION ISSUE.	1209
05/06/2004	4	0.90	WORK ON CRIS ACCOUNT REPORTS TO THE COURT; WORK ON CHEROKEE AMICUS BRIEF.	1216
06/29/2004	4	1.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE GROSS IN RE CLASS MONITOR; CONFERENCE CALL WITH MARCEL KERKMANS IN RE	1228

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			BENCHMARKING/CARRY FORWARD ISSUES.	
06/30/2004	4	1.40	FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS, EMAILS AND CALLS ON BENCHMARKING CALCULATIONS AND BENCHMARKING TEMPLATE.	1229
07/06/2004	4	0.40	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MICHAEL GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1232
07/07/2004	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP ON EQUITABLE RELIEF - IDC AND DCSC.	1233
07/09/2004	4	0.50	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1230
07/09/2004	4	0.50	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES IN RE BENCHMARKING.	1235
07/15/2004	4	1.00	CONFERENCE CALL ON EQUITABLE RELIEF WITH CLASS COUNSEL AND DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE AND BIA COUNSEL.	1236
07/16/2004	4	0.90	ANALYZE BENCHMARKING CARRY FORWARD ISSUES IN RE EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1237
07/17/2004	4	1.00	REVIEW GREG ANDERSON'S MATERIALS IN RE BENCHMARKING/CARRY FORWARD EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES; CONFER WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1239
07/21/2004	4	2.50	WORK ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES; MEMO; CONFERENCE CALL AND FOLLOW-UP WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1238
09/06/2004	4	0.40	INITIAL REVIEW OF U.S. DOJ PROPOSAL TO RESOLVE EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES IN CLASS ACTION.	1241
09/14/2004	4	1.00	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES AND OPTIONS REGARDING GOVERNMENT'S MULTIPLE RATE SOLUTION.	1246
09/15/2004	4	1.25	FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS/RESPONSES ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1245
09/20/2004	4	0.50	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES AND ISSUES RE MULTIPLE RATES.	1244
10/30/2004	4	0.40	DO FOLLOW-UP MEMO ON BIA DCSC POLICY REVISIONS.	1252
10/31/2004	4	0.90	START REVIEW OF DRAFT DCSC POLICY; FURTHER WORK ON MEMO TO MIKE AND LLOYD AND MARCEL ON BIA DCSC POLICY.	1250
01/21/2005	4	4.00	MEET AND ANALYZE EQUITABLE RELIEF SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND OPTIONS.	1268
01/23/2005	4	0.50	WORK ON KAREN RICHARDSON LETTER RE RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS RE MULTIPLE RATES.	1269
02/06/2005	4	5.25	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO SEATTLE, WASHINGTON; PREPARATION FOR WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1270
02/07/2005	4	10.00	MEETINGS; WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES/OPTIONS WITH CLASS COUNSEL AND EXPERTS (IDC AND DCSC).	1271
02/08/2005	4	4.00	FURTHER MEETINGS/ANALYSIS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES/OPTIONS (IDC AND DCSC).	1272
02/08/2005	4	4.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SEATTLE, WASHINGTON TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	1273
02/14/2005	4	0.50	REVIEW EMAILS RE EQUITABLE RELIEF; DO RESPONSE.	1275
02/19/2005	4	1.00	WORK ON REVISIONS TO LETTER TO KAREN RICHARDSON RE EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1276
02/21/2005	4	0.70	REVIEW MARCEL'S E-MAIL; MAKE CHANGES TO RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF LETTER.	1277
03/07/2005	4	0.75	CONFERENCE CALL; FOLLOW-UP MEETING IN PREPARATION FOR RAMAH NEGOTIATIONS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1283
03/08/2005	4	8.00	MEETINGS/NEGOTIATIONS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF; FOLLOW-UP.	1281
03/09/2005	4	9.50	NEGOTIATIONS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ON IDC AND DCSC.	1282
03/10/2005	4	5.00	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO, AND RETURN; MEETINGS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF	1279

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
03/12/2005	4	0.50	RE DCSC (WITH LLOYD MILLER, MIKE GROSS AND EXPERTS. WORK ON PROPOSED EQUITABLE RELIEF ORDER RE CARRY FORWARDS.	1284
03/21/2005	4	0.20	CALLS WITH MIKE GROSS, ET AL. ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES, PROPOSED INTERIM ORDER AND TEMPLATE.	1286
03/22/2005	4	1.50	FOLLOW-UP ON DCSC AND RELATED ISSUES; CALL TO DOJ ON CARRY FORWARD TEMPLATE; CALLS ON BRIEF SCHEDULING, ETC. ON RAMAH CAP CLAIMS.	1288
03/29/2005	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP IN RE EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1291
03/30/2005	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP CALLS WITH HOBBS, STRAUS, DEAN & WALKER AND MIKE GROSS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1292
02/17/2006	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS AND E-MAILS RE BIA DCSC POLICY AND 2006/2007 APPROPRIATIONS.	1347
02/18/2006	4	0.60	FURTHER ANALYSIS AND E-MAILS ON BIA-CSC POLICY PROBLEMS AND ISSUES.	1348
06/09/2006	4	0.60	FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON DCSC CLAIM/CSC CIRCULAR AND NEED TO FILE SOMETHING WITH COURT IN RE EFFECT OF CSC CIRCULAR ON RAMAH DCSC CIRCULAR.	1370
06/12/2006	4	0.50	WORK ON REPORT TO COURT ON DCSC CLAIMS; CALLS; E-MAIL TO LLOYD MILLER.	1371
06/12/2006	4	1.50	FOLLOW--UP DISCUSSION AND ANALYSIS IN RE DCSC ISSUES AND REPORT TO COURT WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER.	1372
06/14/2006	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP E-MAILS ON RAMAH DCSC STATUS REPORT.	1373
06/22/2006	4	0.30	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FINAL DRAFT OF REPORT TO COURT ON DCSC; FOLLOW-UP E-MAILS.	1374
06/23/2006	4	0.20	REVIEW, OK FINAL REVISED REPORT TO THE COURT ON RAMAH DCSC-CSC POLICY.	1375
08/11/2006	4	1.25	CONFER WITH MIKE GROSS ON CF ANALYSIS RE NBC TEMPLATE.	1377
08/15/2006	4	0.50	REVIEW ZUNI DOCUMENTS, OIG DOCUMENTS IN RE CF CALCULATIONS; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1378
09/02/2006	4	1.50	WORK ON OPTIONS TO RESPOND TO JUDGE HANSEN'S STATUS INQUIRY RE THINGS TO DO TO FINISH THE CASE.	1379
09/04/2006	4	2.50	ANALYSIS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH MIKE GROSS; MORE WORK ON OPTIONS FOR RESPONSE TO JUDGE HANSEN ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1380
09/06/2006	4	2.00	PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL ON OPTIONS FOR RESPONSE TO JUDGE HANSEN'S RULING ON CAPS; DO CONFERENCE CALL; ANALYZE EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1382
09/07/2006	4	0.75	FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE CALLS, ETC. ON RAMAH COURT ORDER TO RESPOND AND SCHEDULES, ETC. FOR CONFERRING AND RESPONSE TO ISSUES; ANALYSIS.	1383
09/08/2006	4	1.00	ANALYSIS OF LEGAL ISSUES REMAINING IN RAMAH RE EQUITABLE RELIEF AND WHERE TO DRAW THE LINE.	1384
09/08/2006	4	0.75	WORK ON PROPOSED STIPULATED MOTION AND ORDER ON EXTENSION OF TIME AND OTHER RAMAH ISSUES; FURTHER WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1385
09/18/2006	4	1.50	WORK ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES AND OPTIONS; DO STATUS MEMOS TO ALL CLASS COUNSEL.	1386
09/24/2006	4	8.00	TRAVEL FROM ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO TO SEATTLE, WASHINGTON FOR RAMAH ISSUES' MEETING.	1387

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
09/24/2006	4	8.00	MEET ON RAMAH ISSUES AND ANALYSIS.	1388
09/26/2006	4	6.00	TRAVEL FROM SEATTLE, WASHINGTON, TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	1389
10/13/2006	4	1.25	CALLS AND ANALYSIS OF ZUNI CASE RULINGS IN RE IMPACT ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1397
10/15/2006	4	0.50	DISCUSS RAMAH SUBMISSION ISSUES AND OPTIONS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1393
10/16/2006	4	0.75	WORK ON ISSUES/OPTIONS FOR SUBMISSIONS TO COURT.	1394
10/16/2006	4	2.00	WORK ON RAMAH CLAIMS, ISSUES' LIST FROM SUBMISSION TO COURT.	1395
10/17/2006	4	2.50	MORE WORK ON ISSUES LIST FOR SUBMISSION TO JUDGE HANSEN; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS, LLOYD MILLER AND KR.	1396
10/19/2006	4	1.00	WORK ON DRAFT ISSUES SUBMISSION FOR THE COURT; CALLS TO LLOYD MILLER, MIKE GROSS AND KAREN RICHARDSON.	1400
10/20/2006	4	0.60	WORK ON DRAFT ISSUES SUBMISSION FOR THE COURT; CALLS TO LLOYD MILLER AND MIKE GROSS.	1399
10/21/2006	4	2.00	REVIEW KAREN RICHARDSON DRAFT ISSUES LIST; DO REVISIONS; REVIEW WITH MIKE GROSS; GET LLOYD MILLER'S INPUT; DO NO DRAFT.	1398
10/22/2006	4	1.75	WORK ON ISSUES SUBMISSION FOR THE COURT; CONFER WITH MIKE GROSS, THEN WITH LLOYD MILLER.	1401
10/23/2006	4	1.50	MEETING AND CONFERENCE CALLS ON ISSUES SUBMISSIONS TO JUDGE WITH KAREN RICHARDSON, MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER; WORK ON REVISIONS; FOLLOW-UP TO COMPLETE.	1402
12/04/2006	4	3.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS/DEPOSITIONS IN PREPARATION FOR RAMAH NAVAJO ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1404
12/05/2006	4	4.00	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR, PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETINGS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	1405
12/06/2006	4	10.50	TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE; DO RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	1406
12/07/2006	4	9.00	DO RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS; RETURN TO SANTA FE.	1407
12/08/2006	4	0.60	WORK ON DOUBLE DIPPING ARGUMENT ANALYSIS FOR RAMAH; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMAN.	1408
12/09/2006	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP WORK ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES.	1409
12/11/2006	4	1.00	WORK ON DOUBLE DIPPING ANALYSIS IN RE RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS; DISCUSS WITH MELANIE OSBORNE AND MIKE GROSS.	1410
12/12/2006	4	0.50	WORK ON RAMAH CARRY FORWARD/DOUBLE DIPPING ANALYSIS.	1411
01/22/2007	4	8.00	TRAVEL TIME FROM ALBUQUERQUE, NM TO WASHINGTON, D.C. FOR RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR NEGOTIATION PRESENTATION OF STATUS REPORT ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS TO BIA SELF-GOVERNANCE ADVISORY COMMITTEE.	1412
01/23/2007	4	3.00	ATTEND EVENING MEETING ON PREPARATION FOR RAMAH NEGOTIATIONS.	1413
01/24/2007	4	9.00	RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS WITH DOJ; FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS WITH RAMAH EXPERTS AND OTHER RAMAH COUNSEL.	1414
01/25/2007	4	9.00	ANALYSIS AND NEGOTIATIONS RE EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1415
01/26/2007	4	7.00	TRAVEL TIME FROM WASHINGTON, D.C. TO SANTA FE, NEW	1416

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			MEXICO.	
02/08/2007	4	2.00	WORK ON DOUBLE DIP CLAIM LETTER AND SF COL. EXAMPLES IN RE ONGOING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS.	1417
02/13/2007	4	2.00	WORK WITH MIKE GROSS ON ISSUES AND OPTIONS FOR RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF SETTLEMENT.	1418
02/17/2007	4	4.00	WORK ON ISSUES RE TERMS OF DEAL FOR RAMAH NEGOTIATIONS.	1424
02/17/2007	4	0.50	START ORGANIZING DOCUMENTS, ETC. TO TAKE TO RAMAH NEGOTIATIONS.	1425
02/18/2007	4	2.50	MORE PREPARATION FOR EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS IN RAMAH (IN SACRAMENTO)	1427
02/19/2007	4	7.50	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO SACRAMENTO, CALIFORNIA.	1420
02/19/2007	4	0.90	MORE WORK ON TERMS OF DEAL SUMMARY FOR EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	1426
02/20/2007	4	10.50	MEETINGS ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS IN SACRAMENTO, CALIFORNIA; FOLLOW-UP MEETING WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS.	1421
02/21/2007	4	6.00	MEETINGS, PREPARATION, NEGOTIATIONS ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1422
02/21/2007	4	8.00	TRAVEL FROM SACRAMENTO, CALIFORNIA TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	1423
04/10/2007	4	3.00	WORK ON FIRST CUT DRAFT FRAMEWORK ON THIRD PSA.	1429
04/11/2007	4	3.00	WORK ON THIRD PSA DRAFT FRAMEWORK.	1430
04/12/2007	4	3.50	WORK ON RAMAH PSA 3 DOCUMENT.	1431
04/17/2007	4	0.60	WORK ON CORRECTIONS TO MELANIE OSBORNE RAMAH SETTLEMENT POINTS MEMO.	1432
05/08/2007	4	4.00	WORK ON THIRD PSA.	1433
05/13/2007	4	3.50	WORK ON THIRD PSA FOR RAMAH.	1442
05/14/2007	4	0.70	FURTHER WORK ON DRAFT PSA-3 FOR RAMAH; ANALYZE; RESPOND TO MPG'S NOTES.	1443
05/15/2007	4	5.50	WORK ON APPENDIX A TO PSA-3 DRAFT.	1444
05/17/2007	4	3.00	WORK ON APPENDIX A AND TEXT OF PSA-3.	1445
05/18/2007	4	1.00	FURTHER WORK ON RAMAH PSA-3.	1446
05/20/2007	4	3.00	WORK ON APPENDIX TO PSA-3.	1447
05/22/2007	4	0.60	WORK WITH MARCEL KERKMANS AND MIKE GROSS ON CARRY FORWARD OPTIONS IN RE SIMPLIFIED METHOD OF MULTIPLE RATES; CALL TO MIKE GROSS.	1448
05/24/2007	4	8.50	NEGOTIATIONS WITH U.S. DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE ATTORNEY ON PROPOSED PSA-3 EQUITABLE RELIEF SETTLEMENT.	1440
05/25/2007	4	8.00	NEGOTIATIONS WITH U.S. DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE ATTORNEY ON PROPOSED PSA-3 EQUITABLE RELIEF SETTLEMENT.	1439
05/26/2007	4	1.00	DETAILED REVIEW WITH MARCEL KERKMANS ON ALAMO AND MULTIPLE RATE OPTIONS/ISSUES TO ADDRESS.	1441
05/27/2007	4	2.00	WORK ON MULTIPLE RATE AND CARRY FORWARD ISSUES.	1437
05/27/2007	4	3.00	MORE WORK ON MULTIPLE RATE AND CARRY FORWARD SETTLEMENT LANGUAGE.	1438
05/28/2007	4	7.00	WORK ON PSA-3 DOCUMENTS AND APPENDICES.	1435
05/29/2007	4	1.00	WORK ON REVISIONS IN RE PSA-3 WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1434
05/29/2007	14	2.50	WORK ON EXCEL FORMULA FOR CARRYFORWARD CALCULATION WITH MARCEL KERKMANS	1436

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
05/30/2007	4	1.50	REVIEW MARCEL KERKMANS DRAFT TEMPLATES; DISCUSS CHANGES/OPTIONS/CORRECTIONS WITH MARCEL.	1450
06/01/2007	4	6.00	WORK WITH KAREN RICHARDSON OF DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE ON PSA-3 ISSUES/TEMPLATES.	1449
06/02/2007	4	1.00	ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR SACRAMENTO TRIP FOR RAMAH NEGOTIATIONS RE EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1451
06/03/2007	4	8.50	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO SACRAMENTO, CALIFORNIA -- DOUBLETREE HOTEL.	1452
06/04/2007	4	8.00	MEETINGS AND NEGOTIATIONS ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF (IN SACRAMENTO).	1453
06/05/2007	4	14.00	MEETINGS AND NEGOTIATIONS ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF IN SACRAMENTO; TRAVEL: RETURN TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	1454
06/06/2007	4	0.60	REVIEW NEGOTIATION STATUS WITH LLOYD MILLER IN PREPARATION FOR EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS IN SEATTLE.	1455
06/07/2007	4	5.00	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO SEATTLE, WASHINGTON (KATZEN AND KANJI LAW OFFICES) FOR RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	1456
06/07/2007	4	4.00	WORK ON EQUITABLE RELIEF/PSA-3 WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER; DISCUSSIONS WITH KAREN RICHARDSON.	1457
06/08/2007	4	7.00	NEGOTIATIONS WITH KAREN RICHARDSON ON PSA-3 RE EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1458
06/09/2007	4	5.00	TRAVEL FROM SEATTLE, WASHINGTON (SILVER CLOUD HOTEL) TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO - RETURN FROM RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	1459
06/10/2007	4	0.50	WORK ON MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME; MEET WITH MIKE GROSS ON PSA-3.	1460
06/10/2007	4	1.50	FINAL NCAI SUB ACCOUNT PAYMENT DOCUMENTATION AND FAX TO CO-COUNSEL IN RE PSA-3.	1461
06/11/2007	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP CALLS/EMAILS ON NCAI CONTRACT AND PAYMENT ISSUES IN RE PSA-3.	1462
06/12/2007	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP AND EMAILS IN RE NCAI SUB-ACCOUNT MONEY RELEVANT TO PSA-3 ISSUES.	1463
06/12/2007	4	0.70	DO BILLING SUBMISSION ON MARCEL KERKMANS.	1464
06/20/2007	4	1.20	PREPARE FOR AND DO CONFERENCE CALL ON RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE, MIKE GROSS; FOLLOW-UP EMAILS, ETC., WITH LLOYD MILLER.	1466
07/11/2007	4	0.20	FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS ON STATUS ISSUES RE EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS/DRAFTING.	1467
07/23/2007	4	0.50	WORK ON PSA-1 AND PSA-2 REPORTS.	1468
08/11/2007	4	1.00	ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS TO REVIEW LANGUAGE TO D.C. FOR RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	1469
08/13/2007	4	5.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO WASHINGTON, D.C. (COURTYARD/MARRIOTT HOTEL).	1470
08/13/2007	4	2.00	REVIEW/ANALYZE 6/7/07 DRAFT OF PSA-III AND MAKE NOTES FOR DISCUSSION.	1471
08/14/2007	4	7.00	NEGOTIATIONS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF WITH THE DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE, DEPARTMENT OF INTERIOR SOLICITOR AND CLASS COUNSEL.	1472
08/15/2007	4	7.00	NEGOTIATIONS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF WITH THE DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE, DEPARTMENT OF INTERIOR SOLICITOR, NBC, CLASS CONSULTANTS AND CLASS COUNSEL.	1473

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
08/16/2007	4	7.50	NEGOTIATIONS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE/DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR REPRESENTATIVES.	1474
08/17/2007	4	7.50	NEGOTIATIONS ON EQUITABLE RELIEF WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE/DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR REPRESENTATIVES.	1475
08/17/2007	4	5.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM WASHINGTON, D.C. TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	1476
08/18/2007	4	0.50	ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR FOLLOW-UP AND BRIEFING MIKE GROSS ON STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS.	1477
08/20/2007	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON RAMAH PSA-III AND KAREN'S EMAIL.	1478
08/21/2007	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP WORK ON PSA-III AND APPENDICES VIA EMAILS AND CALLS.	1481
08/23/2007	4	1.00	WORK ON APPENDICES TO DRAFT PSA-III.	1482
08/23/2007	4	1.00	MORE WORK ON PSA-III LANGUAGE AND FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER.	1483
08/24/2007	4	2.00	WORK ON PSA-III; REVIEW AND NOTE PROPOSALS; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER.	1484
08/26/2007	4	4.50	WORK ON PSA-III EDITS AND MEET WITH MIKE GROSS ON PSA-III EDITS.	1485
08/27/2007	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS ON SCHEDULING TO DO PSA-III REVIEW AND DISCUSSION.	1486
08/27/2007	4	1.00	REVIEW LLOYD MILLER EDITS OF BRYANT ROGER/MIKE GROSS EDITS OF KAREN RICHARDSON DRAFT 10 OF PSA-III AND DO EMAIL RESPONSES.	1487
08/31/2007	4	2.50	CONFERENCE CALL AND PRE-CONFERENCE CALL; DOCUMENT REVIEW IN RE PSA-III DRAFTS.	1479
08/31/2007	4	2.00	WORK ON REVISIONS, CREATING NEW COMPARE DOCUMENT FOR KAREN RICHARDSON AND 8/31/07 EDITS TO PSA-III.	1480
09/05/2007	4	4.00	CONFERENCE CALL ON PSA III DRAFT WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER; FOLLOW-UP AND DO REVISIONS; CREATE NEW REDLINE AND EMAIL TO KAREN RICHARDSON, ET AL.	1488
09/10/2007	4	0.60	WORK ON APPENDICES AND PSA-III DOCUMENT; MAKE RECOMMENDED REVISIONS TO DRAFT OF CLASS NOTICE.	1489
09/10/2007	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON MAILING LIST FOR CLASS NOTICE AND CONFERENCE CALL ON ARGUMENTS FOR 9/11 CONFERENCE CALL.	1490
09/11/2007	4	3.00	MEET WITH MIKE GROSS ON PSA-III ISSUES; CONFERENCE CALL WITH KAREN RICHARDSON, SABRINA MC CARTHY, MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER ON PSA-III NEGOTIATIONS; DO MOTION AND ORDER.	1491
09/12/2007	4	1.50	WORK WITH MIKE GROSS ON PSA-III DRAFTING ISSUES AND FOLLOW-UP TO YESTERDAY'S CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE; FOLLOW-UP EMAILS.	1492
09/13/2007	4	1.50	MORE WORK ON PSA-III DRAFTING ISSUES; EMAIL EXCHANGES RE PARTICULAR SECTIONS AND SCHEDULES.	1493
09/13/2007	4	1.00	PREPARE FOR AND DO FURTHER CONFERENCE CALL ON PSA-III ISSUES WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER.	1494
09/14/2007	4	0.60	WORK ON PSA-III REVISIONS; EMAIL TO KAREN RICHARDSON.	1495
09/17/2007	4	0.30	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE GROSS AND DAN McMEEKIN IN RE EQUITABLE RELIEF RELEASE LANGUAGE RE NBC AND IHS CONTRACTS.	1496
09/17/2007	4	4.00	MEET WITH MIKE GROSS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH KAREN RICHARDSON, MIKE GROSS, LLOYD MILLER AND LATER WITH	1497

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			MIKE GROSS AND KAREN RICHARDSON; FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS ON RAMAH PSA III ISSUES.	
09/18/2007	4	0.70	FURTHER WORK ON RAMAH PSA-III DRAFT REVISIONS.	1498
09/20/2007	4	0.50	WORK ON PSA-III REVISIONS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1499
09/24/2007	4	0.70	ANALYZE/DISCUSS DOJ'S NEW PROPOSAL (REHASH OF OLD PROPOSAL) AND LEGAL PROBLEMS WITH IT, WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS.	1500
09/26/2007	4	0.50	DOC. F/CDA ISSUES ANALYSIS FOR RAMAH PSA-III NEGOTIATIONS.	1502
10/03/2007	4	1.60	FURTHER ANALYSIS OF UNDER-RECOVERY SHORTFALL/CDA CLAIMS' ISSUE RE PSA-III.	1504
10/04/2007	4	0.60	FURTHER DISCUSSION WITH MIKE GROSS AND DAN MCMEEKIN ON CF/CDA CLAIMS ISSUE; FOLLOW-UP WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1505
10/08/2007	4	2.00	WORK ON PSA-III ANALYSIS RE CF.	1506
10/18/2007	4	4.50	REVISE WRITTEN ANALYSIS ON CF/CDA CLAIMS' ISSUES; MEET WITH MARCEL KERKMANS, DAN MACMEEKIN, MIKE GROSS AND ERIC TREISMAN ON CDA/CF DOUBLE RECOVERY ANALYSIS FOR PSA III SETTLEMENT.	1507
10/21/2007	4	4.50	WORK ON CF/CDA REMEDY SCENARIOS.	1513
10/22/2007	4	2.00	WORK ON CDA/CF EXAMPLES; CALLS TO MARCEL KERKMANS, ALL RE PSA-III.	1514
10/23/2007	4	4.00	WORK ON CDA/CF-U/R EXAMPLES RE PSA-III ANALYSIS.	1508
10/24/2007	4	2.00	FURTHER WORK ON RAMAH EXAMPLES AND MEMO.	1509
10/25/2007	4	2.00	MORE WORK ON CF - U/R ANALYSIS FOR PSA-III NEGOTIATIONS; TRANSMITTAL LETTER EXPLANATION.	1510
10/26/2007	4	0.50	ORGANIZE/REVIEW KEY DOCUMENTS FOR NEXT WEEK'S PSA-III NEGOTIATIONS.	1511
11/10/2007	4	1.50	PREPARE FOR RAMAH EQUITABLE RELIEF NEGOTIATIONS.	1515
11/12/2007	4	5.25	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO SEATTLE, WASHINGTON (SILVER CLOUD HOTEL).	1516
11/13/2007	4	7.50	ATTEND NEGOTIATIONS WITH GOVERNMENT REPRESENTATIVES ON PSA-III.	1517
11/14/2007	4	6.25	TRAVEL FROM SEATTLE, WASHINGTON (SILVER CLOUD HOTEL) TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	1518
11/27/2007	4	0.60	WORK ON RAMAH PSA-III ISSUES.	1519
11/28/2007	4	5.00	WORK ON PSA-III ISSUES AND OPTIONS; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1520
11/29/2007	4	0.70	WORK ON MEMO RE GOVERNMENT'S NEW PROPOSAL FOR SETTLEMENT (PSA III).	1521
11/30/2007	4	2.50	WORK WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS ON PSA-III (ANALYSIS OF GOVERNMENT'S NEW OFFICE).	1523
12/08/2007	4	1.00	MEET WITH MIKE GROSS TO FURTHER ANALYZE/SUMMARIZE KEY ELEMENTS OF THE PROPOSED PSA-III SETTLEMENT; REVIEW MIKE'S LATER BULLET POINT SUMMARY OF THAT SESSION.	1524
12/11/2007	4	5.75	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO WASHINGTON, D.C. (BALTIMORE) FOR RAMAH SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS.	1526
12/11/2007	4	2.50	PREPARE FOR NEGOTIATIONS ON PSA-III; REVIEW OF GOVERNMENT'S DRAFT 15.	1527
12/12/2007	4	7.50	NEGOTIATIONS ON PSA-III WITH DOJ (IN WASHINGTON, D.C.).	1525
12/14/2007	4	5.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM WASHINGTON, D.C. TO SANTA	1528

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			FE, NM.	
12/22/2007	4	3.00	DETAILED REVIEW OF DRAFT 17 AND AN MACMEEKIN'S EDITS OF DRAFT 17 OF PSA III AND APPENDICES A AND B.	1529
12/26/2007	4	2.50	REVIEW PSA-III ISSUES WITH MIKE GROSS; CALLS ON CF TEMPLATE ISSUES WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1530
12/27/2007	4	0.50	REVIEW AND REVISE PSA-III IN RE SPECIAL RATES SECTION; CALL TO MIKE GROSS.	1531
01/01/2008	4	2.10	REVIEW LLOYD MILLER'S EDITS AND MIKE GROSS' LATEST RELINE OF DRAFT6 FOR PSA-III.	1532
01/02/2008	4	3.40	WORK ON PSA-III REVIEWS/REVISIONS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1533
01/02/2008	4	2.00	WORK ON REDLINE COMPARE DOCUMENT AND REVIEW CHANGES.	1534
01/03/2008	4	4.00	WORK ON PSA-III AND APPENDICES A AND B; REVIEW DAN MACMEEKIN FURTHER CHANGES; CALLS TO MIKE GROSS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH LLOYD MILLER.	1535
01/10/2008	4	1.00	FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS ON APPENDICES A AND BE ISSUES/REVISIONS; CONFERENCE WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS.	1536
01/24/2008	4	3.00	WORK ON APPENDIX A AND APPENDIX B AND FAXES AND EMAILS RE ATTACHMENTS.	1541
01/25/2008	4	2.00	CONFERENCE CALL ON APPENDIX A AND APPENDIX B IN RE RAMAH PSA-III; DO REVISIONS AND EMAIL TO ALL.	1540
01/30/2008	4	3.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM MOBILE ALABAMA TO WASHINGTON, D.C. FOR RAMAH SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS.	1542
01/31/2008	4	7.50	PREPARE FOR AND DO SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH MIKE GROSS AND KAREN RICHARDSON.	1543
02/01/2008	4	3.50	ONE HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM WASHINGTON, D.C. TO MOBILE, ALABAMA.	1544
02/04/2008	4	0.60	CONFER WITH MIKE GROSS IN RE KEY ISSUES REMAINING TO RESOLVE IN RE PSA III.	1546
02/06/2008	4	3.00	WORK ON PSA III SETTLEMENT LANGUAGE; CONFERENCE CALL; FURTHER REVISIONS.	1545
02/07/2008	4	4.00	FURTHER WORK ON PSA III SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND OPTIONS.	1547
02/08/2008	4	2.90	FURTHER WORK ON PSA III ISSUES; CONFERENCE CALLS WITH GOVERNMENT ATTORNEY, MIKE GROSS, ETC.	1548
02/12/2008	4	3.40	MEETINGS AND CONFERENCE CALL ON PSA III SETTLEMENT ISSUES; CONFERENCE CALLS WITH GOVERNMENT.	1549
02/12/2008	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP CALL FROM KAREN RICHARDSON TO MIKE GROSS ON PSA III LANGUAGE.	1550
02/13/2008	4	0.60	FOLLOW-UP ON INTERIOR'S TRACKING GOVERNMENT TO GOVERNMENT CONSULTATION POLICY AND EXECUTIVE ORDER ON TRIBAL GOVERNMENT CONSULTATION; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1551
02/18/2008	4	1.00	ANALYSIS OF INTERPLAY BETWEEN AUDITS, CDA CLAIMS, NBC/CF/U-F DETERMINATION AND CAP ISSUES.	1552
02/25/2008	4	1.00	WORK ON RESPONSIVE EQUITABLE RELIEF ISSUES; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MOTION AND ORDER FOR EXTENSION.	1553
02/26/2008	4	1.90	REVIEW/WORK ON APPENDICES TO PSA III; GO OVER DOCUMENTS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1554
02/27/2008	4	0.80	WORK ON PSA III REVISIONS; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1555
02/28/2008	4	1.90	FURTHER WORK ON AND REVIEW OF RAMAH PSA III DOCUMENTS AND EXHIBITS; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS AND	1556

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			MARCEL KERKMANS.	
02/29/2008	4	6.00	MEET WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS ON RAMAH PSA III APPENDICES AND EXHIBITS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH KAREN RICHARDSON; CONFERENCE CALL WITH RAMAH EXPERTS AND COUNSEL; FOLLOW-UP.	1557
03/03/2008	4	5.00	WORK ON PSA III DOCUMENTS AND REVISIONS.	1558
03/04/2008	4	2.00	MEET WITH MIKE GROSS; DO CONFERENCE CALL WITH ALL COUNSEL AND NBC ON PSA III AND APPENDICES.	1559
03/04/2008	4	0.60	FOLLOW-UP REVIEW OF KAREN RICHARDSON'S DRAFT 26 AND EMAIL NOTES ON OTHER CHANGES; DISCUSS AND DO EMAILS TO MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER.	1560
03/05/2008	4	1.50	WORK ON PSA III ISSUES/REVISIONS; DO EMAILS FOR APPROVAL; CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE.	1561
03/06/2008	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP EMAILS ON PSA III REVISIONS; CALLS TO MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER; EMAIL TO KAREN RICHARDSON.	1562
03/07/2008	4	1.00	FURTHER CONFERENCE CALL WITH KAREN RICHARDSON AND MIKE GROSS ON PSA III REVISIONS/ISSUES.	1563
03/10/2008	4	0.60	WORK ON CHANGES IN PARAGRAPH IN PSA III ON CF TEMPLATES.	1564
03/11/2008	4	3.50	CONFERENCE CALL ON SETTLEMENT PSA III LANGUAGE WITH KAREN RICHARDSON, MIKE GROSS AND SOME NBC PERSONNEL.	1566
03/12/2008	4	3.25	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MIKE GROSS AND KAREN RICHARDSON AND RELATED CALLS IN RE PSA III; WORK ON REDLINES AND EMAIL TO LLOYD MILLER AND MIKE GROSS.	1565
03/13/2008	4	1.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH KAREN RICHARDSON AND MIKE GROSS ON PSA III.	1567
03/17/2008	4	0.40	WORK ON IHS/BIA WAIVER OF CLAIMS PROVISIONS; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1568
03/20/2008	4	0.40	WORK ON RAMAH PSA III CONDITIONAL WAIVER LANGUAGE.	1569
03/25/2008	4	0.30	REVIEW/COMMENT ON NEW PROPOSED REVISIONS TO PSA-III.	1570
03/28/2008	4	0.60	WORK ON REDLINES AND ORGANIZE EXHIBITS FOR COMPARISON RE PSA III.	1571
03/31/2008	4	4.40	WORK ON PSA-III EXHIBITS; REVIEW WITH EXPERT; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS AND KAREN RICHARDSON.	1572
04/04/2008	4	1.00	WORK ON PSA-III - EXHIBIT F - NOTICE TO CLASS.	1573
04/08/2008	4	1.00	ANALYSIS OF AND DISCUSSION WITH ALL CLASS COUNSEL ON PROBLEMS WITH PROPOSED FORM OF JUDGMENT FOR PSA-III.	1574
04/09/2008	4	1.00	FOLLOW-UP CALLS/DISCUSSIONS ON RAMAH FINAL JUDGMENT/APPEAL ISSUES AND RESEND CLAIMS ISSUE. MONTHLY STATUS REPORTS FOR PERIODS ENDING 1/30/08 AND 2/27/08 AND PSA-2 MONTHLY STATUS REPORTS FOR PERIODS ENDING 1/30/08 AND 2/27/08. CONVERT FOR ELECTRONIC FILING ALL EXHIBITS TO EACH REPORT THEN FILE MONTHLY STATUS REPORTS AND EXHIBITS WITH THE U.S. DISTRICT COURT OF NEW MEXICO.	1577
04/17/2008	4	0.70	ANALYZE/FOLLOW-UP ON RAMAH PSA-III EXAMPLES AND WORDING CHANGES PER GOVERNMENT'S REQUEST.	1576
05/14/2008	4	2.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MIKE GROSS AND KAREN RICHARDSON ON FEDERAL APPROVAL OF PSA-III/LOGISTICS RE SUBMISSION TO THE COURT; DO FOLLOW-UP EMAILS ON LOGISTICS.	1580
05/14/2008	4	1.00	REVIEW KAREN RICHARDSON'S REVISED JOINT MOTION;	1581

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			WORK ON RECOMMENDED REVISIONS.	
05/14/2008	14	1.30	SPEAK WITH COURT REGARDING THE PROCEDURE FOR FILING THE HARD COPIES OF THE EXHIBITS TO THE APPENDICES AND CREATE A DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING CD-ROM.	1584
05/15/2008	4	3.50	WORK ON ELECTRONIC NOTICE; WORK ON REVISIONS TO KAREN' RICHARDSON'S MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY APPROVAL; EMAIL TO MIKE GROSS, LLOYD MILLER AND KAREN RICHARDSON; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1582
05/15/2008	14	1.10	CREATION OF SUBSTITUTION PAGES FOR EXHIBITS TO APPENDICES FOR ELECTRONIC FILING.	1585
05/16/2008	4	1.00	CALLS TO LLOYD MILLER AND KAREN RICHARDSON; REVISE AND FINALIZE JOINT MOTION LANGUAGE; DO FAXES AND EMAILS, AND WORK WITH PARALEGAL ON ELECTRONIC FILING ISSUES.	1583
05/16/2008	14	1.90	CONVERT PLEADINGS AND ALL ATTACHMENTS INTO PDF FORMAT FOR ELECTRONIC FILING AND BREAK APPENDIX C UP INTO 3 DOCUMENTS TO MEET THE SIZE REQUIREMENT.	1586
05/19/2008	14	1.80	ELECTRONICALLY FILE JOINT MOTION, ATTACHMENTS AND NOTICE OF FILING CD-ROM WITH CLERK. CREATE CD-ROM'S FOR THE CLERK AND KAREN RICHARDSON.	1587
05/21/2008	4	3.50	WORK ON RAMAH FEE APPLICATION RE PSA-III.	1589
05/22/2008	4	0.75	WORK WITH MARCEL KERKMANS ON EXTRA EXPLANATORY TEMPLATES FOR CLASS WEBSITE; DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS.	1590
05/23/2008	4	4.50	MORE WORK WITH MARCEL KERKMANS ON EXTRA EXPLANATORY TEMPLATES FOR CLASS WEBSITE; MEET WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS TO WORK ON ADDITIONAL TEMPLATES.	1591
05/27/2008	4	1.70	WORK ON FEE APPLICATION AND SUPPORTING AFFIDAVIT.	1592
05/27/2008	4	0.20	WORK ON ADDITIONAL ILLUSTRATIVE EXAMPLES RE RAMAH WEBSITE; DISCUSS WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1593
05/28/2008	4	0.70	FURTHER REVIEW AND SUGGESTED REVISIONS RE ATTORNEY'S FEE APPLICATION; WORK ON AFFIDAVIT EXHIBITS.	1594
05/28/2008	4	2.00	FURTHER WORK ON ATTORNEY FEE APPLICATION.	1595
05/29/2008	4	0.40	FURTHER WORK ON FEE APPLICATION AND AFFIDAVIT EXHIBITS.	1596
05/29/2008	4	2.00	WORK ON EXTRA PSA-III EXAMPLES FOR CLASS WEBSITE WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1597
05/30/2008	4	0.60	WORK ON MARCEL KERKMANS AFFIDAVIT IN RE RAMAH FEES.	1598
06/04/2008	4	3.00	WORK ON AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF PSA-III AND FEE AWARD.	1600
06/05/2008	4	2.00	WORK ON AFFIDAVIT FOR PSA-III AND FEE APPLICATION.	1601
06/05/2008	4	4.00	LEGAL RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS IN RE BILLS OF COLLECTION/COUNTERCLAIM IN RECOUPMENT/CDA CLAIM AND COUNTERCLAIM ISSUES.	1602
06/06/2008	4	1.50	WORK ON AFFIDAVIT IN RE PSA-III AND LEGAL FEES REQUEST.	1603
06/07/2008	4	3.50	WORK ON AFFIDAVIT IN RE PSA-III AND FEE APPLICATION.	1604
06/08/2008	4	3.40	WORK ON AFFIDAVIT IN RE PSA-III AND FEE APPLICATION.	1605
06/13/2008	4	0.70	WORK ON NOTICE TO CLASS ISSUES AND MAILING LIST RE PSA-III.	1606
06/13/2008	4	4.50	WORK ON FEE APPLICATION, MEMO, AND AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF SETTLEMENT AND FEE.	1607
06/16/2008	4	1.50	WORK ON AFFIDAVIT EXHIBITS AND LANGUAGE IN SUPPORT OF PSA III AND FEE APPLICATION FEE AWARD AND CLASS	1608

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			NOTICE REVISIONS.	
06/17/2008	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON CLASS NOTICE AND PUBLIC ISSUES.	1609
06/19/2008	4	4.00	WORK ON AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF PSA-III AND FEE APPLICATION.	1610
06/21/2008	4	6.00	WORK ON RAMAH PSA-III AFFIDAVIT.	1611
06/22/2008	4	4.00	WORK ON RAMAH PSA-III AFFIDAVIT.	1612
06/23/2008	4	4.50	REVISE/FINALIZE RAMAH ATTORNEY AFFIDAVIT FOR PSA-III.	1613
06/23/2008	14	0.90	CONVERSION OF BRYANT ROGERS AFFIDAVIT AND EXHIBITS INTO PDF FORMAT FOR ELECTRONIC FILING.	1614
06/30/2008	4	0.50	RESPONSE TO EMAIL ABOUT RELATION OF TEMPLATE TO BODY OF PSA-III.	1615
07/01/2008	4	1.00	RESPOND TO HOBBS, STRAUS, DEAN & WALKER ANALYSIS OF PSA-III; SUGGESTION CORRECTIONS.	1616
07/10/2008	4	0.50	WORK ON NOTICE TO CLASS AND REJECTED MAILER ISSUES.	1619
07/16/2008	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP CALL AND EMAIL ON POSSIBLE RAMAH HEARING DATE.	1620
07/20/2008	4	0.50	PREPARE FOR CSC WORKGROUP MEETING ON RAMAH SETTLEMENT.	1623
07/21/2008	4	0.75	PREPARE PRESENTATION OF PSA-III TO BIA CSC WORK GROUP.	1621
07/21/2008	4	1.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NM TO ALBUQUERQUE, NM AND RETURN.	1622
08/05/2008	4	0.50	REVIEW MAILING LIST FOR CLASS NOTICE AND IDENTIFY ANY TRUE CLASS MEMBERS FOR WHICH THE MAILER WAS RETURNED; CONFER WITH SUSAN HANSEN RE AFFIDAVIT.	1625
08/12/2008	4	1.00	WORK ON DRAFT FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW RE RAMAH PSA-III.	1626
08/13/2008	4	0.30	WORK ON PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW.	1627
08/14/2008	4	0.30	MORE WORK ON RAMAH PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW WITH MIKE GROSS.	1628
08/19/2008	4	0.40	REVIEW BILL AND ORDER ON MARCEL KERKMANS; REVIEW CRIS ACCOUNT REPORTS.	1630
08/21/2008	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP ON PREPARATION FOR RAMAH PSA-III HEARING.	1631
08/22/2008	4	1.00	FURTHER WORK ON FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW FOR RAMAH PSA-III; CONFERENCE CALL WITH LLOYD MILLER AND MIKE GROSS.	1632
08/23/2008	4	1.00	PREPARE FOR RAMAH HEARING; FURTHER WORK ON FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW.	1634
08/24/2008	4	2.00	PREPARE FOR RAMAH PSA-III HEARING.	1633
08/25/2008	4	3.00	FURTHER PREPARATION FOR HEARING AND WORK ON FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW; CONFERENCE CALL.	1635
08/26/2008	4	7.00	TRAVEL TO ALBUQUERQUE, NM AND RETURN; DO HEARING ON PSA-III AND FEE MOTION; WORK ON ORDERS AND FINAL JUDGMENT; MEET WITH GOVERNMENT ON TRAINING ISSUES.	1636
08/27/2008	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP ON ORDERS AND RULINGS IN RAMAH; GET ALL OF THEM ON RNC SETTLEMENT WEBSITE.	1637
12/04/2008	4	1.00	FOLLOW-UP ON TRAINING MATERIALS AND IMPLEMENTATION OF PSA-III.	1671
12/05/2008	4	0.90	FOLLOW-UP ON RAMAH PSA-III IMPLEMENTATION/TRAINING MATERIALS AND CF CALCULATION ISSUES WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS.	1672

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
12/07/2008	4	0.50	CONFERENCE WITH MIKE GROSS AND LLOYD MILLER; FOLLOW-UP WITH NCAI ON SUBMISSION RE RAMAH SETTLEMENT INTO NCAI TRANSITION PLAN.	1673
12/08/2008	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON LAWSUIT SETTLEMENT OPTIONS IN RE NCAI TRANSITION PLAN.	1674
12/09/2008	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS ON MARK VAN NORMAN COMMUNICATIONS RE RAMAH SETTLEMENT.	1675
01/06/2009	4	1.00	REVIEW AND WORK ON TRAINING OUTLINE REVISIONS.	1676
01/07/2009	4	1.00	WORK ON ONE-PAGE BLURB IN RE RAMAH CLASS ACTION AND CHANGES IN TRAINING AGENDA; CONFERENCE CALLS; REVISIONS.	1677
01/08/2009	4	0.60	WORK ON ONE-PAGE BULLET POINT MEMO AND OTHER PREPARATION FOR D.C. TRIP ON SETTLEMENT.	1678
01/15/2009	4	1.50	CONFERENCE CALL ON TRAINING MATERIALS/ISSUES RE PSA-III.	1683
01/19/2009	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP ON RAMAH PSA-III TRAINING ISSUES/FUNDING ISSUES.	1685
01/19/2009	4	0.60	DICTATE FOLLOW-UP MEMO ON TRAINING MATERIALS FOR PSA-III.	1686
01/20/2009	4	1.00	WORK ON TRAINING AGENDA MEMO.	1688
01/27/2009	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON TRAINING ISSUES/SCHEDULING/CONFERENCE CALLS WITH GOVERNMENT.	1695
01/27/2009	4	0.90	CONFERENCE CALL ON RAMAH PSA-III TRAINING ISSUES; PULL TOGETHER NCAI DOCUMENT ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS.	1701
02/03/2009	4	0.60	WORK ON TRAINING LOGISTICS AND SCHEDULING ISSUES.	1703
02/05/2009	4	0.75	FOLLOW-UP WORK ON RAMAH TRAINING LOGISTICS/BUDGET ISSUES.	1705
02/06/2009	4	0.70	PLANNING FOR CALL ON TRAINING COST ISSUES FOR PSA-III.	1706
02/12/2009	4	0.60	WORK ON RAMAH COURT ORDER ON REDW COSTS RE PSA-III.	1710
02/17/2009	4	0.60	FOLLOW-UP CALLS ON (AND EMAILS ON) LOGISTICS FOR RAMAH TRAINING.	1711
02/18/2009	4	0.50	CALLS/EMAILS IN FOLLOW-UP ON RAMAH PSA-III TRAINING SESSIONS.	1712
02/19/2009	4	0.20	FOLLOW-UP ON TRAINING SCHEDULE/NOTICE ISSUES FOR PSA-III.	1714
02/20/2009	4	2.50	CONFERENCE CALL AND FOLLOW-UP ON RAMAH PSA-III TRAINING ISSUES.	1717
02/23/2009	4	1.00	WORK ON DRAFT TRAINING NOTICE	1715
02/24/2009	4	5.50	WORK WITH MIKE GROSS AND MARCEL KERKMANS ON DRAFT RAMAH TRAINING MATERIALS; DO CORRECTED MATERIALS	1716
2/25/2009		1.00	TRAINING MATERIALS AND NOTICE	
02/27/2009	4	0.20	FOLLOW-UP WITH MIKE GROSS ON TRAINING NOTICE FOR PSA-III	1721
02/27/2009	4	0.40	DISCUSS TRAINING MATERIALS AND MIX ISSUE WITH DORIS J.	1722
03/01/2009	4	1.50	REVIEW NEW VERSION OF (OFFICIAL) MATERIALS FROM NBC IN RE PSA-III TRAINING.	1723
03/03/2009	4	5.50	WORK ON PSA-III TRAINING MATERIALS REVIEW AND WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1725
03/08/2009	4	2.00	REVIEW/WORK ON DRAFT TRAINING MATERIALS AND TRAINING SESSION NOTICE AND CONFERENCE CALL; FOLLOW-UP EMAILS AND CALL WITH MARCEL KERKMANS.	1726
03/09/2009	4	2.50	FOLLOW-UP ON TRAINING AGENDA/TRAINING CALLS/TRAINING	1727

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			MATERIALS.	
03/11/2009	4	5.50	CONFERNECE CALL ON TRAINING AGENDA AND SCHEDULING; CONFERNECE CALL ON TRAINING MATERIALS WITH CLASS COUNSEL; FOLLOW-UP CALL TO REDW ON MAILING TRAINING MATERIALS NOTICE; DO CORRECTIONS WITH MARCEL KERKMANS AND KYLE BUYINGHAUSEN ON RAMAH MATERIALS.	1729
03/12/2009	4	2.00	FOLLOW-UP CALLS AND EMAILS ON RAMAH TRAINING MATERIALS AND NOTICE/REGISTRATION ISSUES.	1730
03/22/2009	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP ON RAMAH TRAINING MATERIALS AND NOTICE, ETC.	1731
03/24/2009	4	0.40	CONFERENCE CALL ON VIDEO ISSUE RE RAMAH TRAINING SESSIONS.	1732
04/04/2009	4	0.20	WORK ON TRAINING MATERIALS ISSUES.	1735
04/08/2009	4	0.70	WORK ON RAMAH PAYMENT MOTIONS AND ORDERS.	1739
04/09/2009	4	0.50	WORK ON RAMAH PAYMENT MOTIONS AND ORDERS.	1740
04/09/2009	4	0.50	WORK ON TRAINING MATERIALS ISSUES WITH NBC AND MARCEL KERKMANS PER CONFERENCE CALL.	1742
04/09/2009	4	0.70	WORK ON PAYMENT ORDER AMENDMENTS.	1743
04/17/2009	4	0.70	WORK ON TRAINING MATERIALS; DISCUSS REVISIONS WITH MARCEL KERKMANS AND DORIS JENSON; DO FOLLOW-UP EMAILS ON MATERIALS AND LIST OF ATTENDEES.	1745
04/20/2009	4	0.60	FOLLOW-UP IN RE SACRAMENTO TRAINING SESSION.	1748
04/21/2009	4	0.90	LEGAL RESEARCH FOR RAMAH TRAINING PER PSA III.	1749
04/21/2009	4	4.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO, TO SACRAMENTO, CALIFORNIA FOR WORK ON RAMAH TRAINING.	1750
04/21/2009	4	2.00	LEGAL RESEARCH IN RE RAMAH TRAINING MATERIALS/IDC RATE/APPEAL OF BILL OF COLLECTION.	1752
04/22/2009	4	6.50	PARTICIPATE IN RAMAH TRAINING PREPARATION SESSION AND FOLLOW-UP WITH NBC.	1753
04/23/2009	4	5.00	PARTICIPATE IN RAMAH TRAINING PREPARATION SESSION AND FOLLOW-UP WITH NBC.	1754
04/24/2009	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON AGENDA AND REGISTRATION ISSUES FOR TRAINING SESSIONS.	1755
04/24/2009	4	4.00	ONE HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SACRAMENTO, CALIFORNIA, TO SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO.	1756
04/27/2009	4	0.60	FOLLOW-UP ON RAMAH CLASS TRAINING ISSUES.	1758
05/03/2009	4	0.75	REVIEW/MARK-UP RAMAH TRAINING MATERIALS.	1764
05/04/2009	4	0.50	DISCUSS CHANGES TO RAMAH TRAINING MATERIALS WITH DORIS JENSEN AND MARCEL KERKMANS.	1765
05/12/2009	4	2.00	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE TO ALBUQUERQUE; ATTEND DINNER MEETING WITH NBC AND RAMAH TEAM.	1774
05/13/2009	4	8.00	ATTEND TRAINING CONFERNECE ON IDC.	1772
05/14/2009	4	4.50	RAMAH TRAINING CONFERENCE ON IDC; ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM ALBUQUERQUE TO SANTA FE.	1773
05/19/2009	4	0.60	WORK ON RAMAH TRAINING MATERIALS FOR PORTLAND TRAINING SESSION.	1771
05/22/2009	4	2.00	WORK ON TRAVEL REIMBURSEMENT CLAIMS FOR SACRAMENTO AND ALBUQUERQUE SESSIONS.	1775
05/26/2009	4	2.50	WORK ON BILLING REIMBURSEMENT FOR MARCEL KERKMANS AND SACRAMENTO TRAINING SESSION CONFERENCE.	1777
05/27/2009	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP ON PORTLAND TRAINING SESSION PREPARATION AND LOGISTICS ISSUES.	1778
06/09/2009	4	3.50	TRAVEL FROM SANTA FE, NM TO PHOENIX, AZ FOR IHS CSC	1780

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			WORK GROUP IN RE RAMAH SETTLEMENT IMPACT PRESENTATION.	
06/10/2009	4	8.00	ATTEND IHS CSC WORK GROUP SESSION ON '638 IDC ISSUES.	1781
06/11/2009	4	9.50	ATTEND IHS CSC WORK GROUP AND DO RAMAH PSA-III SETTLEMENT PRESENTATION TO WORK GROUP; ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM PHOENIX, AZ TO SANTA FE, NM.	1782
06/29/2009	4	3.20	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO MINNEAPOLIS, MINNESOTA.	1793
06/30/2009	4	9.00	ATTEND RNC TRAINING SESSION ON IDC.	1794
07/01/2009	4	3.50	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM MINNEAPOLIS, MN TO SANTA FE, NM/	1791
07/01/2009	4	4.50	DO RNC - IDC TRAINING SESSION.	1796
07/30/2009	4	0.60	FURTHER WORK ON DRAFT MOTION, ORDER AND EXHIBITS IN RE COST REIMBURSEMENT IN RE PSA-III.	1803
07/31/2009	4	1.00	WORK ON LEGISLATION FIX LANGUAGE FOR RAMAH PROBLEM AND LAW ENFORCEMENT MONEY.	1804
07/31/2009	4	0.50	FURTHER WORK ON DRAFT OF COST REIMBURSEMENT MOTION AND ORDER.	1805
08/01/2009	4	0.70	FURTHER WORK ON STATUTORY FIX FOR CAPS/IDC PROBLEM; FURTHER WORK ON TRAINING COST REIMBURSEMENT.	1806
08/26/2009	4	0.30	WORK ON COST FINALIZATION REIMBURSEMENT ORDERS; CALLS TO SABRINA McCARTHY RE NBC TRAINING COSTS TO ANNARAE STEELE IN RE NCAI TRAINING COST SUBMISSION AND CSC REPORT.	1808
08/26/2009	4	0.30	WORK ON PROBLEMS/REDW PAYMENT RE PSA-III.	1809
08/31/2009	4	0.50	CALL FROM SENATE COMM. STAFF AND PATTY MARKS ON RAMAH FIX STATUTE RE IDC AND CAPS.	1810
09/01/2009	4	1.00	FURTHER WORK ON POSSIBLE RAMAH FIX LEGISLATION.	1811
09/15/2009	4	0.50	REVIEW DRAFT NCAI CSC WORK REPORT AND DISCUSS WITH MIKE GROSS AND CALL TO ANNARAE STEELE AT NCAI.	1812
10/02/2009	4	0.70	CALL TO NCAI ON CSC REPORT TO CLASS COUNSEL; CALL TO NBC ON COST REIMBURSEMENT; WORK ON CRIS REPORTS TO COURT.	1813
10/12/2009	4	0.20	FOLLOW-UP ON NEW CSC FUNDING AND IDC CHANGE (STATUTORY) AUTHORIZATION.	1814
11/24/2009	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP ON NCAI CSC REPORT; EMAILS AND CONFERENCE CALL.	1835
12/14/2009	4	2.00	WORK ON FINAL REPORTS/NCAI REPORT/APPLICATION TO COURT TO BE RELEASED AS CLASS COUNSEL RE EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1836
12/15/2009	4	3.00	WORK ON FINAL STATUS REPORT FOR COURT ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1837
12/17/2009	4	1.00	CALLS ON CSC SHORTFALL REPORT AND ANALYZE; CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLASS COUNSEL AND DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE.	1839
12/17/2009	4	1.25	WORK ON IN-HOUSE STATUS RE CONTRACT ISSUES; REPORT RE BIA CSC REPORT TO MIKE AND LLOYD.	1840
12/18/2009	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH LLOYD MILLER IN RE NOTICE OF VIOLATION.	1841
12/21/2009	4	0.70	CONFERENCE CALL WITH LLOYD MILLER ON PSA-III AND DEMAND FOR CSC REPORT; FOLLOW-UP CALLS AND EMAILS WITH LLOYD MILLER, BIA AND JIM TODD.	1842
12/22/2009	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP CALLS AND EMAILS ON CSC SHORTFALL REPORT	1843

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			ISSUES AND CSC WORKGROUP MEETING; FINALIZE LETTER.	
12/23/2009	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP ON NOTICE OF VIOLATION RE CSC SF REPORT.	1844
01/04/2010	4	0.60	CALLS/EMAILS ON RAMAH CLASS ACTION; MEET AND CONFER SESSION IN D.C. RE SHORTFALL REPORTS.	1845
01/07/2010	4	1.40	FOLLOW-UP EMAILS AND ANALYSIS IN RE DRAFT BIA SHORTFALL REPORT.	1846
01/08/2010	4	0.70	FURTHER FOLLOW-UP CALLS AND EMAILS ON BIA CSC SHORTFALL REPORT ISSUES.	1847
01/11/2010	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP ON CSC WORK GROUP MEETING.	1848
01/23/2010	4	0.75	REVIEW BIA CSC SF ISSUES/PROBLEMS; IDENTIFY POSSIBLE REMEDIES.	1849
01/24/2010	4	4.50	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME FROM SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO TO WASHINGTON, D.C. IN RE SFR AND NOTICE OF VIOLATION.	1850
01/26/2010	4	1.00	MEET WITH DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE ON RAMAH NOTICE OF VIOLATION UNDER PSA-III RE SHORTFALL REPORT.	1851
01/29/2010	4	4.50	ONE-HALF TRAVEL TIME TO RETURN TO SANTA FE FROM DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE MEET AND CONFER.	1852
05/19/2010	4	3.50	WORK ON REVISIONS TO NCAI REPORT ON CSC WORK/MOTION FOR COURT AUTHORITY TO PAY AND CLOSE OUT CONTRACTS.	1853
05/20/2010	4	4.00	FURTHER WORK ON NCAI CONTRACT CLOSEOUT SUBMISSION AND INTERIM REPORT TO THE COURT RE EQUITABLE RELIEF COMPLAINT.	1854
05/21/2010	4	2.00	RETURN CALL FROM GOVERNMENT IN RE PROBLEMS WITH BIA CSC SHORTFALL REPORT.	1855
05/21/2010	4	2.00	WORK ON INTERIM REPORT TO THE COURT IN RE PSA-III.	1856
05/23/2010	4	0.50	WORK ON INTERIM REPORT TO THE COURT IN RE EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1857
05/24/2010	4	9.00	WORK WITH BIA STAFF AND OUR STAFF ON GENERATING BIA CSC SF REPORT FOR FY 2009	1858
05/25/2010	4	0.40	WORK ON BIA CSC SF REPORT ISSUES AND REVISIONS.	1859
05/25/2010	4	3.00	FURTHER WORK ON INTERIM REPORT TO THE COURT ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1860
05/26/2010	4	2.00	FOLLOW-UP WORK ON INTERIM REPORT TO THE COURT AND WORK ON BIA CSC SF REPORT.	1861
05/27/2010	4	1.50	WORK ON INTERIM REPORT TO THE COURT ON PSA-III STATUS (TRAINING COMPONENT) AND EXHIBITS.	1862
05/27/2010	4	0.70	WORK ON BIA CSC SF REPORT IN RE PSA-III; CONFERENCE CALL WITH WORK GROUP.	1863
05/28/2010	4	4.00	WORK ON INTERIM REPORT TO COURT AND EXHIBITS RE EQUITABLE RELIEF AND REDW.	1864
05/29/2010	4	1.40	MORE WORK ON BIA CSC SF REPORT; REVIEW 5/27 PACKAGE FOR PROBLEMS/ANOMALIES.	1865
06/01/2010	4	3.00	FURTHER WORK ON INTERIM REPORT ON EQUITABLE RELIEF AND RELATED MOTIONS IN RE REDW AND NCAI.	1866
06/02/2010	4	2.00	FURTHER WORK ON INTERIM REPORT TO THE COURT ON EQUITABLE RELIEF AND RELATED MOTIONS.	1867
06/03/2010	4	2.40	FURTHER WORK ON NCAI AND REDW MOTIONS AND INTERIM REPORT TO THE COURT ON EQUITABLE RELIEF.	1868
06/07/2010	4	0.20	CALL TO SABRINA MCCARTHY IN RE DRAFT INTERIM STATUS REPORT.	1869
06/11/2010	4	0.50	DO REVISIONS TO PROPOSED INTERIM REPORT ON EQUITABLE RELIEF TO REFLECT NEW FILINGS.	1872
06/11/2010	4	0.75	FINAL REVIEW AND REVISION OF INTERIM REPORT TO COURT	1873

Equitable Relief
9/30/2002 - 6/9/2011

Trans Date	Tmkr	Hours to Bill	Description	Ref #
			ON EQUITABLE RELIEF AND EXHIBITS.	
07/01/2010	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP ON SHORTFALL REPORT AND INITIAL (50%) CSC SUPPLEMENTAL DISTRIBUTION; EMAILS TO BIA AND WORK GROUP.	1878
07/08/2010	4	1.30	REVIEW DRAFT SHORTFALL REPORT; DO CSC WORKGROUP CONFERENCE CALL.	1879
07/12/2010	4	0.70	WORK ON BIA CSC SHORTFALL REPORT LANGUAGE; DO EMAIL TO TERRY PARKS.	1880
07/13/2010	4	0.40	FURTHER WORK ON CSC SHORTFALL REPORT REVISIONS.	1881
07/15/2010	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP WITH TERRY PARKSON ON SHORTFALL REPORT NARRATIVE CHANGES; REVIEW AND DISCUSS.	1882
08/03/2010	4	2.00	REVIEW/COMMENT ON REVISED BIA CSC SF REPORT.	1883
08/05/2010	4	0.60	CALL FROM NICK LONGLEY IN RE BIA CSC SF REPORT; EMAIL TO BIA ON ERRORS RE CHOCTAW DECISION SCHOOLS.	1884
08/26/2010	4	0.50	FOLLOW-UP CALLS AND EMAIL IN RE SEQUONH HIGH SCHOOL ISEF MONEY ISSUE (INCLUSION TWICE).	1890
08/27/2010	4	1.50	WORK ON BIA SF REPORT PROBLEMS.	1886
08/30/2010	4	0.30	FOLLOW-UP EMAILS IN RE BIA CSC SF REPORT PROBLEMS IN RE SELF-GOVERNANCE SPREADSHEET AND SEQUOYAH SCHOOL MONEY.	1887
09/01/2010	4	1.50	WORK ON BIA CSC SF REPORT ISSUES; EMAIL/CALLS AND EMAILS TO WORK GROUP; DO ANALYSIS.	1891
09/02/2010	4	1.00	CALL FROM TERRY PARKS, BIA ON CSC SF REPORT ISSUES; FOLLOW-UP WALLS WITH TERRY PARKS AND LONGLEY RE SEQUOYAH SCHOOL DATA ISSUES.	1892
09/15/2010	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP ON BIA SF REPORT ISSUES; NEED FOR TELEPHONE CONFERENCE, ETC.	1893
10/23/2010	4	0.60	DICTATE MEMO ON CHOCTAW DECISION SCHOOLS FOR TERRY PARKS.	1894
10/25/2010	4	1.50	WORK ON MEMO TO BIA IN RE CHOCTAW DECISION FOR CSC WORKGROUP.	1895
11/05/2010	4	1.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH CSC WORKGROUP.	1896
11/07/2010	4	1.00	ADDITIONAL ANALYSIS OF NEW CHOCTAW DECISION SCHOOLS CSC TEMPLATE FOR BIA SF REPORT REQUIRED BY RAMAH SETTLEMENT.	1897
11/08/2010	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP ANALYSIS ON CSC SF REPORT IN RE CHOCTAW DECISION SCHOOLS.	1898
11/09/2010	4	0.70	FOLLOW-UP ON BIA CSC WORKGROUP REPORT ISSUES WITH BIA AND STEVE OSBORNE, CSC TECHNICAL ADVISOR IN RE CORRECTIONS TO DRAFT REPORT.	1899
01/06/2011	4	0.40	FOLLOW-UP CALLS ON BIA-CSC WORK GROUP AND CSC REPORT.	1909
01/19/2011	4	0.50	CALL FROM TERRY PARKS; REVIEW AND RECOMMEND CHANGES TO CRITERIA ON CHOCTAW DECISION ISSUES.	1913
03/17/2011	4	2.00	Work on CSC workgroup report; CSC workgroup conference call.	1921
04/05/2011	4	6.00	One-half travel time from Santa Fe to Albuquerque and return; attend BIA CSC workgroup on CSC SF report.	1922
06/09/2011	4	0.75	Work on final report and cost bill.	1940
		<u>1,242.15</u>		