

**IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF NEW MEXICO**

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER, et al. v. DIRK KEMPTHORNE, et al.
No. CIV 90-0957 LH/KBM

Exhibit 5

**In Support of
PLAINTIFFS' MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF THE PARTIES'
THIRD PARTIAL SETTLEMENT
AND
COUNSEL'S MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF THEIR
APPLICATION FOR AWARD OF ATTORNEYS' FEES AND
COSTS**

**DECLARATION OF CLASS CO-COUNSEL FOR THE DCSC CLAIM
LLOYD B. MILLER
IN SUPPORT OF PSA III AND MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS FEES**

IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF NEW MEXICO

RAMAH NAVAJO CHAPTER,)	
OGLALA SIOUX TRIBE, and PUEBLO)	
OF ZUNI, for themselves and on behalf)	
of a class of persons similarly situated,)	
class of persons similarly situated,)	
)	
Plaintiffs,)	
)	
v.)	No. CIV 90-0957 LH/KBM
)	
DIRK A. KEMPTHORNE, Secretary of the)	
Interior, in his official capacity, et al.)	
)	
Defendants.)	

**AFFIDAVIT OF LLOYD B. MILLER IN SUPPORT OF
APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEY’S FEES AND COSTS**

1. My name is Lloyd B. Miller. I am a partner in the law firm of Sonosky, Chambers, Sachse, Mielke & Brownell, LLP of Albuquerque, New Mexico. Our firm is also known in Alaska as Sonosky, Chambers, Sachse, Miller & Munson, LLP; and in Washington, D.C. (our principal office) as Sonosky, Chambers, Sachse, Endreson & Perry, LLP. I am the lead attorney in this law firm charged with responsibility for representing the Pueblo of Zuni in the above-captioned case.

2. This Affidavit is offered in support of the Third Partial Settlement Agreement and the Application for Attorney’s Fees and Costs being filed in this case in connection with that Settlement Agreement. As such, and as reflected in said application, it also addresses work performed in *Zuni v. United States*, Case No. CIV 00-0365 LH/WWD (D.N.M.) (hereinafter “*Pueblo of Zuni*”) (dismissed without prejudice on April 22, 2002, on a stipulation to merge

claims and to add the Pueblo of Zuni into the *Ramah* action as the lead class representative for “direct contract support cost” claims).

3. Attached to this affidavit is a true and correct copy of my résumé.

(Attachment 1.)

4. Attached to this affidavit is a complete record of my law firm’s time entries incurred in connection with the equitable relief portions of the above captioned case and the related *Pueblo of Zuni* litigation for the period of July 3, 2002, through the present. (Attachment 2.) The detailed daily diary entries have been redacted in part only to the extent necessary to protect attorney-client privileged communications or attorney work product. According to Attachment 2, my firm to date has devoted 1152.81 hours to the prosecution of equitable relief issues in the *Pueblo of Zuni* case and, following its merger into this action, in this case. These records exclude substantial time I failed to record from time to time, usually for work performed while traveling on other business. They include 453.56 work hours recorded under client number 5000, which hours were partially compensated by other tribal clients of my law firm.

(Attachment 2, pages 25-41.) Work on the Application for Attorney’s Fees has been included in Attachment 2 under client number 5009 and in the foregoing total because of its dual purpose in also supporting final approval of the underlying settlement.

5. Attached to this Affidavit is also a complete record of all costs incurred and reimbursable expenses advanced in connection with these cases for the period May 31, 2007, through April 21, 2008. (Attachment 3.) As reflected in Attachment 3, our firm incurred reimbursable expenses in connection with the above captioned case and the related *Pueblo of Zuni* litigation of \$5,625.00, from May 31, 2007, through April 21, 2008.

6. I have been practicing law with the Sonosky Chambers law firm since 1979, following the completion of a judicial clerkship with the Honorable James M. Fitzgerald of the United States District Court for the District of Alaska. Throughout this period my practice has been devoted exclusively to representing the interests of Native American tribes and tribal organizations. Prior to that time I received my undergraduate degree from Yale University and my law degree with honors (Order of the Coif) from the University of Virginia School of Law.

7. I am a member in good standing of the District of Columbia Bar and the Alaska Bar Association. I am also the founding member of the Alaska Native Law Section of the Alaska Bar Association, and I served as the Chair of that section for ten years from 1984 through 1993. For ten years I also served as a member of the Board of the Alaska Legal Services Corporation, including one term as President and two terms as Vice-President. I have also been a guest lecturer on selected issues in Native American law at the law schools of Yale University, Harvard University and Georgetown University, and have also spoken at numerous national Indian law conferences and symposia. I am a past Vice-President and current board member of the Alaska Chapter of the Federal Bar Association, a member of the Circuit Executive Committee of the United States Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit, and a past Lawyer Representative from the District of Alaska to the Ninth Circuit.

8. I have an AV rating from Martindale-Hubbell, and my usual and customary hourly rate today for new work is \$350.00.

9. The single largest focus of my practice on behalf of Native American interests has been on matters relating to the Indian Self-Determination Act of 1975. Although my work under this general topic has been wide-ranging, it has included extensive involvement in the

legislative processes leading up to the 1988, 1990, 1994 and 2000 amendments to the Indian Self-Determination Act (“ISDA”). It has included substantial litigation arising under the ISDA, including litigation to compel the Bureau of Indian Affairs or the Indian Health Service to award contracts under the ISDA, litigation to recover statutory damages for violations of the ISDA, litigation to enforce compliance with the ISDA and litigation to recover damages for breach of contracts entered into under the ISDA. It has included the annual negotiation and periodic enforcement of contracts, compacts and annual funding agreements with both agencies. It has included participation in all of the proceedings of the Indian Health Service Contract Support Cost Work Group (usually with the attendance of the Bureau of Indian Affairs, and often with the attendance of representatives from the Office of Inspector General/National Business Center, and on occasion from Office of Management and Budget). It has included membership on and extensive participation in the negotiated rulemaking committee formed to develop regulations to implement the 1988 and 1994 Amendments to the ISDA (including co-chairmanship of the final Drafting Committee), and similar participation (along with my partners Myra Munson and Jim Glaze) in the negotiated rulemaking committee formed to develop the regulations to implement the 2000 Amendments to the Act (which added Title V to the ISDA), and (with my partner Myra Munson) the similar negotiated rulemaking committee formed to develop regulations to implement the 1994 Amendments’ addition of a new Title IV to the ISDA. It has included lobbying work to secure contract support costs-related amendments to the ISDA, increased IHS and BIA appropriations for contract support costs, and as-yet unenacted amendments to Title IV of the ISDA. It has also included work as the primary writer of the National Indian Health Board’s comprehensive report on implementation of the 1988 ISDA Amendments, and work for

the National Congress of American Indians to write NCAI's 1999 report on contract support costs.

10. Among the significant cases relating to the ISDA that I have litigated in recent years are the following: *Cherokee Nation and Shoshone-Paiute Tribes v. Leavitt*, 543 U.S. 631 (2005), *aff'g Thompson v. Cherokee Nation of Oklahoma*, 334 F.3d 1075 (Fed. Cir. 2003) and *rev'g Cherokee Nation v. Thompson*, 311 F.3d 1054 (10th Cir. 2002); *Yukon-Kuskokwim Health Corporation v. Trust Insurance Plan for Southwest Alaska*, 884 F. Supp. 1560 (D. Alaska 1994) (also involving provisions of the Indian Health Care Improvement Act); *Ramah Navajo School Board and Puyallup Tribe of Indians v. Babbitt*, 87 F.3d 1338 (D.C. Cir. 1996); *Shoshone-Bannock Tribes v. Shalala*, 988 F.Supp. 1306 (D. Or. 1997); *Shoshone-Bannock Tribes v. Shalala*, 999 F.Supp. 1395 (D. Or. 1998) (on reconsideration); *Shoshone-Bannock Tribes v. Shalala*, 58 F.Supp.2d 1911 (D. Or. 1999) (on remand), reversed on appeal 279 F.3d 660 (9th Cir. 2002); *Shoshone-Bannock Tribes v. Shalala*, 408 F. Supp.2d 1073 (D. Or. 2005) ; and *Yukon-Kuskokwim Health Corp. v. National Labor Relations Board*, 234 F.3d 714 (D.C. Cir. 2000). I also recently handled the \$42 million settlement of certain claims for unpaid contract support costs filed by the Yukon Kuskokwim Health Corporation against the Indian Health Service, pending before the Civilian Board of Contract Appeals, the largest judgment ever awarded against IHS (CBCA 188-ISDA & 283-ISDA through 288-ISDA) (judgment entered Dec 6, 2007).

11. Additional major litigation I have been involved in outside the Indian Self-Determination Act arena is set forth in Attachment 1. This litigation includes service as court-appointed Plaintiffs' Liaison Counsel to the U.S. District Court and the Alaska Superior Court in

the ongoing litigation arising out of the 1989 EXXON VALDEZ oil spill disaster. In that litigation I have also served as class counsel for the Alaska Native Class, comprised of 18 federally recognized tribes and over 4,000 Alaska Natives whose subsistence way of life was heavily damaged by the 1989 disaster.

12. In late 1998, a first partial settlement was achieved in this action, and a final approval hearing was held in mid-December 1998. Scrutiny of the settlement terms and historic contract support cost shortfalls led the Pueblo of Zuni to contact me in March 1999. At that time the Pueblo requested a meeting to review all of the Pueblo's contract support cost payments from the Bureau of Indian Affairs and from the Indian Health Service, and to explore the extent to which existing class action litigation sought sufficient damages to remedy the severe shortfalls experienced by the Pueblo of Zuni.

13. In April 1999, I met with the Pueblo of Zuni in Albuquerque, New Mexico. I received a presentation from the Pueblo Governor, several Council members, the Pueblo Finance Director, and the Pueblo's certified public accountant regarding the Pueblo's experiences concerning contract support cost underpayments from various federal agencies. Also during that meeting, I provided a detailed oral report on the nature of all extant litigation concerning contract support cost issues. This report included a discussion of the "miscalculated rate" claim that was, at that time, the sole focus of the *Ramah Navajo Chapter* litigation. This discussion also focused on the class action then pending in the Eastern District of Oklahoma filed by the Cherokee Nation and the Shoshone-Paiute Tribes of Nevada to recover CSC damages arising out of IHS underpayments. At this meeting it was concluded that the Pueblo of Zuni had suffered contract support cost underpayments over a period of several years from the Bureau of Indian Affairs due

to at least four causes: (1) the miscalculation of the BIA's indirect contract support cost responsibilities under the Indian Self-Determination Act (as confirmed in this action by the Tenth Circuit), (2) the shortfalls in the BIA's payment of even the miscalculated rate, (3) the failure of the BIA to pay any direct contract support costs ("DCSC"), and (4) the practice of the Office of Inspector General in failing to include indirect cost shortfalls when applying the fixed-with-carry-forward method of determining future indirect contract support costs requirements. It was also concluded that of these four issues, only the first (the miscalculated rate claim) was then being addressed by the ongoing *Ramah Navajo Chapter* litigation.

14. In the months following the April 1999 meeting, the Pueblo of Zuni undertook extensive financial research and analysis regarding its potential claims. It also undertook a very major document production initiative to locate all contracting records and financial data going back to fiscal year 1993. Based upon this work and following considerable additional analysis, by letter dated September 30, 1999 the Pueblo of Zuni filed a formal claim under the Contract Disputes Act with the Pueblo's BIA Contracting Officer. The claim letter covered the "shortfall claim" and the "DCSC" claim back to FY1993. Shortly before the BIA Contracting Officer issued a decision in the matter, the Pueblo of Zuni learned that the Oglala Sioux Tribe had intervened in the *Ramah Navajo Chapter* case as a co-plaintiff to similarly assert the "shortfall" claim back to fiscal year 1993 on a class-wide basis, and that the Oglala intervention had been approved by the Court. Based upon this intervening development, the Pueblo of Zuni concluded that it was no longer necessary to duplicate the ongoing efforts in this action regarding the "shortfall" claim, and determined to narrow the focus of its energies to the "direct contract support cost" claim.

15. In late February 2000, the Bureau of Indian Affairs Contracting Officer denied the Pueblo of Zuni's Contract Disputes Act Claim. Shortly thereafter I was instructed to prepare a Complaint asserting the direct contract support cost claims described in the preceding paragraph on behalf of the Pueblo of Zuni and a class of similarly situated tribes.

16. In March 2000, the Pueblo of Zuni filed Case No. 00-0365. Thereafter the attorneys in *Ramah* and *Pueblo of Zuni* worked cooperatively to develop a comprehensive Joint Prosecution Agreement to marshal their forces together in the coordinated prosecution of both actions against the United States.

17. In discussions with the attorneys for the Ramah class, I learned that the Ramah Navajo Chapter had commenced a similar claim under the Contract Disputes Act regarding DCSCs, but that the *Ramah* claim (unlike the *Zuni* claim) did not go back to FY 1993 (a critical lump-sum year). In the context of the Joint Prosecution Agreement, the *Ramah* attorneys were pleased to add the DCSC claims back to FY 1993 as part of a joint effort against the Defendants, and I was pleased to join forces with *Ramah* counsel to present a more formidable joint case that would, hopefully, benefit all tribes. To guard against any possible statute of limitations defense, once Ramah received a denial of its administrative DCSC claim, Ramah in April 2001 filed a motion to amend its Complaint in this case to add the DCSC claim going back to FY1994.

18. Direct contract support costs are provided for in 25 U.S.C. 450j-1(a)(3)(A)(i). Direct contract support costs are comprised of additional costs which Tribes must incur in the operation of a particular program, and cover costs which are program specific and therefore are not properly pooled together in a Tribe's administrative overhead (a Tribe's "indirect cost pool").

A typical example of such direct contract support costs are the costs for workers compensation insurance associated with employing a police officer under a self-determination contract.

Contract support costs include direct contract support costs to the extent such costs (like workers compensation costs) are not transferred by the Secretary to the Tribes as part of the program budget being contracted. Until the Second Partial Settlement achieved in this case, the BIA never recognized a legal duty to recognize and to pay direct contract support costs.

19. In 2002, this Court approved a \$29 million class settlement of all DCSC claims arising in fiscal years 1993, 1994, and 1995 (together with additional relatively minor shortfall claims arising in fiscal years 1993 and 1994). In the wake of this settlement, the parties agreed to explore the possibility of settling the plaintiff's claims for declaratory and injunctive relief relating to direct contract support costs. As part of such claims the plaintiff's complaint sought an injunction that the BIA be required to recognize and to pay direct contract support costs, and ordering the BIA to recognize and to pay such costs in future years.

20. In early 2003, the parties held a series of negotiating sessions devoted in part to resolution of the Class's direct contract support cost claims. (The remainder of the negotiations addressed other equitable relief claims.) In these negotiations the parties were in sharp disagreement over the appropriateness of a consent decree or other comparable order to reflect a settlement of the DCSC claims. In due course, the defendants proposed that the BIA be given an opportunity to develop a policy addressed to direct contract support costs, using a procedure by which both the attorneys for the plaintiffs and other interested Tribes could participate. Agreement was reached to proceed in this manner, with the ultimate goal to establish

a BIA policy on direct contract support costs. The plaintiffs' right to seek a consent decree was reserved pending the outcome of the BIA's initiative.

21. In August 2003, the BIA announced a series of regional meetings, including meetings in Minneapolis, Albuquerque, Portland and Anchorage, intended to receive comment from interested Tribes on direct contract support cost issues. I and co-counsel Michael Gross and Bryant Rogers divided the responsibilities for attending all of these meetings. In these meetings, the BIA announced its intent to develop a policy for the recognition of direct contract support costs, and the BIA explained that the development of this policy was in direct response to the instant litigation.

22. Initially the BIA indicated in these meetings that it would pay for two tribes to participate from each of the BIA's 12 Regions, to serve on a workgroup to be formed as a result of these initial meetings and to develop a BIA policy on direct contract support costs. Several weeks later, however, the BIA announced that funding would not be available to conduct any workgroup meetings or to pay for the travel costs for any tribal representatives to attend these meetings. This development led plaintiff's counsel to involve the National Congress of American Indians, which in due course convened a meeting of tribal leaders and BIA personnel and attorneys. As a result of this meeting, and after many additional weeks of delay, in November 2003 the first meeting of the Tribal and BIA workgroup was convened in Albuquerque, New Mexico.

23. The Albuquerque meeting was one of three watershed events in the development of the BIA's new policy. By the end of the Albuquerque meeting, BIA representatives had not only been convinced of the need to precisely identify all direct contract

support costs, but had also been convinced to issue a comprehensive policy on all aspects of contract support cost issues. Unlike the Indian Health Service, which had contract support cost policies in place since at least 1992, the BIA had never adopted a comprehensive policy for how it would address contract support cost issues (although the BIA did occasionally issue annual Federal Register notices on the topic). In the Albuquerque meetings the BIA agreed to issue a comprehensive policy on all aspects of CSC issues, and also, very significantly, agreed to revise its payment procedures completely so as to facilitate stability in contract funding. The BIA agreed to do so by providing that (as a general proposition) annual contract payments would not be less than payments made in a preceding year, with such payments made within the first few weeks of each fiscal year. This development represented a radical change from the past BIA practice of annually re-prorating all contract support cost payments to Tribes, and of deferring such payments well into (and often until the end of) each fiscal year. In this manner, Tribes would have the stability of knowing what their minimum payments would be in the coming year, and would know that those payment would be made early in the fiscal year.

24. I became the principal drafter and spokesperson for the tribal representatives on the national workgroup that developed the proposed new BIA policy. Following the Albuquerque meeting there occurred numerous telephone calls and smaller meetings to further refine the BIA's contract support cost policy. In August 2004, a concluding negotiating session was held in Bloomington, MN. Assistant Secretary for Indian Affairs Aureen Martin attended the meeting, together with members of her senior staff. As a result of this meeting, the BIA and tribal representatives reached a final agreement on the content of the BIA's upcoming CSC Policy, later known as the "Bloomington Accord." Assistant Secretary Martin committed to

forward the policy for final adoption, subject only to a limited legal review to assure that no provision of the Policy was contrary to law.

25. Shortly after the Bloomington Accord, Assistant Secretary Martin resigned her position. During the ensuing months I learned that BIA staff and attorneys in the BIA Central Office in Washington D.C. were seeking to substantially modify most of the key provisions of the proposed Circular, directly contrary to the agreements reflected in the Bloomington Accord. Over the course of the next several months there followed a series of meetings with successively higher BIA officials, beginning with a special assistant to the Acting Assistant Secretary and concluding with several meetings involving Associate Deputy Secretary James Cason. These meetings were at times combative and difficult, and all meetings required travel to Washington D.C.

26. During the same time frame, the BIA and Tribal representatives commenced a sampling of Tribal contractors to (1) assist in determining the total DCSC requirement the BIA needed to recognize, and (2) assist in refining the procedures for negotiating DCSC requirements. A sampling session with Tribes representing all BIA Regional Offices took place in Phoenix in February 2005. I participated in all aspects of the sampling process, jointly on behalf of the Class and on behalf of several tribal clients of my law firm.

27. Meetings in Washington, D.C. with high level BIA and Departmental officials over the developing CSC Policy occurred in February 2005, March 2005 and May 2005.

28. Also during this period, the BIA decided to convene five (5) Regional meetings to secure additional Tribal input on the developing BIA CSC Policy. Class Counsel

attended all of these meetings, including my attendance at the Portland and Albuquerque meetings.

29. In October 2005, Acting Deputy Assistant Secretary for Indian Affairs Jim Cason (also serving as the Associate Deputy Secretary for the Interior Department) issued a “Dear Tribal Leader” letter requesting comment on the BIA’s draft CSC policy. I worked with several Tribal clients and at national forums to encourage Tribes to support the key provisions of the Bloomington Accord, and to oppose any material deviation from that Accord. Comments from Tribal representatives overwhelmingly supported the BIA’s proposal to follow the Bloomington Accord principles.

30. In February 2006, I met with Mr. Cason once again, this time in response to a Federal Register notice indicating that the new CSC policy would not go into effect until fiscal year 2007, and to urge that the policy be adopted immediately.

31. In the middle of these proceedings it was learned that the Bureau was seeking from Congress authority to reduce the indirect contract support cost payments in order to begin funding direct contract support cost payments, and that the Bureau was also seeking to divert contract support cost funds to finance the assignment of two individuals in the National Business Center to negotiate tribal direct contract support cost requirements. This discovery required class counsel to engage in intensive communications with key congressional staff. These efforts were successful and the BIA’s initiatives were eventually rejected by Congress.

32. In May 2006, Associate Deputy Secretary James Cason announced at a national tribal gathering held in Traverse City, Michigan that he had executed on behalf of the Department the final contract support cost policy. The new BIA policy was identified as

“National Policy Memorandum, Number NPM-SELFD-1.” The final policy in all material respects was faithful to the agreements reflected in the Bloomington Accord. The Bloomington Accord proved to be the second watershed event in the development of this policy (the first being the BIA’s agreement to address all CSC issues in its Policy, and not just DCSC issues). The third watershed event in this process was the BIA’s ultimate adoption of the Policy in May 2006. I was deeply and actively involved in the entire campaign to secure the adoption of this new policy, and I did so in my dual capacity as Co-Class Counsel for the Direct Contract Support Cost Claims and as counsel for many individual tribes and tribal organizations with a deep interest in CSC issues. During some of the key negotiating sessions I was joined by co-class counsel Bryant Rogers or Michael Gross.

33. Class Counsel’s decision to pursue a negotiated strategy with the BIA regarding the direct contract support cost issues, over a litigation strategy, substantially reduced the risks for the class. Litigation over contract support cost issues has proven to be highly volatile. For instance, although the Supreme Court decision in *Cherokee Nation* was unanimous, that decision was preceded by three circuit court opinions that ruled against tribal contract support cost claims. More recently, even litigation in the purely injunctive arena has proven difficult, as reflected in the district court’s mixed rulings issued in *Southern Ute Indian Tribe v. Leavitt*, 497 F.Supp. 2d 1245 (D.N.M. 2007), *appeal docketed*, No. 07-2274 (10th Cir. Nov. 21, 2007). It is certainly possible that had class counsel pursued the possibly speedier litigation option, the result would have been far less advantageous for Tribes than was the ultimate outcome.

34. The BIA's adoption of the 2005 contract support cost policy reflected a changed commitment by the Department brought about as a result of this litigation over contract support cost issues. For instance, in 2005 Associate Deputy Secretary Jim Cason advised class counsel that he would now be seeking increased appropriations of at least \$19 million for each of the next fiscal years starting with fiscal year 2007. Such increases would be unprecedented in terms of the BIA's CSC appropriation, which had remained largely flat in recent years. Ultimately, the BIA's budget request to Congress in fiscal year 2007 requested an increase of \$19 million, and Congress approved a final increase of \$14 million. In fiscal year 2008 there was an additional substantial increase in the BIA's contract support cost appropriation.

35. At a national tribal meeting held in Las Vegas in May 2008, the BIA announced that it had in fiscal year 2007 succeeded in paying 100% of all tribal contract support cost requirements (the first time this has occurred since the enactment of the ISDA), and that the BIA had had sufficient appropriations in FY 2007 to begin paying tribal direct contract support cost requirements. These appropriations increases can be directly linked to the adoption of the BIA's new contract support cost policy, and the BIA's concomitant recognition of a \$45 million need in additional funding to pay direct contract support cost requirements.

36. There are very few attorneys in the United States experienced in contract support cost matters arising under the ISDA. The pool of such attorneys willing to take on class action contract support cost litigation on a contingent fee basis is even smaller. Indeed, the only attorneys to have ever taken on the risks of such litigation on a contingent fee basis are the attorneys involved in the *Ramah Navajo Chapter* and *Pueblo of Zuni* litigation. The extremely limited pool of qualified attorneys available to undertake such challenging litigation is a further

indication of the extraordinary risk and burdens associated with such litigation. The risk that counsel face in such cases is further evidenced by the district court's recent ruling in parallel litigation against the IHS, where a court refused to certify a class identical to the class that has been certified here (*Pueblo of Zuni v. United States*, 243 F.R.D. 436 (D.N.M. 2007)). The achievement reflected in the Third Partial Settlement is also notable for having avoided the risk of a government motion to decertify the class based upon parallel events in the foregoing litigation.

37. Our firm's involvement in contract support litigation has been the overwhelmingly dominant part of my practice for several years (as well as a significant part of the practice of other partners and associates), and has caused an economic burden on my firm, both by virtue of my inability to take on hourly work and by virtue of the need to incur substantial out-of-pocket expenses.

38. During my tenure as co-class counsel I have also participated in extensive settlement negotiations regarding the other matters that are addressed by the third partial settlement agreement, including matters relating to the fixed-with-carry-forward system, creation of a new multiple rate option, and matters relating to diverted program funds. These additional tasks are also detailed in the exhibits accompanying this affidavit.

FURTHER YOUR AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT

Dated this 24th day of June 2008.

/s/ Lloyd B. Miller

Lloyd B. Miller

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN to before me this 24th day of June 2008.

/s/ Elizabeth E. Tempel

Notary Public in and for Alaska

My Commission Expires: 6/26/2010

LLOYD B. MILLER

900 WEST FIFTH AVENUE, SUITE 700
ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501-2029
TELEPHONE: (907) 258-6377
FACSIMILE: (907) 272-8332
E-MAIL: LLOYD@SONOSKY.NET
WEBSITE: WWW.SONOSKY.NET

EMPLOYMENT

Managing Partner
Sonosky, Chambers, Sachse, Miller & Munson, LLP
900 West Fifth Avenue, Suite 700
Anchorage, Alaska 99501-2029
Telephone: (907) 258-6377
Facsimile: (907) 272-8332
E-Mail: lloyd@sonosky.net

Other Firm Offices:

Sonosky, Chambers, Sachse,
Endreson & Perry, LLP
1425 K Street Northwest, Suite 600
Washington, D.C. 20005
Telephone: (202) 682-0240
Facsimile: (202) 682-0249

Sonosky, Chambers, Sachse, Miller
& Munson, LLP
318 Fourth Street
Juneau, Alaska 99801
Telephone: (907) 586-5880
Facsimile: (907) 586-5883

Sonosky, Chambers, Sachse, Endreson
& Mielke, LLP
500 Marquette Avenue, Suite 700
Albuquerque, New Mexico 87102
Telephone: (505) 247-0147
Facsimile: (505) 843-6912

Sonosky, Chambers, Sachse, Endreson
& Perry, LLP
750 B Street, Suite 1840
San Diego, California 92101
Telephone: (619) 546-5585
Facsimile: (619) 546-5584

REPRESENTATIVE LITIGATION

- ◆ *Yukon-Kuskokwim Health Corporation v. Leavitt*, Case No. CBCA 188-ISDA, 283-ISDA through 288-ISDA (C.B.C.A.) (\$42 million settlement by judgment of contract support cost damage claims).
- ◆ *Pueblo of Zuni v. United States*, Case No. CIV01-1046 WJ/WPL (D. NM) (plaintiffs' counsel in putative nationwide class action to recover damages for failure of Indian Health Service to

calculate properly and pay fully tribal contract support costs required by Indian Self-Determination Act).

- ◆ *Cherokee Nation and Shoshone-Paiute Tribes v. Leavitt*, 543 U.S. 631 (2005), *aff'g Thompson v. Cherokee Nation of Oklahoma*, 334 F.3d 1075 (Fed. Cir. 2003) and *rev'g Cherokee Nation v. Thompson*, 311 F.3d 1054 (10th Cir. 2002) (counsel of record and arguing counsel in consolidated actions holding the United States liable in money damages for Indian Health Service failure to pay “contract support costs” under Indian Self-Determination Act contracts).
- ◆ *Pueblo of Zuni v. United States*, Case No. CIV00-0365 LH/WWD (D.N.M.), consolidated into *Ramah Navajo Chapter and Oglala Sioux Tribe v. Norton*, Case No. CIV 90-0957 (plaintiffs’ lead counsel in portion of nationwide class action brought to recover damages for failure of Bureau of Indian Affairs to pay full tribal “direct” contract support costs required by Indian Self-Determination Act) (\$29 million partial settlement approved Dec. 6, 2002, *sub nom Ramah Navajo Chapter, Oglala Sioux Tribe and Pueblo of Zuni v. Norton*, 250 F.Supp.2d 1303 (D. NM 2002).
- ◆ *United Keetoowah Band v. United States*, 67 Fed. Cl. 695 (2005), *Cherokee Nation, rev'd*, ___ F.3d ___ (Fed. Cir. 2006) (litigation over UKB claim of successorship to Cherokee Nation and entitlement to share of escrowed Nation funds).
- ◆ *Cherokee Nation v. Norton and Delaware Tribe of Indians*, 389 F.3d 1074 (10th Cir. 2004), cert. denied 126 S. Ct. 333 (2005) (lead counsel for plaintiff Tribe in successful action invalidating Secretarial recognition of an entity previously merged into the Cherokee Nation by treaty and a congressionally-ratified 1867 inter-tribal agreement).
- ◆ *Native Village of Eyak v. Daley*, 375 F.3d 1218, (9th Cir. 2004) (*en banc*) (of counsel to Native American Rights Fund) (order vacating dismissal of claims).
- ◆ *Yukon-Kuskokwim Health Corp. v. Int’l Brotherhood of Teamsters, Local 959, AFL-CIO, CLC.*, 341 NLRB No. 139 (May 28, 2004) (declining to exercise NLRB jurisdiction over an Alaska tribal health care provider). *See also Yukon-Kuskokwim Health Corp. v. National Labor Relations Bd.*, 234 F.3d 714 (D.C. Cir. 2000), reversing 328 NLRB 101 (1999) and 329 NLRB 86 (1999) (counsel for petitioner challenging NLRB ruling that the National Labor Relations Act applies to tribes administering an Indian Health Service hospital under the Indian Self-Determination Act outside an Indian reservation, and remanding to the NLRB for further proceedings).
- ◆ *Appeals of Cherokee Nation*, IBCA Nos. 4434/4435-2002 (IBCA 2003) (counsel of record in successful Indian Reservation Roads contract funding claim exceeding \$800,000).
- ◆ *Navajo Nation v. DHHS*, 325 F.3d 1133 (9th Cir. 2003) (*en banc*) (counsel of record for *amicus* Tanana Chiefs Conference in support of rehearing) (holding Temporary Assistance to Needy Families not to be an “Indian” program under ISDA).

- ◆ *Runyon ex rel. B.R. v. Association of Council Presidents, et al.*, 84 P.3d 437, (Alaska 2004) (co-counsel with Native American Rights Fund for *Amicus* Alaska Inter-Tribal Council in successfully urging Court to reject Alaska Legislature’s request that the Court overrule *John v. Baker*, 982 P.2d 738 (Alaska 1999), which held that the Department of the Interior has lawfully recognized the political tribal status of Alaska Native villages).
- ◆ *Safari Club International, et al. v. Demientieff, et al.*, No. A98-0414-CV (HRH) (D. Alaska Jan. 16, 2004) (of counsel to Native American Rights Fund representing Alaska Native intervenors in partially successful challenge to 2002 Interior Department changes in the composition of the Regional Advisory Councils established under Title VIII of the Alaska National Interest Land Conservation Act, and in successful defense of the Councils prior subsistence hunting determinations).
- ◆ *Katie John v. United States and Alaska Federation of Natives v. United States*, 72 F.3d 698 (9th Cir. 1995), *cert. denied* 116 S. Ct. 1672 (1996), on renewed appeal from final judgment 247 F.3d 1032 (9th Cir. 2001) (*en banc*) (of counsel to Katie John lead counsel Heather Kendall Miller on cross-petition for writ of *certiorari* on issue of whether United States’ navigational servitude constitutes an “interest in waters,” title to which is in the United States, within the meaning of the “public lands” provision of Title VIII of the Alaska National Interest Lands Conservation Act, and of counsel in follow-on Ninth Circuit appeal).
- ◆ *In re the EXXON VALDEZ*, Case No. A89-069 (D. Alaska) (U.S. District Court) and Case No. 3AN-89-2533 (Alaska Superior Court) (Plaintiffs’ Liaison Counsel and lead class counsel for the Alaska Native Subsistence Class). *See In re the EXXON VALDEZ*, 472 F.3d 600 (9th Cir. 2006) (remitting punitive damage award to \$2.5 million); *see also In re Exxon Valdez*, 270 F.3d 1215 (9th Cir. 2001) (sustaining punitive damage liability but vacating and remanding district court opinion sustaining \$5 billion punitive damage jury verdict); *In re EXXON VALDEZ*, 296 F. Supp.2d 1071 (D. Alaska 2004) (on remand) (remitting punitive damage award to \$4.5 billion); *In re EXXON VALDEZ*, 236 F.Supp.2d 1043 (D. Alaska 2002) (on earlier remand remitting punitive damage award to \$4 billion) (vacated by Ninth Circuit Aug. 18, 2003 for further consideration in light of *State Farm v. Campbell*, 538 U.S. 408 (2003)); *In re EXXON VALDEZ*, 229 F.3d 790 (9th Cir. 2000) (enforcing “Seattle VII” agreement remitting portion of punitive damages verdict to Exxon); *Sea Hawk Seafoods, Inc., et al. v. Alyeska Pipeline Service Co., et al.*, 206 F.3d 900 (9th Cir. 2000) (affirming jury verdict against challenge of alleged juror misconduct), *cert denied, sub. nom. Exxon Mobil Corp. v. Baker*, 121 S.Ct. 283 (2000); *Kodiak Island Borough v. Exxon Corp.*, 991 P.2d 757 (Alaska 1999); *Lakosh v. Exxon Corp.*, 1998 WL 536878, 161 F.3d 12 (9th Cir. 1998); *Exxon Shipping v. Airport Depot Diner*, 120 F.3d 166 (9th Cir. 1997); *Alaska Native Class v. Exxon Corp.*, 104 F.3d 1196 (9th Cir. 1997); *Allen v. Exxon Corp.*, 102 F.3d 429 (9th Cir. 1996); *In re Joint Briefing of Issues on Appeal from the Trans-Alaska Pipeline Liability Fund*, 1995 WL 138573, 51 F.3d 280 (9th Cir. 1995); *Exxon Shipping Co. v. U.S. Dept. of the Interior*, 34 F.3d 774 (9th Cir. 1994); *Alaska Sportfishing Association v. Exxon Corp.*, 34 F.3d 769 (9th Cir. 1994); *Eyak Native Village v. Exxon*, 25 F.3d 773 (9th Cir. 1994); *In re EXXON VALDEZ*, 1995 WL 527988 (D. Alaska 1995); *In re EXXON VALDEZ*, 767 F. Supp. 1509 (D. Alaska 1991); and *In re EXXON VALDEZ*, 142 F.R.D. 380 (D.D.C. 1992).

- ◆ *Shoshone-Bannock Tribes v. Shalala*, 988 F.Supp. 1306 (D. Or. 1997); *Shoshone-Bannock Tribes v. Shalala*, 999 F.Supp. 1395 (D. Or. 1998) (on reconsideration); *Shoshone-Bannock Tribes v. Shalala*, 58 F.Supp.2d 1911 (D. Or. 1999) (on remand), reversed on appeal 279 F.3d 660 (9th Cir. 2002) (lead counsel in first-impression case under the Indian Self-Determination Act establishing *de novo* standard of review, agency burden of proof, availability of damages remedy) (reversing lower court award of damages for agency failure to pay contract support costs); *Shoshone-Bannock Tribes v. Shalala*, 408 F. Supp.2d 1073 (D. Or. 2005) (granting Rule 60(b) Motion to set aside judgment dismissing contract support cost claim and reinstating judgment against IHS).
- ◆ *Alaskans for a Common Language, Inc. and U.S. English, Inc. v. Kritz, et al.*, No. S-10590 (of counsel to Native American Rights Fund and Alakayak plaintiffs in action challenging “English Only” law).
- ◆ *John v. Baker*, 982 P.2d 738 (Alaska 1999), *cert. denied* 528 U.S. 1182 (2000) (co-counsel to the Native American Rights Fund for Tribal *amici* in first Alaska Supreme Court case to confirm the federally recognized sovereign tribal status of Alaska Native villages operating outside Indian country).
- ◆ *CIGNA Ins. Co. and Native Village of Mekoryuk, et al. v. Moses*, Case Nos. S-08908/ 8918 (Alaska Supreme Court) (co-counsel for *Amici* and Native American Rights Fund in case involving interplay between sovereign immunity and workers compensation laws) (appeal dismissed on settlement).
- ◆ *State of Alaska v. Native Village of Venetie*, 522 U.S. 520 (1998) (co-counsel to Native American Rights Fund for respondent Tribe) (holding certain Alaska Native ANCSA lands do not constitute “Indian country”), *reversing State of Alaska v. Native Village of Venetie*, 101 F.3d 1286 (9th Cir. 1996) (counsel of record for *Amici* Native Village of Barrow, 30 tribes, 5 inter-tribal organizations, Alaska Federation of Natives, Rural-CAP and Alaska Inter-Tribal Council in support of Venetie Tribe). *See also State of Alaska v. Venetie*, 856 F.2d 1384 (9th Cir. 1988) (counsel of record for *Amici* Alaska tribal interests in interlocutory appeal concerning the application of the tribal exhaustion rule at preliminary injunction stage).
- ◆ *Hernandez v. Lambert*, 951 P.2d 436 (Alaska 1998) (counsel of record for *Amicus* Native Village of Tanana in case rejecting challenge to tribal court adoption decree terminating parental rights).
- ◆ *Ramah Navajo Chapter v. Lujan*, 112 F.3d 1455 (10th Cir. 1997), on remand 50 F.Supp.2d 1091 (D.N.M. 1999) (counsel for absent “DCA” class members initially excluded from nationwide class settlement, added back into settlement to share \$900,000).
- ◆ *Ramah Navajo School Board and Puyallup Tribe of Indians v. Babbitt*, 87 F.3d 1338 (D.C. Cir. 1996) (plaintiffs’ lead counsel in first-impression case interpreting scope of agency authority and discretion under the Indian Self-Determination Act, and declaring invalid Bureau of Indian Affairs practice regarding contract support cost payments).

- ◆ *Yukon-Kuskokwim Health Corporation v. Trust Insurance Plan for Southwest Alaska*, 884 F.Supp. 1360 (D. Alaska 1994) (co-counsel in first-impression case establishing liability of third-party health plans under section 206 of the Indian Health Care Improvement Act to cover the costs of Indian Health Service-funded health care provided by tribes or tribal organizations under the Indian Self-Determination Act).
- ◆ *Blatchford v. Native Village of Noatak*, 501 U. S. 775 (1991) (counsel of record for *Amici* Native Village of Tanana, 95 tribes and the Alaska Federation of Natives defending lower court rulings in favor of federally recognized tribal status of Alaska Native villages) (issue reserved as undecided) (also of counsel on brief in opposition to cert. petition).
- ◆ *Native Village of Venetie v. State of Alaska*, 944 F.2d 548 (9th Cir. 1991) (counsel of record for *Amici* 197 tribes, Alaska Federation of Natives, and Alaska Native Coalition in case holding that the Indian Child Welfare Act and Public Law 280 left intact the inherent authority of Alaska Native tribes to adjudicate child custody and related matters, and entitling those decrees to full faith and credit).
- ◆ *Catholic Social Services v. C.A.A. and Cook Inlet Tribal Council*, 783 P.2d 1159 (Alaska 1989), *cert denied*, 495 U.S. 948 (1990) (counsel of record for respondent tribal organization (and petitioner in the U.S. Supreme Court) in case finding Indian Child Welfare Act does not mandate tribal notice of state court voluntary parental rights termination proceeding).
- ◆ *Matter of 1981, 1982, 1983, 1984, and 1985 Delinquent Property Taxes Owed City of Nome, Alaska*, 780 P.2d 363 (Alaska 1989) (of counsel to Native American Rights Fund for IRA Tribe in successfully asserting immunity from city property taxes on tribal property situated outside Indian country).
- ◆ *Aloysius v. Yukon-Kuskokwim Health Corporation*, E.E.O.C. No. 380-88-0792 (Seattle Dist. Apr. 15, 1988) (counsel of record in four cases establishing that Alaska Native nonprofit health care and social service providers enjoy tribal employer exemption under Title VII of the Civil Rights Act).
- ◆ *Native Village of Stevens v. Alaska Management & Planning*, 757 P.2d 548 (Alaska 1988) (counsel for record for *Amici* tribes seeking reconsideration of ruling determining that no federally recognized tribes exist in Alaska) (reconsideration denied).
- ◆ *In re K.E.*, 744 P.2d 1173 (Alaska 1987) (counsel of record for *Amici* tribes in case ruling that the Indian Child Welfare Act's mandatory transfer provisions do not apply in states such as Alaska covered by Public Law 280).
- ◆ *Sitka Tribe of Alaska v. Lujan*, No. A91-492 CIV (D. Alaska 1986) (counsel of record in first-impression case ordering Secretary of the Interior to resume tribal constitutional elections in Alaska under the Indian Reorganization Act).
- ◆ *Jicarilla Apache Tribe v. Supron Energy Corporation*, 728 F.2d 1555 (10th Cir. 1984) (co-counsel for *Amici* Shoshone and Arapaho Tribes of the Wind River Reservation regarding

proper interpretation of oil and gas royalty regulations and lease terms).

- ◆ *Assiniboine and Sioux Tribes v. Montana*, 568 F. Supp. 269 (D. Mt. 1983) (counsel of record in case recovering tax refund for sales taxes unlawfully collected on on-reservation vehicle sales to the Tribes, but denying refunds associated with sales to individual Indians).
- ◆ *Rice v. Rehner*, 463 U.S. 713 (1983) (co-counsel with Harry Sachse for *Amici* Shoshone Tribe of the Wind River Reservation, *et al.* regarding extent to which states may regulate Indian liquor sales in Indian country under 18 U.S.C. 1161).
- ◆ *Minnesota Chippewa Tribe and Red Lake Band v. United States*, 230 Ct. Cl. 996 (1982); 229 Ct. Cl. 673 (1981); 229 Ct. Cl. 667 (1981); *Minnesota Chippewa Band v. United States*, 230 Ct. Cl. 761 (1982), 230 Ct. Cl. 776 (1982); 229 Ct. Cl. 736 (1981); 229 Ct. Cl. 710 (1981); 229 Ct. Cl. 707 (1981); 229 Ct. Cl. 681 (1981); 229 Ct. Cl. 678 (1981); 229 Ct. Cl. 675 (1981); 229 Ct. Cl. 666 (1981) *Red Lake Band v. United States*, 229 Ct. Cl. 816 (1981); 229 Ct. Cl. 272, 667 F.2d 73 (1981) (Co-counsel with Marvin Sonosky in successfully defending against dismissal of multi-million dollar accounting damage claims against the United States based on *res judicata*).
- ◆ *Lower Sioux Indian Community v. United States*, 224 Ct. Cl. 458, 626 F. 2d 828 (1980) (co-counsel with Marvin Sonosky for eight bands of Eastern Sioux in recovery of money damages for funds due under various treaties).

REPRESENTATIVE LEGISLATIVE MATTERS

- ◆ Annual Appropriations Act measures
- ◆ Indian Self-Governance Amendments of 2000, Pub. L. 106-260
- ◆ Federally Recognized Indian Tribe List Act of 1994, Pub. L. 103-454, Title I
- ◆ Tlingit and Haida Status Clarification Act of 1994, Pub. L. 103-454, Title III
- ◆ Indian Self-Determination Act Amendments of 1994, Pub. L. 103-413
- ◆ Indian Reorganization Act Amendments of 1994, Pub. L. 103-263
- ◆ Pub. L. 103-138, Title III, sec. 308 (1993) (Federal Tort Claims Act provision)
- ◆ Indian Health Care Improvement Act Amendments of 1992, Pub. L. 102-573
- ◆ Indian Self-Determination Act Amendments of 1990, Pub. L. 101-644
- ◆ Indian Health Care Improvement Act Amendments of 1990, Pub. L. 101-630
- ◆ Pub. L. 101-512, Title III, sec. 314 (1990) (Federal Tort Claims Act provision)

- ◆ Indian Health Care Improvement Act Amendments of 1988, Pub. L. 100-713
- ◆ Indian Reorganization Act Amendments of 1988, Pub. L. 100-581
- ◆ Indian Self-Determination Act Amendments of 1988, Pub. L. 100-472
- ◆ Pub. L. 100-202 (1987) (Federal Tort Claims Act provision)
- ◆ Alaska Native Claims Settlement Act Amendments (various)
- ◆ Additional unenacted amendments to Titles I, IV and VI of the Indian Self-Determination Act, and to the Indian Child Welfare Act of 1975.

PUBLICATIONS

CAUGHT IN A CROSSFIRE: CONFLICT IN THE COURTS, ALASKA TRIBES IN THE BALANCE 1990, by the President and Fellows of Harvard College

PROFESSIONAL ACTIVITIES

- ◆ Presenter: THE SUPREME COURT'S UNANIMOUS OPINION IN *CHEROKEE NATION V. LEAVITT*: LESSONS FOR THE FUTURE FEDERAL BAR ASSOCIATION AWARD INDIAN LAW CONFERENCE (2005)
- ◆ Lawyer Representative for the District of Alaska to the Ninth Circuit (by appointment of the Alaska Bar Association) (2004-2007)
- ◆ Guest Lecturer: Alaska Native Tribal Lands, Sovereignty and Subsistence
Yale University School of Law (2000)
- ◆ Racism and the Development of Federal Indian Law in Alaska
Federal Bar Association, Mid-Year Indian Law Conference (2000)
Washington, D.C.
- ◆ Guest Lecturer: Alaska Natives and Federal Indian Law
Georgetown University School of Law (1999)
- ◆ Founding Co-Chairman, Partners in Justice Campaign (1998)
Committee Member (1999, 2000)
Alaska Legal Services Corporation
- ◆ Founder, Chairman (1984-1993) and Executive Committee Member (1984-1993)
Alaska Native Law Section
Alaska Bar Association

- ◆ President (1986-1987), Vice President (1985-1986, 1992-1993)
and Member (1984-1993)
Board of Directors
Alaska Legal Services Corporation
- ◆ Co-Chairperson (1992 and 1993)
Federal Bar Association
Annual Federal Indian Law Conference
- ◆ Board Member (1992-1993)
Civil Justice Reform Act Committee
U. S. District Court for the District of Alaska
- ◆ Member, Planning Committee
1990 Northern Justice Conference
(Alaska, Yukon Territory, British Columbia, former U.S.S.R.)
- ◆ National Indian Health Board, 2000 National Impact Award
- ◆ National Indian Health Board, 1987 Medallion Award
- ◆ Editor and Contributing writer, NCAI National Policy Work Group on Contract Support Costs (1998-2000), and Work Group (a.k.a Task Force) member (1998-2006)
- ◆ Presenter, the INDIAN SELF-DETERMINATION ACT AND CONTRACT COSTS: AN ONGOING SAGA
National Congress of American Indians (2003)
- ◆ Presenter, National Indian Health Board Annual Conventions (1986-1999, 2004)
- ◆ Presenter (14 programs) and Planning Committee Chair, Co-Chair or member
(representative topics have included federal Indian law, U.S. Supreme Court developments in Indian law, tribal courts, the Indian Child Welfare Act, Alaska Native ANCSA land matters; ANCSA corporations and Alaska corporate law; surveys of recent federal legislative developments; tribal economic development, and self-determination and self-governance laws)
Annual Alaska Native Law Conferences (1984-2000, 2003)
Alaska Bar Association
- ◆ Presenter, THE JUNE 1999 FINAL REPORT OF THE NCAI NATIONAL POLICY WORKGROUP ON CONTRACT SUPPORT COSTS (1999, 2003)
- ◆ Presenter, TRIBAL SELF-GOVERNANCE AND SELF-DETERMINATION UNDER THE INDIAN SELF-DETERMINATION ACT, COMING TOGETHER OF THE PEOPLES CONFERENCE—*SEEDING CHARRED GROUND*
University of Wisconsin Law School (1999)

- ◆ Presenter, FEDERAL “INDIAN COUNTRY” LAW AFTER THE SUPREME COURT’S *VENETIE* DECISION
Alaska Bar Convention and Alaska Judicial Conference (joint session) (1998)
- ◆ Presenter, INDIAN LAW AND THE SUPREME COURT’S 1997-98 TERM
Native American Bar Association and Federal Bar Association (joint session) (1998)
- ◆ Presenter: INDIAN TRIBES AND THE FEDERAL TORT CLAIMS ACT
Twenty-Fifth Anniversary Program of the Native American Rights Fund (1996)
- ◆ Presenter: NATIVE AMERICAN HIRING AND CONTRACTING PREFERENCE LAWS
Federal Bar Association, Annual Federal Indian Law Conference (1996)
- ◆ Presenter: THE INDIAN SELF-DETERMINATION ACT AMENDMENTS OF 1994
University of Wisconsin Annual Sovereignty Symposium (Stevens Point) (1996)
- ◆ Guest Lecturer: Alaska Native Tribal Lands, Sovereignty and Subsistence
Harvard Law School (1995, 1996)
- ◆ Presenter: THE INDIAN SELF-DETERMINATION ACT AMENDMENTS OF 1994
Federal Bar Association Annual Federal Indian Law Conference (1995)
- ◆ Presenter: INDIAN TRIBES AND THE UNITED STATES SUPREME COURT
University of Wisconsin Annual Sovereignty Symposium (Stevens Point) (1995)
- ◆ Presenter: THE INDIAN SELF-DETERMINATION ACT AMENDMENTS OF 1994
Affiliated Tribes of Northwest Indians Winter Conference (1995)
- ◆ Presenter: THE INDIAN SELF-DETERMINATION ACT AMENDMENTS OF 1994
A seminar series held in Albuquerque, Minneapolis, Seattle and Anchorage (1995)
- ◆ Principal Author: ANALYSIS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR SOLICITOR’S OPINION ON
THE TRIBAL STATUS AND POWERS OF ALASKA NATIVE VILLAGES
National Indian Policy Center, George Washington University (1994)
- ◆ Guest Lecturer: Trespassers on ANCSA Lands
Bristol Bay Native Corporation Officers’ and Directors’ Workshop (1993)
- ◆ Presenter: BIA AND IHS FAILURES TO IMPLEMENT THE INDIAN SELF-DETERMINATION ACT
AMENDMENTS OF 1988
National Congress of American Indians Annual Convention (1993)
- ◆ Presenter: FEDERAL INDIAN LAW IN ALASKA: A BRIEF REVIEW OF LITIGATION AND
LEGISLATION RELEVANT TO SELECTED VILLAGE TRIBAL SOVEREIGNTY ISSUES
Annual Alaska Judicial Conference (1992)

- ◆ Presenter: REVISITING THE INDIAN SELF-DETERMINATION ACT IN THE NEXT CONGRESS: NECESSARY REFORM – AGAIN!
National Congress of American Indians Annual Convention (1992)
- ◆ Guest Lecturer: Alaska Natives and Federal Indian Law
Harvard Law School (1991)
- ◆ Presenter: TRIBAL SOVEREIGNTY IN AMERICA AND ALASKA
Alaska Academy of Trial Lawyers, Community Law School (1991)
- ◆ Guest Lecturer: Alaska Natives and Federal Indian Law
Harvard Law School (1990)
- ◆ Presenter: HARVARD INDIAN LAW SYMPOSIUM
Harvard Law School (1989)
- ◆ Author: REPORT OF THE COMMITTEE ON SELECTED REGULATORY IMPLEMENTATION ISSUES ARISING UNDER THE 1987 AND 1988 AMENDMENTS TO THE INDIAN SELF-DETERMINATION ACT OF 1975
National Indian Health Board Self-Determination Act Committee (1988)

EDUCATION

University of Virginia School of Law
Charlottesville, Virginia
Degree: J.D. (1978)

Order of the Coif (for academic achievement)

Executive Director (1976-1977), Post-Conviction Assistance Project, Inc.:

Supervised litigation in areas of state and federal habeas corpus, 42 U.S.C. § 1983 (civil rights), and other civil litigation in prison law arena, *i.e.*, medical treatment, libraries, sentencing of drug offenders, police brutality, ineffective assistance of counsel; supervised and participated in P-CAP program representing inmates at prison disciplinary hearings and subsequent administrative appeals; participated in P-CAP pretrial bail release program.

Legal Environment Group, member (1976-78)

Clinical Practice Seminar (1978)

(Assigned to Charlottesville-Albemarle County Legal Aid Society on Truth-in-Lending Act matters.) (Supervised by Professor Robert Conclin and Assistant Director Scott M. Williams.)

Forensic Psychiatry Clinic (1978) (Supervised by Professors Charles Whitebread, Richard Bonney and Browning Hoffman)

Yale University
New Haven, Connecticut
Degree: B.A. in Philosophy and Psychology (December 1974)

PRIOR EMPLOYMENT

Résumé of Lloyd B. Miller

Page 10 of 11 Pages

Law Clerk to the Hon. James M. Fitzgerald, Chief Judge
United States District Court, District of Alaska
Federal Building and Courthouse
701 C Street
Anchorage, Alaska 99501
(July 1978 - July 1979)

Legal Intern, Office of General Counsel
Toxic Substances Control Act Division
United States Environmental Protection Agency
Washington, D.C. 20460
(May - August 1977)
researched EPA rule-making authority and assisted in rule-making proceedings under Toxic Substances Control Act of 1976; conducted survey and analysis for EPA and The White House on all federal laws regulating hazardous substances.

Legal Intern, Legal Action Center
271 Madison Avenue
New York, New York
(May - August 1976)
researched matters involving employment discrimination based on sex, race, prior criminal record or drug involvement, police misconduct, municipal liability, official immunity, federal court abstention, federal court ancillary jurisdiction and attorney-client confidentiality

Bail Release Screener and Interviewer
New Haven Pre-Trial Services Council
New Haven, Connecticut
(September - December 1974)

Intern, Legal Aid Society of New York City
Southern District
Centralized Narcotics Division
(May - July 1974)

BAR ADMISSIONS

District of Columbia Bar (1979)
Alaska Bar (1979)
U.S. Supreme Court (1984)
U.S. Court of Appeals for the D.C. Circuit (1980)
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit (1996)
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Tenth Circuit (1982)
U.S. Court of Appeals for the Federal Circuit (1999)
U.S. Court of Federal Claims (1979)
U.S. District Court for the District of Columbia (1981)
U.S. District Court for the District of Alaska (1979)

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 1

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----		----
5009.010000	07/03/2002	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	[REDACTED] view the proposed "benchmarking" stipulation (both draft and transmitted versions).	ARCH
5009.010000	07/08/2002	LBM	R	A	1	0.70	E-mail and attempted telephone conferences with the Department of Justice regarding settlement status; e-mail with Mike Gross; review e-mails regarding stipulation on carry-forward; telephone conference with the Department of Justice counsel regarding the status s [REDACTED]	ARCH
5009.010000	07/12/2002	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	[REDACTED] ment and equitable relief meeting.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/22/2002	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	[REDACTED]	ARCH
5009.010000	07/25/2002	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Collect material for meetings with all counsel and the Department of Justice.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/25/2002	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Telephone confere [REDACTED]	ARCH
5009.010000	07/29/2002	LBM	R	A	1	8.00	Research the fiscal year 2001 budget documents; work with Mike Gross et al on oral argument preparation and preparation for meeting with the Department of Justice and the Office of Inspector General; conference with the Office of Inspector General and the Department of Justice regarding equitable relief issues.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/30/2002	LBM	R	A	1	6.00	Conference with the Department of Justice and plaintiff's counsel regarding equitable relief issues; conference with the Department of Justice and plaintiff's counsel to negotiate final settlement terms of PSA-2.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/31/2002	LBM	R	A	1	13.00	Conclude negotiations over PSA-2 documents; continue conference with the Department of Justice and the Office of Inspector General regarding equitable relief issues; work on oral argument with Mike Gross, et al.; return travel from Santa Fe to Albuquerque to Anchorage.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/05/2002	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Review post-meeting documents regarding equitable relief issues.	ARCH
5009.020000	01/08/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails regarding meeting on equitable relief.	ARCH
5009.020000	01/12/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	Telephone conference with the Department of Justice regarding D.C. meetings on equitable relief, and proposed telephonic meeting on direct contract support cost issues; multiple e-mails with the Department of Justice and others regarding same.	ARCH
5009.020000	01/14/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails regarding equitable relief meetings.	ARCH
5009.020000	01/20/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	E-mail to the Department of Justice regarding direct contract support cost meeting; review new CRIS	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 2

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----	-----
5009.020000	01/21/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.10	ARCH
							materials; e-mail with CBR regarding D.C. meeting summary; prepare for D.C. meeting regarding same. Telephone conference messages with Department of Justice counsel regarding meeting on January 23 (with January 20 call); review Indian Health Service Circular regarding same; review multiple e-mails regarding same with Bryant Rogers, Bill Perry and Mike Gross.
5009.020000	01/23/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.90	ARCH
							Round-trip travel to the Department of Justice and conferences and conference calls with the Department of Justice and Bureau of Indian Affairs regarding direct contract support cost issue, outlining proposed timeline and process.
5009.020000	02/05/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	ARCH
							Telephone conference with Mike Gross and Eric Triesman regarding equitable relief and contract support cost issues.
5009.020000	02/07/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	ARCH
							E-mails with the Indian Health Service regarding direct contract support cost policies.
5009.020000	02/11/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	ARCH
							Review various e-mails regarding benchmarking issue and respond to same.
5009.020000	02/14/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	ARCH
							Multiple e-mails with Bryant Rogers and Greg Anderson regarding benchmarking issue.
5009.020000	02/17/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	ARCH
							Multiple e-mails with Mike Gross and Bryant Rogers regarding benchmarking.
5009.020000	02/27/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	ARCH
							Multiple e-mails with the Department of Justice regarding equitable relief issues.
5009.020000	02/28/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	ARCH
							Telephone conference with Mike Gross regarding equitable relief issues and regarding e-mails with the Department of Justice.
5009.020000	02/28/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	ARCH
							Multiple e-mails regarding equitable relief issues (benchmark/direct contract support costs).
5009.010000	03/10/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	ARCH
							Prepare materials for the trip to Albuquerque/Zuni to report to the client.
5009.010000	03/10/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.00	ARCH
							Travel from the office to Phoenix en route to Albuquerque. (Pro rata)
5009.010000	03/11/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.30	ARCH
							Travel from Phoenix to Albuquerque. (Pro rata)
5009.010000	03/12/2003	LBM	R	A	1	5.00	ARCH
							Round-trip travel to Zuni Pueblo and confer with Lieutenant Governor and Council Members. (Pro rata)
5009.010000	03/13/2003	LBM	R	A	1	4.00	ARCH
							Return travel from Albuquerque to the office. (Pro rata)
5009.020000	03/17/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.20	ARCH
							Telephone conference with the Department of Justice regarding direct contract support cost claim negotiations; work on e-mail regarding same; review draft e-mail correspondence from Bryant Rogers and

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 3

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----	-----
						comment on same.	
5009.020000	03/18/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.30 Work on Mike Bryant letter to the Department of Justice; e-mails regarding same; telephone conference regarding same.	ARCH
5009.020000	03/19/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Review latest letter and telephone conference with Mike Gross and Bryant Rogers regarding same.	ARCH
5009.020000	03/20/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40 Review draft of the equitable relief letter to the Department of Justice and comment on same.	ARCH
5009.020000	03/24/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.20 Telephone conference with Mike Gross; telephone conference with the Department of Justice regarding settling the equitable relief issue.	ARCH
5009.020000	03/29/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.50 Work on gathering materials for the direct contract support costs negotiation with the Department of Justice in D.C.	ARCH
5009.020000	03/30/2003	LBM	R	A	1	6.00 Travel for Department of Justice meetings over equitable relief negotiations and direct contract support costs.	ARCH
5009.020000	03/30/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.50 Multiple telephone conferences with the Department of Justice; work on proposal regarding timing and substance of settlement proposal.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/01/2003	LBM	R	A	1	4.00 Meet with the Department of Justice to negotiate settlement of the equitable relief claims and direct contract support costs claims.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/01/2003	LBM	R	A	1	6.00 Return travel from D.C. to Anchorage from negotiations with the Department of Justice (pro rata).	ARCH
5009.010000	04/02/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.00 Work on follow-up letter regarding direct contract support cost negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/04/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.20 Review and comment on the benchmarking order.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/14/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Review the draft National Congress of American Indians contract.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/16/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Review multiple e-mails regarding order.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/22/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40 Telephone conference with the Department of the Interior attorney regarding proposed process to move direct contract support cost discussions along; memorandum to other attorneys regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/28/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.20 Review the Bay Mills claim form and direct letters regarding same; review MPT form regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/01/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.20 Telephone conferences and e-mails regarding direct contract support costs rescheduled call regarding benchmarking redraft.	ARCH
5009.020000	05/05/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.50 Telephone conference with the Department of Justice and the Department of the Interior attorneys	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 4

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
							regarding the progress on the BIA adoption of the direct contract support costs policy.	
5009.020000	05/06/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.50	Multiple e-mails with Bryant Rogers and Mike Gross regarding benchmarking and direct contract support cost issues.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/15/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails regarding securing reimbursement of equitable relief out-of-pocket costs.	ARCH
5009.020000	05/20/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.70	Research and work on equitable relief cost reimbursement motion.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/22/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.10	Work on the motion for reimbursement of equitable relief costs; telephone conferences and e-mails with the office manager regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/27/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Multiple e-mails and telephone conferences with ICAS and ICAS consultant regarding benchmarking ideas.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/30/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Brief review of the new proposed benchmarking order.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/02/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Telephone conference with the Department of Justice regarding the status of the Department of the Interior efforts to prepare a new direct contract support cost policy.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/03/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.10	Telephone conference with the Department of the Interior regarding teleconference.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/04/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Research; e-mails and telephone conferences regarding application for costs.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/09/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Multiple e-mails regarding National Congress of American Indians contract.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/10/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails with National Congress of American Indians regarding the contract for equitable relief work; conference call regarding same with National Congress of American Indians.	ARCH
5009.020000	06/15/2003	LBM	R	A	1	4.00	Travel from Anchorage to Phoenix to meet with National Congress of American Indians regarding contract to monitor equitable relief issues (pro rata); review contract and develop edits to same.	ARCH
5009.020000	06/15/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.00	Work on National Congress of American Indians contract revisions and type same.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/15/2003	LBM	R	A	1	3.50	Travel from the office to the National Congress of American Indians conference in Seldovia. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.020000	06/16/2003	LBM	R	A	1	3.00	Work on National Congress of American Indians contract; complete same; discussions with National Congress of American Indians representatives regarding same; work on National Congress of American Indians resolution regarding additional contract support cost-related National Congress of American	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 5

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
							Indians initiatives (pro rata).	
5009.010000	06/17/2003	LBM	R	A	1	3.00	Attend National Congress of American Indians conference awaiting action on resolution. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	06/18/2003	LBM	R	A	1	3.00	Attend National Congress of American Indians conference to secure passage of resolution. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	06/20/2003	LBM	R	A	1	3.50	Return travel from National Congress of American Indians to the office.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/01/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	E-mails with Mike Gross regarding Bureau of Indian Affairs's contract support cost notice and regarding the National Congress of American Indians contract; review the contract support cost notice again; e-mails with National Congress of American Indians regarding same; edit the National Congress of American Indians contract.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/03/2003	LBM	R	A	1	5.25	Travel from Anchorage to D.C. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	07/09/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.80	Round trip to National Congress of American Indians and meet with the Executive Director and Mike Gross (by phone) to discuss National Congress of American Indians contract and related new developments.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/10/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Finalize the National Congress of American Indians contract; direct e-mail regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/17/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review new draft of the status report to the Court.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/07/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Review Bureau of Indian Affairs letter regarding new agency direct contract support cost meetings; telephone conference with the Department of Justice regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/08/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Telephone conferences with the Shoshone-Paiute Tribes Finance Director and conference call with Bryant Rogers regarding benchmarking, and regarding the Court's Order regarding class notice and regarding direct contract support cost meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/18/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.50	E-mails with Karen Richardson regarding new direct contract support cost BIA initiative; telephone conference and voicemail to other tribal counsel regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/18/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review benchmarking materials.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/18/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review multiple e-mails regarding global settlement issues and scheduling.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/19/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.40	Multiple e-mails with Mike Gross and National Congress of American Indians regarding the National Congress of American Indians contract; telephone conference with Bryant Rogers regarding the direct contract support cost issue; e-mail (8/18) to Indian	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 6

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
5009.010000	08/20/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.80	Health Service regarding direct contract support cost documents; internet research; telephone conference with Indian Health Service; telephone conference with the Cherokee Nation, all regarding Indian Health Service direct contract support cost guidelines, etc. Telephone conference with Department of Interior counsel; telephone conference with Bryant Rogers; multiple e-mails, all regarding Bureau of Indian Affairs's direct contract support cost meetings and related issues; e-mail documents regarding same; telephone conference with Bill Perry regarding same; send faxes regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/20/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.30	Review new correspondence from the Department of Justice regarding direct contract support cost meetings; work on response to same; multiple e-mails regarding direct contract support cost meetings; e-mails and review/comment on the National Congress of American Indians motion.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/25/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.70	Multiple attempted telephone conferences with Department of Justice attorney regarding direct contract support cost meetings; telephone conference with Bryant Rogers regarding same; telephone conference with Shoshone-Paiute and Cherokee Nation regarding same; telephone conference with the Associate Solicitor's Office regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/27/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.50	Telephone conference with Mike Gross and Bryant Rogers regarding direct contract support cost meeting in Albuquerque; e-mails with the Department of Justice regarding meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/28/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	Finalize client memorandum regarding direct contract support cost meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/28/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.80	Work on client memorandum regarding direct contract support cost meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/28/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Telephone conference with Geoffrey Strommer regarding Seattle meeting.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/28/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.30	E-mails with other counsel to schedule a teleconference on direct contract support cost process; telephone conference with the Cherokee Nation regarding Oklahoma Bureau of Indian Affairs session on direct contract support costs; telephone conferences with the Department of Justice regarding direct contract support cost issues.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/29/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Telephone conference with Mike Gross regarding direct contract support cost meetings and regarding	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 7

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----	-----
						distribution status.	
5009.010000	08/29/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.60 Multiple e-mails and telephone conferences with the Bureau of Indian Affairs regarding direct contract support cost meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/29/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80 Work on client memorandum and distribution issues with Bill Perry all regarding direct contract support cost Bureau of Indian Affairs meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/02/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.10 Attempted telephone conferences with George Clark regarding regional meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/03/2003	LBM	R	A	1	3.80 Attend Bureau of Indian Affairs Alaska Region meeting on developing new direct contract support cost policy.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/04/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.90 Telephone conference with the client regarding disc survey costs; telephone conference with Mike Gross regarding MPLS and ANC meetings and regarding the status of distribution processing.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/04/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.20 E-mail follow-up to the regional meetings on Bureau of Indian Affairs direct contract support cost initiative; follow-up calls with participants review RDEW report and multiple e-mails regarding same and regarding National Congress of American Indians motion.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/05/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.20 Edit note to client regarding RDEW status.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/10/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Telephone conference with Mike Gross regarding settlement meetings in Sacramento and preparation for same, regarding status of claims analysis and need (or new letter to tribes submitting insufficient date).	ARCH
5009.010000	09/11/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 E-mails regarding court filing for National Congress of American Indians and regarding claims process status regarding Sacramento.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/12/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.00 Telephone conference with National Congress of American Indians regarding upcoming meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/12/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40 Work with Zuni regarding corrected claim information; draft correspondence regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/17/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.90 Multiple telephone conferences and e-mails regarding settlement strategy considerations.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/18/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 E-mails regarding insufficient data issue and review draft revised letter regarding same; telephone conference with Bryant Rogers; telephone conferences with Ron Allen regarding direct contract support cost meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/19/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.90 Conference call with Mike Gross and Bryant Rogers regarding upcoming settlement negotiations and	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 8

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
							planning for same; review e-mails regarding claims process and insufficient data; attempted telephone conferences with George Clark regarding direct contract support cost Bureau of Indian Affairs lead.	
5009.010000	09/21/2003	LBM	R	A	1	6.50	Travel from Anchorage to Sacramento meetings and review documents to prepare for same.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/22/2003	LBM	R	A	1	11.00	Morning, afternoon and late afternoon meetings with the Department of Justice, Department of the Interior and other counsel regarding global settlement on equitable relief.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/23/2003	LBM	R	A	1	8.50	Continued meetings with other counsel, the Department of the Interior and the Department of Justice regarding global settlement on equitable relief.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/23/2003	LBM	R	A	1	6.00	Return travel from Sacramento to the office.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/26/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Prepare for the self-governance conference and the NIHB conference remarks on the status of contract support cost cases. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	09/29/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Telephone conference with Mike Gross regarding TCC claims issues and review e-mails regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/30/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.50	Travel to MPLS; prepare remarks regarding ongoing contract support cost litigation for NIHB, including report on direct contract support cost Bureau of Indian Affairs initiative and status of 2PSA distribution. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	10/01/2003	LBM	R	A	1	4.00	Attend NIHB conference for workshop on all Contract Support Costs cases developments. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	10/01/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.50	Multiple telephone conferences (and messages) with Rich Meyers regarding status of regulatory direct contract support cost initiative with Bureau of Indian Affairs, the need for a 10/2 meeting with Acting Assistant Secretary and Tribal Services Branch; exchange voice mails regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/02/2003	LBM	R	A	1	3.50	Return travel from Minneapolis NIHB meeting to Anchorage. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	10/07/2003	MBO	R	A	1	0.10	Conference with Lloyd Miller regarding the facsimile to Mike Gross regarding the data list.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/07/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Telephone conference with Mike Gross regarding the status distribution process, regarding the Bureau of Indian Affairs direct contract support cost initiative, and regarding the draft letter summarizing equitable relief negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/08/2003	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	Facsimile to Mike Gross the selected pages of the	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 9

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
5009.010000	10/08/2003	LBM	R	A	1	3.53	data list with Lloyd Miller's questions. Prepare for remarks on contract support cost issues, proposed legislative reform and the status of the contract support cost litigation; travel from Anchorage to Palm Springs for national self-governance conference. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	10/09/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.66	Attend national self-governance conference to present remarks on contract support cost issues, proposed legislative reform and the status of the contract support cost litigation, Palm Springs. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	10/10/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Edit Mike Gross' letter to the Department of Justice regarding settlement ideas on equitable relief; e-mail same to Mike Gross.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/10/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.66	Return travel from Palm Springs to the office. (Pro rata)	ARCH
5009.010000	10/19/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails regarding meetings in Albuquerque and Bureau of Indian Affairs direct contract support cost scheduled meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/19/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review final letter to the Department of Justice regarding equitable relief.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/31/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Edit proposed letter to Judge Hansen.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/10/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Multiple e-mails regarding direct contract support cost meetings.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/01/2003	LBM	R	A	1	0.70	Multiple e-mails with Department of Justice regarding direct contract support cost process; telephone conference with National Congress of American Indians regarding same and regarding National Congress of American Indians agreed-upon website; multiple e-mails with co-class counsel and class monitor regarding claims letters.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/02/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails regarding scheduling negotiation session; check calendar to propose dates.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/07/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	E-mails confirming next negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/18/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Telephone conference with Mike Gross regarding D.C. meetings with the Department of Justice; brief review of Bryant Rogers' e-mail regarding motions to distribute funds to the class and regarding potential funding to pay for new direct contract support cost survey initiative.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/22/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Telephone conferences with Bryant Rogers and Mike Gross regarding Department of Justice negotiations and e-mails with Department of Justice regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/24/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.50	Travel to D.C. for Department of Justice negotiations	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 10

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
							(pro rata).	
5009.010000	01/26/2004	LBM	R	A	1	10.00	Travel from New York to D.C. for negotiations with the Department of Justice. Engage in same, and follow-on discussions.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/27/2004	LBM	R	A	1	3.50	Continued negotiations with the Department of Justice.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/29/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.50	Work on client report regarding negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/30/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Edit Zuni client memorandum regarding D.C. negotiations in final.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/31/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	E-mails with Mike Gross and Bryant Rogers regarding direct contract support cost issues.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/03/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	Review Bryant Rogers' memorandum regarding multiple rates; e-mails and letters regarding payment of the Zuni settlement.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/17/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Work on expense reimbursement pleadings.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/18/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Work on expense reimbursement pleadings.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/19/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Telephone conference with Mike Gross regarding filing cost applications simultaneously.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/19/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Edit cost reimbursement application.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/19/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails regarding costs.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/23/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Edit proposed Order.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/24/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	E-mails regarding direct contract support cost survey reimbursement of costs.	ARCH
5009.010000	03/18/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Review and respond to e-mail regarding Mike Gross' cost reimbursement motion draft.	ARCH
5009.010000	03/29/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review all recent filings.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/12/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	E-mails regarding equitable relief negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/12/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails with Mike Gross and Bryant Rogers regarding equitable relief.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/10/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Telephone conference with Mike Gross.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/01/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review e-mails regarding renegotiations and Department of Justice and respond regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/06/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	Telephone conference with Michael P. Gross and C. Bryant Rogers regarding stalled equitable relief issues regarding collateral Bureau of Indian Affairs litigation.	ARCH
5009.010000	07/23/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Review e-mails and edit Michael Gross's draft letter to Judge Hansen concerning negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/31/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Review e-mail regarding Department of Justice request for additional time to finalize settlement proposal.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/13/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Review court report, correspondence and e-mails with the Department of Justice.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/01/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails with Mike Gross regarding "CRIS" account issues.	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 11

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
5009.010000	01/14/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Multiple e-mails with Zuni, Mike Gross regarding possible Sacramento negotiations; telephone conference with Rich Myers.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/21/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Telephone conference with Mike Gross, Bryant Rogers and Marcel regarding equitable relief negotiations and need for premeeting prior to next government negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/24/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Work on Seattle arrangements for settlement meeting among Plaintiffs.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/25/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.50	Work on Seattle travel arrangements.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/06/2005	LBM	R	A	1	4.00	Travel from Anchorage to Seattle for meetings with other attorneys and tribal experts to shape settlement proposal.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/07/2005	LBM	R	A	1	8.00	Meeting with M. Gross, C.B. Rogers, Kerkmans and W. Parkhurst in Seattle, Washington.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/08/2005	LBM	R	A	1	8.00	Morning meetings with other attorneys in Day 2 of internal advance negotiations before March meeting with Department of Justice and Department of the Interior attorneys; return travel from Seattle to Anchorage.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/09/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	Draft client status report.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/22/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review and approve letter to Department of Justice (includes Feb. 21 correspondence).	ARCH
5009.010000	02/23/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Convey settlement materials to Pueblo of Zuni Governor Quetawki and the Finance Director Pinto.	ARCH
5009.010000	03/03/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Telephone conference with B. Pinto regarding Santa Fe negotiations; consider issues for session and send emails with other attorneys and experts regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	03/07/2005	RDM	R	A	1	0.80	Review draft class certification motion; pull and review selected certification cases and authorities cited in draft motion; note to LBM with suggestions for strengthening class certification motion.	ARCH
5009.010000	03/09/2005	LBM	R	A	1	2.90	Multiple telephone calls to CLT regarding coordinating with Attorney Gross a meeting on March 10; telephone conference with W. Parkhurst regarding DCSC aspect of negotiations; listen to messages regarding balance of negotiations; travel to Albuquerque to meet regarding negotiations and DCSC issues.	ARCH
5009.010000	03/10/2005	LBM	R	A	1	2.50	Meeting with Attorney Gross and Attorney Rogers regarding DCSC issues in context of settlement of equitable claims.	ARCH
5009.010000	03/11/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Exchange email correspondence with Attorney Gross;	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 12

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----	-----
5009.010000	03/14/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	ARCH
							telephone conference with Attorney Rogers. E-mail correspondence with CCH regarding Contract Support Costs litigation; telephone conference with class member (Cahto) regarding pending BIA Contract Support Costs litigation.
5009.010000	03/14/2005	CCH	R	A	1	0.60	ARCH
							Telephone conference with Cahto Tribe about contract support costs cases.
5009.010000	03/21/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	ARCH
							Review emails regarding DOJ request for a briefing schedule and consider same with MBO.
5009.010000	03/22/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.90	ARCH
							Consider and respond to B. Rogers email; follow-up emails with M. Gross and B. Rogers regarding discussions with DOJ; telephone conference regarding same.
5009.010000	03/25/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	ARCH
							Conference with LBM and AMS regarding research for supplemental briefing.
5009.010000	03/28/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.10	ARCH
							E-mail LBM information regarding presumption against contract authority.
5009.010000	03/28/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	ARCH
							Review and respond to DOJ emails regarding jeopardized settlement discussions.
5009.010000	03/30/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.50	ARCH
							Conference with LBM regarding strategy for cap year claims and supplemental filings.
5009.010000	03/30/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.00	ARCH
							Work with MBO on cap year ideas for new round of briefing; emails with M. Gross regarding briefing schedule.
5009.010000	04/08/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	ARCH
							Conference with LBM regarding response to "notice" and supplemental brief.
5009.010000	04/10/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	ARCH
							Review and respond to proposed motion regarding supplemental briefs; e-mails with MPG regarding same.
5009.010000	04/11/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.20	ARCH
							E-mails with DOJ regarding stipulated discovery schedule; multiple telephone conferences with MPG and CBR.
5009.010000	04/21/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	ARCH
							Review recent Ramah filings.
5009.010000	04/21/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	ARCH
							Telephone conference with opposing counsel; work on response to Notice.
5009.010000	04/25/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.10	ARCH
							Discuss Ramah MDL non-opposition with PSC.
5009.010000	08/26/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	ARCH
							Telephone conference with Rich Meyers regarding possible reactivation of case to bring a motion for declaratory judgment regarding direct contract support costs.
5009.010000	12/14/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	ARCH
							Work on notice of unavailability.
5009.010000	02/15/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	ARCH
							Telephone conference (message) with ACR regarding FY 2006 Senate language; telephone conference regarding Bryant Rogers breach of agreement; web research regarding budget on DCSC costs.

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 13

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	---	---	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
5009.010000	05/09/2006	LBM	R	A	1	2.50	Pro rated: Travel Anchorage to Grand Traverse Self-Governance Conference for Contract Support Costs presentation in Zuni, Ramah and other litigation; Indian Health Service Contract Support Costs initiatives; Bureau of Indian Affairs Contract Support Costs initiative; Bureau of Indian Affairs litigation.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/11/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Prepare presentation on Ramah case; present same at Self-Governance Conference; conference with B. Rogers to coordinate same.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/09/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails with Tunica's Counsel and Rogers regarding preparing DCSC report to Court.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/09/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Review coverage of Bureau of Indian Affairs Contract Support Costs policy; continue work on court report.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/11/2006	LBM	R	A	1	4.20	Work on and complete draft report regarding DCSC claims.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/12/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.50	Review and comment on draft update to court on equitable relief DCSC claims.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/12/2006	LBM	R	A	1	2.20	Revise report to court regarding DCSC equitable relief claims and discuss same with MBO; research regarding same; e-mail same to Ramah Counsel and Bryant Rogers; telephone conference with Rogers regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/13/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	E-mail correspondence from LBM and co-class counsel regarding equitable relief notice.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/13/2006	LBM	R	A	1	1.80	Multiple e-mails regarding draft DCSC "reports"; telephone conference with Co-Class Counsel regarding same; work on same.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/14/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Review new e-mails; work on revising Report regarding DCSC issues per same.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/17/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Work on making revisions per discussions among class counsel.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/19/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	E-mail to Class Counsel regarding new draft; review response and respond to same.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/21/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	Work on reprising progress report and e-mail same to co-class counsel.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/23/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	E-mails with Ramah Counsel and Rogers (work performed 6/22/06); work on revisions; e-mail regarding approval of same.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/26/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.50	Review draft filing on equitable relief of DCSC claims.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/26/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review, edit and approve final of DCSC progress report.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/28/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Edit client memorandum regarding filing of DCSC	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 14

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----	-----
						progress report.	
5009.010000	06/28/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.20 Revise client report.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/06/2006	LBM	R	A	1	1.20 Telephone conference with Co-class Counsel.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/07/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.80 Telephone conference with Co-class Counsel; conference call with the Department of Justice regarding requested extension; multiple e-mails regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/07/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.80 Multiple telephone conferences with Co-counsel, Experts, and Tribal Representatives; e-mails all regarding convening September 25 meeting.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/07/2006	AL		A	1	0.10 E-mails among counsel.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/08/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.10 Review e-mail correspondence regarding meeting in Seattle.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/11/2006	LOB	R	A	1	0.10 Telephone call from Bryant Rogers regarding finalization of motion for extension of time.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/13/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.10 Review email correspondence regarding meeting in Seattle to discuss new order on 'cap years.'	ARCH
5009.010000	09/14/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.10 Review e-mails between the Department of Justice and co-class counsel regarding extension of time to respond to order.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/18/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.40 Work with Legal Assistant in reorganizing document directories and contents.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/19/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.20 E-mails with co-class counsel regarding Seattle meeting.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/21/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.70 Conference call with MMM to brief on all aspects of Zuni and Ramah cases for presentation to Tribal Self-Governance conference in Washington.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/22/2006	LBM	R	A	1	1.40 Multiple telephone conferences with co-class counsel and consultants; e-mails with meeting participants all regarding next Monday's presentation in Seattle.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/22/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.20 Multiple e-mails among class counsel regarding meeting next week.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/22/2006	LOB	R	A	1	0.10 E-mail to Mike Gross and Bryant Rogers regarding telephonic attendance by LBM at September 25 mediation session.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/25/2006	LBM	R	A	1	3.60 Conference call with co-class counsel and tribal financial officers regarding alternatives for completing litigation following court's summary judgment ruling and order to counsel; discuss same with MBO.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/04/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Telephone conference with B. Rogers regarding equitable relief issue.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/20/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.50 Telephone conferences with Bryan Rogers regarding amending complaint and related strategic issues;	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 15

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
							review and comment on new version of report to Judge Hansen.	
5009.010000	10/22/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review new draft; telephone conference with B. Rogers regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/23/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Conference call with the Department of Justice and co-class counsel regarding redrafted report to the court; telephone conference with co-class counsel regarding Contract Disputes Act claim filing.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/23/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple telephone conferences and e-mails with co-counsel and the Department of Justice to approve first filing.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/09/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Conference with LBM regarding settlement proceedings on remaining issues.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/10/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.10	E-mails regarding scheduling order and mediation.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/13/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	E-mails regarding settlement sessions in Albuquerque.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/14/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails regarding Albuquerque negotiations; work on planning for same with LOB.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/27/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	E-mails and telephone conferences regarding Tunica hearing and recent filings.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/29/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.10	Conference with staff regarding travel arrangements.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/30/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.50	Client memorandum regarding ABQ negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/30/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Pro rated: Edit memorandums and cover letter in final.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/02/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	Prepare for travel to mediation in Albuquerque.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/04/2006	MBO	R	A	1	11.50	Travel to Albuquerque for negotiation with Department of Justice regarding equitable relief; review background for negotiations; review deposition of Ron Demaray in Tunica case.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/04/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.25	Pro rated: Multiple e-mails with Bryceson Pinto and DCM regarding meeting with council.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/04/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Prepare materials to travel to Albuquerque settlement conference.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/04/2006	AL		A	1	0.20	E-mails to and from Anchorage office; read memorandum and related papers on negotiation.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/05/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.50	Prepare for mediation; conference with LBM regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/05/2006	LBM	R	A	1	12.50	Travel Anchorage to Albuquerque for settlement negotiations; prepare for same and review past equitable relief order and related materials.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/06/2006	MBO	R	A	1	9.30	Attend and participate in mediation session regarding equitable relief issues; conference with LBM regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/06/2006	LBM	R	A	1	10.50	Round trip hotel to meeting and meet with co-class	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 16

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----		-----
							counsel and the Department of Justice attorney; conference with MBO.	
5009.010000	12/07/2006	MBO	R	A	1	8.20	Attend mediation session regarding equitable relief issues; draft talking points; e-mail same to parties; conference with LBM and Bruce Bleakman regarding final discussions and double dipping.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/07/2006	LBM	R	A	1	11.00	Round trip to meeting and continue discussions with co-class counsel and the Department of Justice attorneys; round trip to Pueblo of Zuni to meet with Zuni counsel.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/08/2006	MBO	R	A	1	10.00	Return travel from Albuquerque to Alaska (from equitable relief mediation).	ARCH
5009.010000	12/08/2006	LBM	R	A	1	13.30	Return travel from Alburqurque settlement meetings to Anchorage; review record of meetings and develop response to same.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/11/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.40	Telephone conference with Bryant Rogers regarding the "double dipping" issue with regard to the carryforward template.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/13/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.10	Pro rated: Develop internal work plan for all cases.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/09/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	Multiple e-mails regarding next meeting in D.C. on the Ramah settlement.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/10/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.50	Follow-up e-mails regarding scheduling of next settlement negotiations; make travel arrangements regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/10/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Multiple e-mails regarding scheduling next negotiation sessions.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/11/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Make travel arrangements for trip to D.C. for negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/19/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Conference with LBM regarding negotiations in D.C.; e-mail co-counsel regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/21/2007	LBM	R	A	1	7.00	Pro rated: Travel Anchorage to D.C. for two day settlement conference with the Department of Justice.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/21/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	Review e-mail correspondence from tribal representative regarding December mediation session.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/22/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Coordinate with staff materials needed for travel to D.C. negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/23/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.70	Planning meeting with Mike Gross; telephone conferences with Bryant Rogers; travel to hotel; various telephone conferences.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/23/2007	MBO	R	A	1	6.00	Travel to D.C. to attend negotiations with co-counsel, LBM, and Department of Justice.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/24/2007	LBM	R	A	1	11.50	Round trip to the Department of Justice and engage in settlement discussions; follow-up discussions with all plaintiffs counsel; follow-up with MBO.	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 17

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
5009.010000	01/24/2007	MBO	R	A	1	8.70	Travel to and from and attend negotiations with Department of Justice regarding equitable relief; lunch meeting with co-counsel and LBM regarding negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/25/2007	LBM	R	A	1	6.90	Round trip to the Department of Justice to continue negotiations; continue discussions regarding same with MBO.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/25/2007	MBO	R	A	1	8.30	Travel to and from and attend negotiations with Department of Justice regarding equitable relief; lunch meeting with co-counsel and LBM regarding negotiations; post-negotiation session with Bryant Rogers and Marcel Kerkmans; conference with LBM regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/26/2007	LBM	R	A	1	5.00	Pro rated: Return travel D.C. to Anchorage.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/26/2007	MBO	R	A	1	14.50	Travel from D.C. after negotiations with co-counsel, LBM and Department of Justice; draft cross-walk from two different negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/01/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	Review draft status report; review e-mails from co-counsel and opposing counsel regarding upcoming negotiation and status report.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/05/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	E-mail Finance Director and Tribal Administrator regarding upcoming negotiations in Sacramento.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/05/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails regarding Sacramento sessions with other counsel and tribal representatives.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/07/2007	MBO	R	A	1	1.10	Incorporate notes from January negotiations into a table; e-mail draft to LBM; fax same to co-counsel.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/08/2007	MBO	R	A	1	1.00	E-mail co-counsel talking points from both negotiation sessions; multiple follow-up e-mails regarding upcoming negotiation session; review draft letter to opposing counsel regarding double dipping; telephone conference with co-counsel regarding double dipping; e-mail opposing counsel regarding estimated cost for training.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/09/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.80	E-mail correspondence with opposing counsel regarding training estimates; e-mail same to co-counsel; prepare for travel to negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/13/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.20	Telephone conference with Pueblo of Zuni Senior Executive Administrator regarding negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/16/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.70	Multiple e-mails with Senior Executive Administrator regarding upcoming negotiation session; e-mails with staff regarding materials for same.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/17/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails with Senior Executive Administrator regarding negotiation session.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/19/2007	MBO	R	A	1	10.00	Travel to Sacramento for negotiations; review	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 18

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
							previous session notes for same; organize electronic materials for same.	
5009.010000	02/20/2007	MBO	R	A	1	7.80	Attend Ramah negotiation session in Sacramento; attend pre-meeting with co-counsel and Pueblo representatives.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/21/2007	MBO	R	A	1	13.70	Attend negotiations; return travel from Sacramento; edit documents recapping session.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/22/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.50	Conference with MBO regarding settlement discussions.	ARCH
5009.010000	03/12/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.50	Revise and e-mail summary notes of February negotiations to Class negotiating team.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/09/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	E-mail correspondence with co-counsel regarding next steps.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/10/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Follow-up e-mails with class counsel regarding next steps.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/11/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails; work with ramah counsel regarding equitable relief negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/25/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	Pro rated: Dictate status report to new Tribal Council.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/25/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Work with staff on pulling together expense information for report to the Court.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/26/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Work with staff to prepare cost reimbursement information to submit to court; draft letter to Pueblo Governor regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/30/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.10	Edit draft letter to the Governor requesting information for reimbursements to submit to court.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/03/2007	MBO	R	A	1	0.10	Correspondence and conference with staff regarding cost submission.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/06/2007	LBM	R	A	1	3.00	Pro rated: Travel to attend self governance conference to present on case status and related appropriations issues.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/07/2007	LBM	R	A	1	2.00	Attend self governance conference and address Ramah case status.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/08/2007	LBM	R	A	1	4.00	Attend self governance conference and report on Ramah case.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/10/2007	LBM	R	A	1	3.00	Pro rated: Return travel from self governance conference.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/11/2007	LOB	R	A	1	0.20	Telephone call from Rhoda Eustace at Zuni regarding costs to include in request for reimbursement to be filed with Court; per LBM advised Ms. Eustace to provide travel costs.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/14/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review and consider e-mail from Gross regarding first draft PSA-3; begin research of PSA-2 .	ARCH
5009.010000	05/20/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.60	Review and consider draft PSA-3.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/22/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.00	Conference call with co-class counsel regarding draft	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 19

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----	-----
						PSA-3.	
5009.010000	05/23/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.20 E-mails with other counsel regarding rescheduling Sacramento meeting.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/24/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.70 Telephone conference with the Department of Justice and co-counsel regarding meeting progress and scheduling issues.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/25/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.70 Telephone conference with the Department of Justice and co-counsel regarding progress of negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/30/2007	LOB	R	A	1	0.10 Telephone conference with Mr. Oesting to arrange Seattle conference room for use at negotiations on June 7 and 8 (none available); telephone call to Katzen & Kanji to check availability of conference room site for negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/06/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.80 Prepare for Seattle negotiations; begin review of documents; telephone conference with Bryant Rogers.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/07/2007	LBM	R	A	1	10.00 Travel Anchorage to Seattle; review materials; participate in PSA III negotiations with co-class counsel.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/08/2007	LBM	R	A	1	11.50 Participate in PSA III negotiation with co-class counsel and the Department of Justice counsel; return travel Seattle to Anchorage.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/11/2007	LOB	R	A	1	0.50 Review, locate and e-mail to LBM and class counsel the unopposed motion (including contract with NCAI attached to motion) and Order entered by Judge regarding final payment to NCAI.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/11/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.70 Multiple e-mails to review proposed joint request to extend deadlines in light of settlement negotiations to substitute NBC regarding National Congress of American Indians account and need to confer further with NCAI; review filed pleadings/order regarding National Congress of American Indians; draft letter to National Congress of American Indians.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/12/2007	LOB	R	A	1	0.80 Review correspondence and memoranda for information regarding National Congress of American Indians's work under contract during 2002-2004 timeframe; provide memoranda to LBM.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/12/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.40 Multiple e-mails and telephone conferences with M. Gross regarding National Congress of American Indians accounts and contracts.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/12/2007	LOB	R	A	1	0.10 Review docket for dates of activity regarding payments to National Congress of American Indians.	ARCH
5009.010000	06/13/2007	LOB	R	A	1	0.50 Prepare draft unopposed motion for reimbursement of costs, supporting affidavit and proposed Order; locate last PSA2 report filed with the Court and	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 20

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----	-----
5009.010000	06/14/2007	LBM	R	A	1	2.20	ARCH
							provide same to LBM.
							Work on application for costs reimbursement; telephone conferences with VS and TRW regarding same; finalize cost motion for review by Gross and Rogers; work on National Congress of American Indians letter and research regarding same.
5009.010000	06/15/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	ARCH
							Multiple e-mails with co-class counsel regarding cost motion; review co-class counsel's application.
5009.010000	06/18/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	ARCH
							Multiple e-mails regarding cost bills and briefly review co-class counsel's application.
5009.010000	06/19/2007	LOB	R	A	1	0.30	ARCH
							Based on additional costs for June 8, 2007 travel, prepare revisions to draft unopposed application, affidavit, exhibit and proposed order regarding costs incurred regarding work on equitable relief issue.
5009.010000	06/19/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.10	ARCH
							Review cost application and revise.
5009.010000	06/20/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	ARCH
							Finalize cost application; e-mails with the Department of Justice and co-class counsel regarding same; execute same.
5009.010000	06/22/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	ARCH
							Work on National Congress of American Indians letter regarding draft.
5009.010000	06/26/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	ARCH
							Telephone conference with Bryant Rogers; e-mails with Dan Machmeelin regarding draft letter to National Congress of American Indians regarding National Congress of American Indians work per court approved contracts.
5009.010000	06/27/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	ARCH
							Multiple e-mails with co-counsel regarding National Congress of American Indians letter; work on edits to same; finalize same.
5009.010000	07/02/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.10	ARCH
							Review courts new orders.
5009.010000	07/25/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	ARCH
							Multiple e-mails regarding scheduling negotiations.
5009.010000	08/10/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	ARCH
							Prepare for D.C. negotiations.
5009.010000	08/13/2007	LBM	R	A	1	10.50	ARCH
							Review last draft of settlement agreement; work on first draft of class notice; travel to D.C. for settlement negotiations; e-mail with M. Gross regarding same.
5009.010000	08/14/2007	LBM	R	A	1	8.00	ARCH
							Attend day one of PSA III negotiations; e-mails with National Congress of American Indians regarding work under PSA I and II.
5009.010000	08/15/2007	LBM	R	A	1	8.00	ARCH
							Attend day two of D.C. negotiations regarding PSA III with NBC and Bureau of Indian Affairs representatives.
5009.010000	08/16/2007	LBM	R	A	1	9.00	ARCH
							Attend day three of PSA III negotiations with the Department of Justice.
5009.010000	08/17/2007	LBM	R	A	1	15.00	ARCH
							Attend day four PSA III negotiations (4.0); return

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 21

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
							travel D.C. to Anchorage (11).	
5009.010000	08/20/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	Review and respond to multiple e-mails among class counsel regarding PSA III terms.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/21/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Multiple e-mails regarding National Congress of American Indians contract review; multiple e-mails regarding PSA III settlement papers, including draft class notice.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/21/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.20	E-mails regarding NCAI issue and arranging telephone conference calls; multiple e-mails regarding PSA III release language.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/22/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.70	Telephone conference with National Congress of American Indians regarding contract accounting issues; telephone conferences with Co-Class Counsel regarding PSA III negotiations.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/23/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	E-mails and telephone conferences regarding new Department of Justice draft of PSA III and to set telephone conference.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/23/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	Begin review of draft 10 PSA III; telephone conference with National Congress of American Indians regarding conference; e-mails regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/24/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	Telephone conference with National Congress of American Indians regarding PSA I and PSA II contracts and potential PSA III work; telephone conference with co-counsel regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/29/2007	LBM	R	A	1	2.60	Multiple e-mails and telephone conferences regarding drafts; work on PSA III edits.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/31/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Organize settlement drafts and related e-mails.	ARCH
5009.010000	08/31/2007	LBM	R	A	1	2.40	Telephone conference with other class counsel to work on reviewing and editing new draft PSA III agreement.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/05/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.20	Telephone conference with co-class counsel to review new PSA III draft; edit same.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/06/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails to counsel to schedule negotiation session.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/06/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.10	Work on editing draft class notice.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/10/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails regarding new PSA III draft; conference call with the Department of Justice regarding same; review tole in PSA III.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/10/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	Review and comments on edits to draft notice and on summary notice.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/11/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.90	Conference call with the Department of Justice and co-class counsel regarding latest draft PSA III agreement.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/12/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails regarding next negotiation, redrafted sections and related issues.	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 22

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----		-----
5009.010000	09/13/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails regarding PSA III issues and scheduling issues.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/13/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.70	Telephone conference with co-class counsel regarding additional PSA III edits.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/17/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.00	Conference call with the Department of Justice and co-counsel regarding new redraft of PSA III.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/20/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Multiple e-mails with co-counsel and the Department of Justice counsel regarding amending order and scheduling next negotiation session.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/21/2007	LBM	R	A	1	2.00	Conference call with the Department of Justice and co-counsel to discuss impasse issues and draft language.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/23/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Multiple e-mails among all counsel regarding scheduling issues and motion to court to put off deadline.	ARCH
5009.010000	09/26/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Review new filings in case.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/24/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	E-mails with CBR and MPG regarding next meeting.	ARCH
5009.010000	10/25/2007	LBM	R	A	1	1.20	Review and comment on proposed letter to the Department of Justice regarding double recovery issue; telephone conferences and e-mails regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/12/2007	LBM	R	A	1	5.40	Travel Anchorage to Seattle for next round of negotiations; review materials regarding damage recoveries.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/13/2007	LBM	R	A	1	9.00	Day long negotiations with the Department of Justice, other class counsel and NBC representative.	ARCH
5009.010000	11/14/2007	LBM	R	A	1	8.50	Delayed travel return from Seattle to Anchorage.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/01/2007	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Review new drafts from Co-counsel of notice and summary notice; e-mail to co-counsel regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	12/28/2007	LBM	R	A	1	2.00	Review latest draft and consider same.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/03/2008	LBM	R	A	1	2.20	Review documents; multiple e-mails regarding new drafts; conference call regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/08/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Review and response to e-mail transmitting new draft to the Department of Justice.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/09/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	Review and respond to e-mail transmitting new draft to the Department of Justice.	ARCH
5009.010000	01/21/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	E-mails with co-counsel regarding reconsideration motion.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/07/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	Telephone conferences and e-mails with co-counsel regarding PSA-III language; consider same.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/08/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	E-mails with co-counsel and review new language.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/22/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Brief review e-mails and new drafts.	ARCH
5009.010000	02/29/2008	LBM	R	A	1	2.00	Conference call with co-counsel, Bill Parkhurst and Greg Anderson.	ARCH

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 23

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill		Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----		-----
5009.010000	03/04/2008	LBM	R	A	1	1.70	Conference call with the Department of Justice and co-counsel regarding new drafts and edits to same.	ARCH
5009.010000	03/31/2008	LBM	R	A	1	3.10	Review all new draft documents for the Department of Justice and analyze and comment on same; draft e-mail to co-counsel regarding same; conference call with co-counsel regarding same.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/01/2008	LBM	R	A	1	1.20	Multiple e-mails and review multiple new drafts of various settlement documents.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/02/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Review typos and approve same for transmittal to other counsel.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/03/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Multiple e-mails regarding revisions.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/04/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails regarding new edits and revise and approve same.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/05/2008	LBM	R	A	1	1.80	Work on client memorandum regarding PSA-III.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/07/2008	LBM	R	A	1	1.10	Work on PSA-III client memorandum.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/08/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.80	Telephone conferences with co-class counsel regarding final judgment issues in PSA-III.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/09/2008	LBM	R	A	1	10.00	Travel office to Alburquerque to meet with Council over settlement.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/13/2008	LBM	R	A	1	2.00	Review documents; 3rd draft power points; telephone conference with LOB; all for council.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/14/2008	LBM	R	A	1	1.60	Prepare for settlement; telephone conferences with co-class counsel regarding same; work on power point presentation.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/15/2008	LBM	R	A	1	7.50	Round trip Alburquerque to Pueblo of Zuni and present proposed settlement to Council.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/16/2008	LBM	R	A	1	12.00	Return travel Alburquerque to office from Client settlement meeting.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/17/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	E-mails regarding Zuni approval, regarding draft extension of time; review same.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/21/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.20	E-mail National Congress of American Indians report on work performed under the contracts.	ARCH
5009.010000	04/30/2008	LBM	R	A	1	0.50	E-mails with the Department of Justice regarding implementation of settlement.	ARCH
5009.010000	05/14/2008	LBM	R	P	1	0.80	Multiple e-mails regarding draft approval motion regarding settlement.	639
5009.010000	05/15/2008	LBM	R	P	1	0.90	Multiple e-mails and telephone conferences regarding motion, settlement documents, and execution and approval issues.	638
5009.010000	05/16/2008	LBM	R	P	1	0.60	Multiple e-mails; telephone conferences regarding final execution of settlement documents.	637
5009.010000	05/18/2008	LBM	R	P	1	0.40	Review and sign final PSA-III; forward client executed page to Co-counsel; execute same.	636
5009.010000	05/19/2008	LBM	R	P	1	0.40	E-mails regarding conference call with Judges	640

Date: 06/13/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List
 SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Page: 24

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	- - - - -	---	-----	-----
						regarding filing of settlement papers.	
5009.010000	05/20/2008	LBM	R	P	1	0.20 E-mails regarding Friday teleconference with Judge's chambers.	641
5009.010000	05/21/2008	PAZ	R	P	1	0.40 Draft memorandum to clients regarding approval of Order; calendar August hearing on final approval.	633
5009.010000	05/21/2008	LBM	R	P	1	1.10 Review and consider Court's approval letter; multiple e-mails and telephone conferences with Co-counsel regarding same; dictate correspondence to Client regarding same.	634
5009.010000	05/22/2008	LBM	R	P	1	0.30 E-mails regarding necessary motion and affidavit.	635
GRAND TOTALS							
Total						699.25	

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 1

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
5000.000000	10/13/2003	LBM	R	A	1	5.00	Pro rated: Travel to Washington, D.C. for bureau of Indian Affairs direct contract support cost meetings at National Congress of American Indians, Indian Health Service contract Support Cost Workgroup and National Congress of American Indians NPWGCSC.
5000.000000	10/14/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.20	Pro rated: Round-trip travel to the D.C. office from NCAI for Bureau of Indian Affairs briefing on direct contract support cost initiative; telephone conference with the Cherokee Nation regarding same.
5000.000000	10/17/2003	LBM	R	A	1	7.20	Pro rated: Return travel from D.C. to Anchorage.
5000.000000	11/04/2003	LBM	R	A	1	2.50	Pro rated: Work on direct contract support cost policy redraft.
5000.000000	11/12/2003	LBM	R	A	1	13.00	Pro rated: Travel from the office to Albuquerque to participate in direct contract support cost policy meetings with the Bureau of Indian Affairs.
5000.000000	11/13/2003	LBM	R	A	1	12.50	Pro rated: Participate in Bureau of Indian Affairs direct contract support cost meetings; late night work on redrafting new version of the Bureau of Indian Affairs contract support cost policy.
5000.000000	11/14/2003	LBM	R	A	1	8.00	Pro rated: Finish redraft policy; arrange for copying, etc.; participate in remainder of Bureau of Indian Affairs direct contract support cost workgroup; attend portion of the Bureau of Indian Affairs budget workgroup.
5000.000000	11/15/2003	LBM	R	A	1	4.00	Pro rated: Roundtrip to Convention Center and participate in National Congress of American Indians National Policy Workgroup on contract support costs.
5000.000000	11/16/2003	LBM	R	A	1	4.50	Pro rated: Attend and present at National Congress of American Indians National Policy Workgroup on contract support cost issues.
5000.000000	11/22/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.50	Pro rated: Work on edits to the draft direct contract support cost policy.
5000.000000	12/04/2003	LBM	R	A	1	4.30	Pro rated: Negotiation conference with Bureau of Indian Affairs representatives over direct contract support cost/contract support costs policy development; work on redraft.
5000.000000	12/05/2003	LBM	R	A	1	1.60	Pro rated: Work on revising direct contract support cost policy; draft memorandum regarding same.
5000.000000	01/02/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.20	Pro rated: Work on revising new edits to the draft Bureau of Indian Affairs contract support cost/direct contract support cost policy; work on comments to same and e-mail same to the workgroup.
5000.000000	01/04/2004	LBM	R	A	1	4.00	Pro rated: Work on further revisions to the proposed Bureau of Indian Affairs contract support cost policy in lights of Frank Larson's suggestions.
5000.000000	01/05/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.40	Pro rated: E-mails with other team members; telephone

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 2

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----	-----
						conference with the Department of the Interior Attorney; work on new ideas.	
5000.000000	01/06/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.30 Pro rated: Work on newer version of policy in lights of Bureau of Indian affairs attorney concerns.	
5000.000000	01/09/2004	LBM	R	A	1	2.10 Pro rated: Conference call with the Bureau of Indian Affairs and other tribal representatives; work on Bureau of Indian Affairs contract support cost policy draft 10 and e-mail same.	
5000.000000	01/14/2004	LBM	R	A	1	6.20 Pro rated: Work on editing draft 10 of the contract support cost policies; work on editing the January redraft of the standards document; all regarding Bureau of Indian Affairs direct contract support cost initiative; travel from Anchorage to the Phoenix meeting.	
5000.000000	01/14/2004	LBM	R	A	1	4.50 Pro rated: Work on revising the policy and standards documents; pre-meeting with Bureau of Indian Affairs workgroup leaders.	
5000.000000	01/15/2004	LBM	R	A	1	9.00 Pro rated: Phoenix Bureau of Indian Affairs direct contract support cost meetings; additional subcommittee co-chair meeting.	
5000.000000	01/16/2004	LBM	R	A	1	7.00 Pro rated: Work with the Bureau of Indian Affairs direct contract support cost workgroup (4.5); unbilled return travel (2.5); telephone conference with National Congress of American Indians regarding the ASIA meeting.	
5000.000000	01/20/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.80 Pro rated: Attempted coordination with National Congress of American Indian; work on editing the Bureau of Indian Affairs draft direct contract support costs transmittal documents.	
5021.130000	02/02/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.50 Pro rated: Multiple e-mails regarding contract support cost follow-up and work on same; respond to e-mails regarding direct contract support cost issues as part of campaign to reconcile Bureau of Indian Affairs and Indian Health Service Contract Support Costs practices.	
5021.130000	02/05/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.90 Pro rated: E-mails regarding contract support cost \$111 million appropriations shortfall campaign; attempted telephone conferences with the Deputy Assistant Secretary of Indian Affairs, Special Assistant Mike Olsen, Attorney Rich Meyers and Superintendent Nuvamsa regarding status of the direct contract support cost initiative.	
5021.130000	02/06/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Pro rated: E-mails regarding National Congress of American Indians contract support cost meeting.	
5021.130000	02/20/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.42 Pro rated: Multiple e-mails regarding presenting direct contract support cost issue at the Budget Advisory Committee meeting to reconcile Bureau of Indian Affairs and Indian Health Service practices.	
5021.130000	02/27/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.42 Pro rated: Multiple e-mails regarding ASIA agreement to	

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 3

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----	-----
						meet with tribes on the direct contract support cost policy; memorandum regarding same.	
5021.130000	02/27/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Mississippi Choctaw attorney regarding direct contract support cost issues.	
5021.130000	03/01/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.18 Pro rated: Brief review of the e-mail regarding the impact of direct contract support cost policy on Bureau of Indian Affairs school grant recipients and respond to same.	
5021.130000	04/27/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.86 Pro rated: Round trip from the office to the Department of the Interior to review direct contract support cost draft policy.	
5021.130000	05/04/2004	MBO	R	A	1	1.86 Pro rated: Begin drafting memorandum to client regarding meetings in D.C., including section on Bureau of Indian Affairs direct Contract Support Costs policy.	
5021.130000	05/20/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.72 Pro rated: Telephone conference with the Bureau of Indian Affairs attorney regarding contract support cost policy; e-mail to Ron Allen regarding same.	
5021.130000	07/07/2004	LBM	R	A	1	2.40 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Pueblo of Zuni, telephone call attempted to the BIA attorney and send emails all concerning Seattle, Washington meeting on direct contract support cost issues; telephone conference with BIA D.C. attorney Rich Myers regarding canceled Seattle Bureau of Indian Affairs meetings and rescheduled Minneapolis, Minnesota meeting; telephone conference with various clients regarding same; work on Memorandum 46A-2004 regarding same; telephone with ASIA regarding same.	
5021.130000	07/07/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Associate Solicitor of Indian Affairs attorney regarding Minnesota meeting being rescheduled; edit client report regarding same.	
5021.130000	07/15/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Pro rated: Work on client Memorandum regarding rescheduled Bureau of Indian Affairs meeting.	
5021.130000	07/15/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Pueblo of Zuni; conference call with Zuni and Assistant Secretary's office regarding scheduling Bureau of Indian Affairs contract support cost meeting.	
5021.130000	07/15/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.20 Pro rated: Conference call with all counsel regarding settlement; conference call with plaintiff's counsel.	
5021.130000	08/11/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: Multiple e-mails regarding confirming Minnesota meeting.	
5021.130000	08/17/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.66 Pro rated: Begin preparation for Minneapolis/St. Paul meeting; telephone conference with Vice Chairman Smith regarding same.	
5021.130000	08/18/2004	KO	R	A	1	1.44 Pro rated: Researching statutory and regulatory	

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 4

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----	-----
						authority for Temporary Aid for Needy Families and Community Oriented Police Service; submitted Temporary Aid for Needy Families findings to LBM.	
5021.130000	08/18/2004	LBM	R	A	1	8.70 Pro rated: Travel from the office to Minneapolis/St. Paul; review direct contract support cost materials for meeting.	
5021.130000	08/19/2004	LBM	R	A	1	8.70 Pro rated: Attend Bureau of Indian Affairs meetings and the negotiations with Principal Deputy ASIA regarding draft contract support cost policy.	
5021.130000	08/19/2004	LBM	R	A	1	7.08 Pro rated: Return travel to Anchorage and work on client report.	
5021.130000	08/20/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.66 Pro rated: Edit client Memorandum in final.	
5021.130000	08/27/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.66 Pro rated: Telephone conferences with Zuni and telephone conference with Associate Solicitor's office of Indian Affairs all regarding moving Bureau of Indian Affairs Contract Support Costs policy forward during Ms. Martin's tenure.	
5021.130000	09/02/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.54 Pro rated: Exchange e-mails with National Congress of American Indians regarding BIA Affairs Contract Support Costs policy.	
5021.130000	09/03/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.78 Pro rated: Conference call with BIA Direct Contract Support Costs Workgroup regarding standards document; exchange e-mails with IHS regarding Direct Contract Support Costs Workgroup standards conference call.	
5021.130000	10/05/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.90 Pro rated: Overview of proposed new BIA changes to contract support cost policy; telephone conference with Zuni Finance Director Pinto regarding same; left voice mail message for BIA Attorney Myers regarding same; draft e-mails to Workgroup members regarding same.	
5021.130000	10/07/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Pro rated: Draft multiple e-mails and exchange telephone calls regarding draft BIA Contract Support Costs policy from internal review by H. Rainbolt.	
5021.130000	10/08/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.90 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Bryceson Pinto regarding BIA changes in proposed DCSC policy; email clients regarding same.	
5021.130000	10/19/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.42 Pro rated: Draft emails regarding BIA staff proposals to make changes to the DCSC/CSC policy and regarding Workgroup meeting to discuss same.	
5021.130000	10/21/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.54 Pro rated: Multiple e-mails to other tribal representatives regarding BIA changing items on the Contract Support Costs policy; placed call to Associate Solicitor Attorney regarding same; telephone conferences to and emails with former Principal Deputy Secretary regarding same.	

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 5

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	---	---	-----	---	-----	-----
5021.130000	10/24/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.08	Pro rated: Work on and finalize client report on BIA Contract Support Costs policy developments.
5021.130000	10/27/2004	LBM		A	1	1.44	Pro rated: Teleconference with Shoshone Paiute Vice-Chairman regarding BIA decision to close Contract Support Costs meeting to tribal representatives; teleconference with BIA attorney regarding same; teleconference with BIA Contract Support Costs member Ben Nuvamsa regarding same; draft and finalize letter for Shoshone Vice-Chairman to Assistant Secretary.
5021.130000	11/15/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.54	Pro rated: Multiple telephone calls to BIA attorney and Zuni Finance Director regarding possible D.C. meeting regarding direct contract support costs policy; draft multiple emails regarding same.
5021.130000	11/19/2004	KO	R	A	1	1.62	Pro rated. Teleconference on direct costs with BIA representative and Tribes; relaying information to MBO and LBM.
5021.130000	11/22/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.08	Pro rated: Conference call with BIA and Tribal Representatives regarding BIA's proposed changes to Draft 15 (Bloomington Agreement).
5021.130000	11/24/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Pro rated: Edit multiple client letters in final.
5021.130000	11/24/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.42	Pro rated: Draft client memoranda and client letter regarding BIA Contract Support Costs issues.
5021.130000	11/24/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	Pro rated: Conference call with BIA and Tribal Representatives regarding Contract Support Costs policy developments without tribal leader letters regarding same.
5021.130000	11/25/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.08	Pro rated: Review new draft 24 of DCSC/CSC.
5021.130000	11/29/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.96	Pro rated: Conference call with BIA and tribal representatives regarding finalizing draft 26.
5021.130000	12/01/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.62	Pro rated: Telephone conference with Ben Nuvamsa; multiple telephone conferences and e-mails with clients, all regarding BIA contract support cost policy and regarding "100%-up-front-bottom-up" approach.
5021.130000	12/02/2004	LBM	R	A	1	1.08	Pro rated: Work on letter to Principal Deputy Assistant Secretary Olsen.
5021.130000	12/13/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.24	Pro rated: E-mails regarding BIA apparent acquiescence in tribal position on contract support cost policy.
5021.130000	12/14/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	Pro rated: Conference call with the Assistant Secretary of Indian Affairs office regarding final legal review of contract support cost draft policy.
5021.130000	12/29/2004	LBM	R	A	1	0.78	Pro rated: Exchange calls with Zuni regarding sampling; draft and finalize client report.

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 6

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	---	---	-----	---	-----	-----
5021.130000	01/11/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: Attempted telephone conference with Rich Myers; attempted telephone conference with Deputy Associate Solicitor for Indian Affairs, all regarding status of legal review of contract support cost policy.	
5021.130000	01/26/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: Attempted telephone conference with Ben Nuvamsa regarding status.	
5021.130000	01/31/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Pro rated: Draft emails to B. Nuvamsa regarding pending changes to draft 15 pushed by R. Myers.	
5021.130000	01/31/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.62 Pro rated: Telephone conference with BIA personnel. Review proposed staff edits to the Contract Support Costs policy.	
5021.130000	02/04/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.62 Pro rated: Multiple calls with Associate Solicitor's office, clients, tribal leaders, R. Allen's office (2/3), Secretary's office regarding problems with proposed Contract Support Costs policy; work on client report.	
5021.130000	02/07/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.54 Pro rated: Multiple emails regarding Contract Support Costs policy and a Tribal Leaders letter; telephone conference with Zuni Finance Director regarding same.	
5021.130000	02/08/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.32 Pro rated: Work on draft NCAI Resolution; work on composing a cover email for the resolution to Joint CSC/Title VI Coalition members requesting same.	
5021.130000	02/08/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.08 Pro rated: Work on letter for Zuni Governor Quewtaki to Secretary Norton protesting draft Contract Support Costs policy.	
5021.130000	02/09/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30 Pro rated: Draft email to Assistant Secretary M. Olsen.	
5021.130000	02/09/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.62 Pro rated: Multiple emails to Principle Deputy Assistant Secretary Olsen; telephone conference with attorney R. Myers regarding February 1, 2005 draft.	
5021.130000	02/09/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.54 Pro rated: Multiple emails regarding protest letters to Secretary Norton and regarding status of ruling.	
5021.130000	02/10/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.42 Pro rated: Conference with LBM regarding recent BIA and Interior correspondence regarding the Contract Support Costs policy.	
5021.130000	02/10/2005	LBM	R	A	1	3.30 Pro rated: Telephone conferences with BIA attorney; draft email letter to Principal Deputy Assistant Secretary; draft client report; review report and edit in final; telephone conferences with various clients regarding same.	
5021.130000	02/10/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: Exchange messages with Zuni Governor Quetawki and fax draft letter to Governor's office.	
5021.130000	02/10/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: Draft and send additional emails regarding Assistant Secretary Olsen communications.	

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 7

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
5021.130000	02/11/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.96	Pro rated: Review LBM's e-mail and the recent correspondence regarding Contract Support Costs policy; telephone conferences with LBM regarding same; e-mail materials to coalition members.
5021.130000	02/14/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Pro rated: Continued work trying to secure a meeting with the Department of the Interior regarding Contract Support Costs policy changes.
5021.130000	02/15/2005	MBO	R	A	1	1.44	Pro rated: Telephone conference with James Cason's office regarding possible meeting regarding Contract Support Costs policy; conference with staff regarding same; review recent materials regarding the BIA's CSC policy developments; continued work scheduling a meeting with Cason; draft letter to Cason requesting meeting.
5021.130000	02/22/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Pro rated: Send multiple emails; telephone conferences with Coalition participants regarding NCAI Resolution.
5021.130000	02/23/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.54	Pro rated: Telephone conferences regarding possible meeting with Acting Assistance Secretary Cason; telephone conference with Pat Ragsdale; conference with LBM and staff regarding same.
5021.130000	02/24/2005	MBO	R	A	1	1.74	Pro rated: Telephone conference with workgroup regarding implementing the DCSC policy; conference with LBM regarding discussions at NCAI meeting; draft memorandum to coalition regarding meeting with Olsen.
5021.130000	02/24/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.66	Pro rated: Multiple telephone calls regarding result of sampling meeting and regarding upcoming meeting with Deputy Assistant Secretary Olsen.
5021.130000	02/24/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.32	Pro rated: Conference call with BIA Contract Support Costs workgroup regarding draft policy.
5021.130000	02/25/2005	MBO	R	A	1	1.50	Pro rated: Teleconference with the Coalition; nail down meeting with Olsen (telephone conference with Aida Martin); prepare for travel to D.C.; telephone conference with Pat Ragsdale regarding meeting.
5021.130000	02/25/2005	LBM	R	A	1	2.40	Pro rated: Telephone conferences with clients of the Coalition; prepare for D.C. meetings.
5021.130000	02/26/2005	MBO	R	A	1	1.08	Pro rated: Telephone conferences with LBM regarding meeting with Olsen; fax materials to LBM; e-mail Ron Allen regarding meeting with Olsen.
5021.130000	02/26/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.24	Pro rated: Exchange emails with NCAI Executive Director regarding Resolution process and consideration by the Board.
5021.130000	02/27/2005	LBM	R	A	1	6.54	Pro rated: Travel from Anchorage to Washington D.C. and prepare for National Congress of American Indians proceedings and meetings at Department of Interior.

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 8

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	---	---	-----	---	-----	-----
5021.130000	02/28/2005	MBO	R	A	1	2.40	Pro rated: Telephone conference with Mike Olsen, BIA staff, and the Contract Support Costs workgroup regarding changes to the draft Contract Support Costs policy; telephone conference with LBM regarding same.
5021.130000	02/28/2005	LBM	R	A	1	4.92	Pro rated: Pre-meetings with Tribal leaders regarding Department of Interior meeting; round trip to Department of Interior and meeting with Principal Deputy Assistant Secretary Olsen with various Tribal leaders; follow-up discussions and emails regarding meeting and regarding NCAI Board action.
5021.130000	03/01/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Pro rated: E-mail correspondence regarding February 28, 2005 meeting with Olsen.
5021.130000	03/02/2005	LBM	R	A	1	6.54	Pro rated: Return travel from Washington D.C. meetings to Anchorage.
5021.130000	03/02/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Pro rated: Telephone conference with B. Pinto (Zuni) regarding M training, need for R. Demeray to participate, and the results of Olsen meeting; telephone message with A. Martin.
5021.130000	03/03/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.42	Pro rated: Telephone conference with Zuni regarding attending Albuquerque training session on DCSC aspect of policy regarding outcome of meeting with M. Olsen.
5021.130000	03/03/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.42	Pro rated: E-mails with M. Olsen regarding meeting.
5021.130000	03/04/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.24	Pro rated: E-mails regarding rescheduling meeting.
5021.130000	03/06/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.66	Pro rated: Edit materials in final.
5021.130000	03/06/2005	LBM	R	A	1	2.52	Pro rated: Work on client Memorandum; work on model tribal letters; work on letter regarding Supreme Court action and letter to Senator McCain.
5021.130000	03/07/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	Pro rated: Work on report of February 28 meeting on Contract Support Costs policy with Principal Deputy Assistant Secretary Mike Olsen.
5021.130000	03/07/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Pro rated: Telephone conference with Rocky Boys regarding new congressional campaign.
5021.130000	03/08/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.30	Pro rated: Review and edit the memorandum to the Coalition regarding the Mike Olsen meeting.
5021.130000	03/08/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.24	Pro rated: Work on finalizing client memorandum.
5021.130000	03/08/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.32	Pro rated: Draft multiple letters to Senators.
5021.130000	03/08/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.42	Pro rated: Follow-up e-mails regarding notification to the workgroup; edit client report.
5021.130000	03/08/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	Pro rated: E-mails with Principal Deputy Assistant Secretary regarding April 1 meeting time and place; telephone conference with Pueblo of Zuni regarding same; telephone conference with Shoshone-Paiute regarding same.
5021.130000	03/08/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.24	Pro rated: Work on client memorandum regarding filing of class motion.

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 9

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
5021.130000	03/09/2005	LBM	R	A	1	5.34	
							Pro rated: Travel to Albuquerque regional training on new BIA Contract Support Costs policy and DCSC aspects of same; work on refining congressional strategy; work on additional letters to the House, OMB and White House; telephone conference with Executive Officer Knight regarding same.
5021.130000	03/10/2005	LBM	R	A	1	4.92	
							Pro rated: Participate in first Regional Training over DCSC costs.
5021.130000	03/11/2005	LBM	R	A	1	8.16	
							Pro rated: Return travel and work on bullet points requested by Training Teams for four remaining sessions.
5021.130000	03/13/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	
							Pro rated: Exchange e-mails with RPC regarding Aurene Martin alleged flip-flop on the Bloomington Agreement.
5021.130000	03/14/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.08	
							Pro rated: Work on history of direct contract support cost litigation in bullet point format for all BIA DCSC training sessions (includes 3/11 time).
5021.130000	03/14/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.66	
							Pro rated: E-mail to M. Olsen regarding agreed points from last meeting in advance of April 1 meeting.
5021.130000	03/14/2005	LBM	R	A	1	4.92	
							Pro rated: Travel to Portland for BIA CSC training session.
5021.130000	03/15/2005	LBM	R	A	1	5.46	
							Pro rated: Attend and present at Portland BIA Regional Training Session (3.5). Return travel to Anchorage from Portland (2.5).
5021.130000	03/15/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	
							Pro rated: Multiple e-mails regarding CSC campaign in Congress.
5021.130000	03/17/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.96	
							Pro rated: Telephone conference with LBM and coalition regarding April 1 meetings regarding Direct Contract Support Costs policy and appropriations for Contract Support Costs; e-mail correspondence with LBM regarding April 1 schedule.
5021.130000	03/17/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	
							Pro rated: Coalition conference call regarding legislative campaign regarding BIA CSC/DCSC issues.
5021.130000	03/17/2005	LBM	R	A	1	2.52	
							Pro rated: Attend and participate in portions of Alaska DCSC Training Session.
5021.130000	03/18/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.12	
							Pro rated: Follow-up correspondence regarding NCAI meeting on Monday.
5021.130000	03/18/2005	LBM	R	A	1	3.84	
							Pro rated: Work on researching and e-mail requested materials resulting from conference call; follow-up e-mails and attachments; coordinate Monday conference calls; coordinate with Cherokee Nation Lobbyist; work on sample letter.
5021.130000	03/21/2005	MBO	R	A	1	1.32	
							Pro rated: Telephone conference with coalition members and NCAI and NIHB.
5021.130000	03/21/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.90	
							Pro rated: Conference calls with NCAI and NIHB

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 10

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----	-----
5021.130000	03/21/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.30	regarding congressional campaign. Pro rated: Research shortfall numbers; review and comment on Choctaw letter to Olsen regarding DCSC rules.
5021.130000	03/22/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.42	Pro rated: Multiple e-mails regarding Olsen meeting, Hill meetings, and NCAI meeting with Hill staff.
5021.130000	03/22/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.42	Pro Rated: Telephone conference with OTA regarding shortfalls.
5021.130000	03/23/2005	MBO	R	A	1	1.08	Pro rated: E-mails with staff regarding travel and meeting schedule next week; telephone conference with Lisa Jim regarding meeting schedule; edit draft schedule for distribution to coalition; email Ms. Jim regarding same.
5021.130000	03/24/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.66	Pro Rated: Multiple e-mails regarding next week's D.C. meetings; work with Cherokee and NCAI to coordinate regarding same.
5021.130000	03/25/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.42	Pro rated: E-mails with NCAI, Cherokee; multiple calls all regarding D.C. Hill meetings.
5021.130000	03/28/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.54	Pro rated: E-mail MJP regarding meetings with staffers regarding Contract Support Costs appropriations; e-mail correspondence regarding this week's meetings.
5021.130000	03/28/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.66	Pro rated: Work on client memorandum regarding meetings in D.C.
5021.130000	03/30/2005	LBM	R	A	1	9.30	Pro rated: Unbilled travel from office to D.C. (3.5); work on "transitional language" for BIA CSC policy; work on bullet points for congressional meetings; discuss same with NCAI Vice President; multiple telephone conferences and emails with Cherokee legislative officer and NCAI office all regarding meetings; discuss strategy of meetings with MBO; work with CT on details and arrangements.
5021.130000	03/30/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.62	Pro rated: Continue multiple e-mails and telephone conferences; work on handouts and outline to coordinate and prepare for meetings.
5021.130000	03/31/2005	MBO	R	A	1	7.50	Pro rated: Meeting with coalition members regarding strategy for Hill meetings regarding Contract Support Costs; conferences regarding and attempt to schedule additional meetings; preparation for meetings; attend meeting with Interior Appropriations staff Greg Knadle; conference with client regarding Knadle meeting; conference with clients to prepare for tomorrow's meetings.
5021.130000	03/31/2005	LBM	R	A	1	3.84	Pro rated: Client meetings at office to prepare for Hill meetings on CSC; BIA meetings regarding CSC

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
						policy; travel to and from House and meet with Interior Appropriations Subcommittee staff.	
5021.130000	03/31/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.90 Pro rated: Coordinate April 1 meetings.	
5021.130000	03/31/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.08 Pro rated: Meeting with Choctaw attorney regarding review of BIA DCSC draft policy.	
5021.130000	04/01/2005	MBO	R	A	1	11.52 Pro rated: Attend meeting with Senate Committee on Indian Affairs staff Jeanne Bumpus and Rhonda Harjo and coalition regarding Contract Support Costs appropriations and legislation; attend meeting with Mike Olsen, other BIA officials, and coalition regarding Contract Support Costs policy; attend meeting with OMB staffer James Kazel regarding BIA Contract Support Costs appropriations and BIA spending of appropriations; multiple conferences with coalition members regarding same; conference with LBM recapping meetings and planning follow-up strategy.	
5021.130000	04/01/2005	LBM	R	A	1	6.60 Pro rated: Travel to DOI and conference with DOI Principal Deputy Assistant Secretary and staff, Tribal leadership, and other Tribal representatives regarding BIA's draft CSC policy; conference post-meeting with Tribal leaders; meeting with OMB examiner for BIA James Kazel; conference post-meetings regarding next steps and master strategy.	
5021.130000	04/03/2005	MBO	R	A	1	8.16 Pro rated: Return travel from Washington D.C.; work with LBM on letter to Greg Knadle recapping Thursday meeting and requesting committee action.	
5021.130000	04/03/2005	LBM	R	A	1	4.80 Pro rated: Work on J. Kazel letter.	
5021.130000	04/03/2005	LBM	R	A	1	6.00 Pro rated: Return travel from DC to Anchorage.	
5021.130000	04/08/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.36 Pro rated: Conference with LBM regarding "to do" items for DCSC policy and Contract Support Costs appropriations effort.	
5021.130000	05/04/2005	LBM	R	A	1	6.60 Pro rated: Work on CSC-BIA policy memorandum; conference with panelists regarding same; complete work on presentation; present at Self-Governance Conference.	
5021.130000	05/04/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.80 Pro rated: Work on presentation regarding DCSC issues.	
5021.130000	05/05/2005	MBO	R	A	1	1.56 Pro rated: Attend Self-Governance Conference for discussion on DCSC policy and Supreme Court cases.	
5021.130000	05/05/2005	LBM	R	A	1	4.80 Pro rated: Complete work on presentation; present at Self-Governance Conference.	
5021.130000	05/09/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.72 Pro rated: Work on scheduling meeting with Assistant Secretary Cason; e-mail LBM regarding same; conferences with LBM regarding same.	

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 12

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	---	---	-----	---	-----	-----
5021.130000	05/09/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.36	Pro rated: Telephone conference with Bryant Rogers regarding D.C. meeting with Hill staff regarding CSC appropriations; conference with MBO regarding same.
5021.130000	05/10/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.68	Pro rated: Work on client memorandum regarding May 19 meeting with Assistant Secretary of Indian Affairs; multiple telephone conferences and e-mails regarding same with clients.
5021.130000	05/11/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.36	Pro rated: Conference with LBM regarding meetings next week; make travel arrangements.
5021.130000	05/12/2005	MBO	R	A	1	2.04	Pro rated: Review materials for Assistant Secretary Cason; multiple e-mails and telephone conferences with meeting attendees.
5021.130000	05/12/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.60	Pro rated: Edit new client memorandum in final; final approval of briefing materials to Assistant Secretary Cason regarding BIA CSC policy; conference with MBO regarding same.
5021.130000	05/13/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.44	Pro rated: Multiple e-mails regarding D.C. meeting coordination, attendees, etc.; telephone conference with former BIA employee regarding CSC issues.
5021.130000	05/15/2005	MBO	R	A	1	2.16	Pro rated: Prepare materials for D.C. meetings; conference with LBM regarding same.
5021.130000	05/16/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.84	Pro rated: Coordinate meetings for this week with Zuni and Shoshone-Paiute; prepare materials and schedule.
5021.130000	05/16/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.20	Pro rated: Multiple telephone conferences with MBO regarding D.C. meetings with Senate appropriations staff regarding CSC appropriations, with Assistant Secretary Cason and Commission regarding BIA CSC policy, and preparations for same; telephone conference with Vice-Chairman Smith regarding same.
5021.130000	05/17/2005	MBO	R	A	1	3.60	Pro rated: Travel to Washington D.C. for meetings with Assistant Secretary Cason and Appropriations Committee staff.
5021.130000	05/17/2005	LBM	R	A	1	7.20	Pro rated: Travel from Anchorage to D.C. for White House and Hill and Assistant Secretary Cason meetings regarding appropriations and BIA CSC policy; final preparation for same.
5021.130000	05/18/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.24	Pro rated: Telephone conference with Assistant Secretary Cason's office regarding meeting; conference with staff regarding same and coordinating with coalition members.
5021.130000	05/19/2005	MBO	R	A	1	7.20	Pro rated: Meetings with Appropriations Committee staff (Ann Copland, Ginny James and Ryan Thomas) regarding CSC issues; client meeting in preparation for BIA CSC policy meeting with Assistant Secretary

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 13

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----	-----
						Cason; attend BIA CSC policy meeting with Assistant Secretary Cason.	
5021.130000	05/19/2005	LBM	R	A	1	6.36 Pro rated: Multiple client telephone conferences; office meeting with Tribal representatives; meeting at DOI with Assistant Secretary Cason and staff regarding BIA CSC policy development; meeting with Senate Indian Affairs Chief of Staff to update on all IHS and BIA CSC issues.	
5021.130000	05/19/2005	LBM	R	A	1	2.40 Pro rated: Round trip travel and meeting with Legislative Assistant to Senator Cochran and Interior Appropriations Subcommittee staff regarding all aspects of CSC issues with IHS and BIA; assess same.	
5021.130000	05/20/2005	MBO	R	A	1	3.60 Pro rated: Return travel from CSC meetings with Assistant Secretary Cason and the Appropriations Committee staff.	
5021.130000	05/20/2005	LBM	R	A	1	8.40 Pro rated: Return travel from D. C. to Anchorage; draft client report.	
5021.130000	05/23/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.48 Pro rated: Review and edit memorandum to coalition regarding meetings last week.	
5021.130000	06/01/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.36 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Vice Chairman Smith regarding letter to Assistant Secretary Cason.	
5021.130000	06/02/2005	MBO	R	A	1	1.44 Pro rated: Draft letter for Vice Chairman regarding meeting with Assistant Secretary Cason; e-mail same to LBM for review; e-mail same to CEO.	
5021.130000	06/08/2005	MBO		A	1	0.72 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Bureau of Indian Affairs counsel regarding DCSC policy; e-mail correspondence with LBM regarding same.	
5021.130000	06/09/2005	MBO		A	1	0.84 Pro rated: Compare drafts of DCSC policy; e-mail November draft policy to Bureau of Indian Affairs counsel.	
5021.130000	06/28/2005	LBM		A	1	0.72 Pro rated: E-mails regarding Senate action; telephone call to Acting Assistant Secretary (message) regarding Bureau of Indian Affairs Contract Support Costs policy developments.	
5021.130000	10/03/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.84 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Assistant Secretary regarding CSC policy and anticipated "Dear Tribal Leader" letters; telephone conference with Vice Chairman Smith regarding same; telephone conference with Chairman Allen regarding same.	
5021.130000	11/10/2005	LBM	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: E-mails regarding BIA DCSC policy.	
5021.130000	11/14/2005	LBM	R	A	1	2.16 Pro rated: Work on client memorandum; draft letter to Assistant Secretary Cason.	
5021.130000	11/15/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.32 Pro rated: Revise client memoranda in final and revise draft letter to Assistant Secretary Cason.	
5021.130000	11/18/2005	LBM	R	A	1	1.08 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Vice Chairman	

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 14

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----	-----
						Smith regarding meeting with Tribal leaders to review BIA proposed DCSC policy and IHS CSC workgroup meeting; e-mail with B. Nuvamsa and Cherokee Tribal Administrator regarding same.	
5021.130000	12/19/2005	MSJ		A	1	3.00 Pro rated: Review BIA CSC policy; draft letter to BIA officials objecting to CSC policy; review BIA draft CSC policy (10/31/05); conference with BIA ISDA Director regarding policy; e-mail note to LBM and MBO regarding same; review information on proposed Congressional rescission.	
5021.130000	12/27/2005	JEG		A	1	0.36 Pro rated: Conference with MSJ regarding BIA proposed CSC policy and proposed tribal comments regarding same; review MSJ edits to tribal comment letter.	
5021.130000	12/27/2005	MSJ		A	1	2.40 Pro Rated: Review BIA current and proposed CSC policy; review firm correspondence on same and draft additional comments to BIA officials on draft CSC policy; forward to LBM and MBO.	
5021.130000	12/28/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.96 Pro rated: E-mail correspondence with MSJ regarding comments on BIA policy; telephone conference with JEG regarding same; edit draft comments and e-mail same to PSC and LBM.	
5021.130000	12/28/2005	JEG		A	1	0.48 Pro rated: Continue working with MSJ and MBO on Tribal comments to BIA proposed CSC policy.	
5021.130000	12/29/2005	MBO	R	A	1	1.20 Pro rated: E-mail correspondence with D.C. office regarding comments on the BIA draft DCSC policy; review and edit comments; telephone conference with D.C. staff regarding filing of comments.	
5021.130000	12/29/2005	JEG		A	1	0.12 Pro rated: Review and respond to e-mail from MBO regarding assisting in filing of Tribal comments to BIA on proposed CSC policy.	
5021.130000	12/30/2005	MBO	R	A	1	0.48 Pro rated: E-mail correspondence with the D.C. office regarding the filing of comments on the DCSC draft policy; telephone conference with staff regarding distribution to CSC coalition.	
5021.130000	12/30/2005	JEG		A	1	0.48 Pro rated: Review final draft of Tribal comments to BIA CSC Policy; arrange for comments to be sent to DOI; miscellaneous tasks regarding same.	
5021.130000	01/12/2006	MSJ		A	1	0.48 Pro rated: Emails with LBM and Self Governance advisory Committee to expand agenda to include Contract Support Cost issues.	
5021.130000	01/12/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.48 Pro rated: E-mail exchange with SGAC to successfully add CSC issues to agenda for meeting with DOI.	
5021.130000	01/13/2006	MSJ		A	1	0.30 Pro rated: Emails to LBM regarding final Self-Governance agenda and coverage of meetings.	

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 15

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P	Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	-----	-----	-----	-----	-----	-----	-----	-----
5021.130000	01/14/2006	MBO	R	A		1	0.12	Pro rated: E-mail correspondence from LBM regarding NCAI meeting with Claude Allen.
5021.130000	01/17/2006	MSJ		A		1	3.84	Pro rated: Attend Self-Governance Advisory Committee tribal caucus and discuss Contract Support Cost issues; forward e-mail summary to LBM and MBO together with handout materials.
5021.130000	01/17/2006	MBO	R	A		1	0.24	Pro rated: Review e-mails from MSJ regarding tribal caucus for DOI SGAC meeting.
5021.130000	01/18/2006	MBO	R	A		1	0.84	Pro rated: Telephone conference with Vice Chairman Smith regarding workgroup to review comments to draft BIA CSC policy; e-mail LBM and MSJ regarding same; e-mail LBM regarding materials for NCAI meeting with Claude Allen.
5021.130000	01/19/2006	LBM	R	A		1	3.60	Pro rated: Work on letter for Vice Chairman Smith.
5021.130000	02/15/2006	LBM	R	A		1	3.60	Pro rated: Telephone acting ASIA (message); conference with Vice Chairman Smith regarding BIA CSC notice in Federal Register (work performed on 1/10/06).
5021.130000	02/24/2006	LBM	R	A		1	0.60	Pro rated: Renew and collect materials for NCAI presentation and for meeting with Activity Assistant Secretary regarding BIA CSC policy.
5021.130000	02/28/2006	MSJ		A		1	2.40	Pro rated: Review firm memorandum to Coalition clients on Contract Support Cost policy and Bureau of Indian Affairs Federal Register announcing 2006 Contract Support Costs policy; attend meeting with LBM and Vice-Chairman Smith with Assistant Secretary-Indian Affairs and staff regarding public comments to Contract Support Costs policy and changing 2006 procedures and distribution of funds.
5021.130000	02/28/2006	LBM	R	A		1	5.52	Pro rated: Pre-meeting with Vice-Chairman Smith; round trip to DOI and meet with Assistant Secretary Cason and MSJ; follow-up discussions regarding same (2.8); final preparations of remarks to NCAI focusing on CSC appropriations and related issues; present same; e-mail to NCAI regarding support for CSC appropriations increases.
5021.130000	03/03/2006	LBM	R	A		1	4.20	Pro rated: Work on client reports regarding ASIA and Hill meetings; work on client draft letters; work on letter to Domestic Policy Advisor; e-mail partners regarding next moves on Hill.
5021.130000	04/07/2006	MSJ		A		1	0.30	Pro rated: Review LBM e-mail and call to Bureau of Indian Affairs Assist. Secretary's office regarding status on Contract Support Costs policy.
5021.130000	04/14/2006	LBM	R	A		1	0.24	Pro rated: Attempted telephone conferences with Associate Deputy Secretary, Bureau of Indian Affairs

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 16

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
-----	----	----	----	-----	---	-----	-----
						Director Pat Ragsdale, and Harry Rainbolt regarding finalization of Contract Support Costs policy; review e-mails; telephone conference with Dr. Dave Mather regarding Indian Health Service Contract Support Costs policy changes.	
5021.130000	04/20/2006	MBO	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: E-mail LBM regarding memorandum on Contract Support Costs policy changes; send corrected memorandum.	
5021.130000	04/20/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Bureau of Indian Affairs Director regarding status of final adoption of CSC policy.	
5021.130000	04/26/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.84 Pro rated: Work on Solicitor General Conference to present Contract Support Costs issues in Michigan.	
5021.130000	05/09/2006	LBM	R	A	1	2.40 Pro rated: Travel to Self-Governance Conference for Contract Support Costs meeting with ASIA Jim Cason.	
5021.130000	05/11/2006	LBM	R	A	1	2.28 Pro rated: Prepare for Bureau of Indian Affairs Contract Support Costs presentation regarding new Bureau of Indian Affairs policy; present and participate in same.	
5021.130000	05/12/2006	LBM	R	A	1	2.52 Pro rated: Final preparation and present Bureau of Indian Affairs CSC/DCSC policy to National Self-Governance conference with Associate Secretary Cason and Potawami Self-Governance Coordinator; e-mail Senator Murkowski's Office regarding Contract Support Costs meeting.	
5021.130000	05/12/2006	LBM	R	A	1	3.60 Pro rated: Return travel from Michigan Self-Governance Conference (pro rated); work on coalition report.	
5021.130000	05/25/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.12 Pro rated: E-mail with CSCWG Member regarding implementation of Bureau of Indian Affairs policy.	
5021.130000	05/25/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.36 Pro rated: E-mails regarding Bureau of Indian Affairs implementation of Contract Support Costs policy.	
5021.130000	05/26/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.48 Pro rated: Attempted telephone calls to Bureau of Indian Affairs Deputy Director and to Bureau of Indian Affairs ISD Advisor regarding CSC policy instructions; e-mail Workgroup Members regarding same; telephone conferences with Bureau of Indian Affairs ISD Director regarding same to review draft Cason letter.	
5021.130000	06/26/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.24 Pro rated: Brief review DCSC policy attachments.	
5021.130000	06/27/2006	LBM	R	A	1	0.84 Pro rated: Telephone conference with Deputy Director and Bureau of Indian Affairs regarding implementation of Contract Support Costs policy and meeting in September of Workgroup; follow-up to same.	
5021.130000	09/06/2006	LBM	R	A	1	1.68 Pro rated: Conference call with BIA and Tribal	

Date: 06/18/2008

Detail Fee Transaction File List

Page: 17

SONOSKY CHAMBERS SACHSE ENDRESON & PERRY, LLP

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P Number	Tcd	Hours to Bill	Ref #
						Representatives to discuss CSCWG process, CSC policy and FY 2007 outlook.	
						GRAND TOTALS	
					Total	453.56	

Client	Trans Date	Atty	Src	H Check P	Number	Tcd	Amount	Ref #
Client ID 5009.030000	Pueblo of Zuni							
5009.030000	05/31/2007	LBM	R	A		63	0.20 Long distance telephone services (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	06/30/2007	LBM	R	A		63	0.10 Long distance telephone services (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	06/30/2007	LBM	R	A		66	1.50 Postage (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	06/30/2007	LBM	R	A		61	2.00 Facsimile charges (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	06/30/2007	LBM	R	A		60	10.70 Photocopies (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	08/14/2007	LBM	R	A		60	3.10 Photocopies (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	08/15/2007	LBM	R	A		64	12.48 On-line legal research (Anchorage Office) on PACER.	ARCH
5009.030000	08/15/2007	LBM	R	A		60	7.40 Photocopies (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	08/16/2007	LBM	R	A		60	13.80 Photocopies (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	08/17/2007	LBM	R	A		60	1.00 Photocopies (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	08/17/2007	LBM	R	A		60	7.70 Photocopies (Anchorage office)	ARCH
5009.030000	09/06/2007	LBM	R	A		51	1.00 Facsimile charges (DC office)	ARCH
5009.030000	09/12/2007	LBM	R	A		51	1.00 Facsimile charges (DC office)	ARCH
5009.030000	09/12/2007	LBM	R	A		51	1.50 Facsimile charges (DC office)	ARCH
5009.030000	09/25/2007	LBM	R	A		3	2731.87	ARCH
							LBM travel to D.C. from August 13, through August 17, 2007 :	
							Airfare \$1647.59	
							Hotel 874.80	
							Meals 138.63	
							Local travel 38.00	
							E-mail 32.85	
5009.030000	09/25/2007	LBM	R	A		61	10.00 Facsimile charges (Anchorage office) while in California.	ARCH
5009.030000	12/27/2007	LBM	R	A		3	1888.20 LBM travel to Seattle, WA from November 12, through November 14, 2007:	ARCH
							Airfare \$850.30	
							Hotel 809.20	
							Meals 143.70	
							Local travel 85.00	
5009.030000	04/21/2008	LBM	R	P		3	931.45 LBM travel to Albuquerque, NM from April 9, through April 16, 2008:	18
							Airfare \$634.54	
							Car rental \$185.27	
							Meals \$72.33	
							Local travel \$39.31	

GRAND TOTALS

Billable 5625.00