

ATTORNEY TIME  
EQUITABLE RELIEF: BENCHMARKING

02/22/99	Preparation of NCAI Task Force correspondence; office conference with CB Rogers; telephone conference with Joe Webster regarding "Ramah Fix"	3.00
03/29/99	Telephone conference with Roger LaRouche regarding estimating "Ramah fix" for NCAI Task Force	.90
03/30/99	Preparation of correspondence to R LaRouche	1.25
03/31/99	Revision of correspondence to R LaRouche; office conference	1.00
04/19/99	Drafted recommendations on "Ramah Fix" for NCAI Task Force; prepared correspondence to JW Zavitz	2.00
04/20/99	Review and revision of "Ramah Fix" recommendations	.75
10/26/99	Conference call with CB Rogers, JW Zavitz and Patti Jamison regarding November 8 <sup>th</sup> meeting; draft of Position Paper on Section 114	1.50
10/27/99	Review and revision of drafted Position Paper on Section 114	1.50
10/28/99	Office conference with CB Rogers regarding Position Paper on Section 114; review and revision of same	3.00
11/01/99	Revision and finalization of Position Paper on Section 114; telephone conference with Joe Webster and CB Rogers; telephone conference with JW Zavitz; 'power of order' Maneuver to challenge Section 114 in FY2000 appropriations bill	3.00
11/03/99	Revision of Position Paper; telephone conference with CB Rogers	3.00
09/25/00	Telephone conferences with Tim Millet of DOJ, Patti Jamison and JW Zavitz	.33
09/28/00	Telephone conferences with CB Rogers, JO Donham and Wm Perry; emails to P Jamison regarding equitable relief, etc.	2.00
01/30/01	Contacts and meetings with various staff members of Congress while in Washington DC for mediation	2.00
02/01/01	Meetings with Congressional staff members	1.00
05/11/01	Worked with CB Rogers on Benchmarking documents	1.25
05/13/01	En route travel to Washington DC	3.50
05/14/01	Meeting with Patti Jamison on Benchmarking issue	3.00
05/15/01	Return travel from Washington DC to Santa Fe	4.00

**MICHAEL P. GROSS**  
**ATTORNEY TIME**  
**RAMAH V. NORTON, CIV No. 90-0957**  
**PAGE 2 OF 2**

---

05/21/01	Worked on final changes for Benchmarking documents; office conference with CB Rogers; proofread and revised Stipulated Order	2.50
02/14/02	Telephone conferences with Greg Anderson and CB Rogers regarding benchmarking	1.20
04/03/02	Office conference with CB Rogers regarding benchmarking	.50
04/24/02	Travel to Washington DC; conference with CB Rogers en route regarding negotiations on equitable relief	9.00
04/26/02	Negotiations on equitable relief	6.00
04/28/02	Return travel from Washington DC to Santa Fe	7.00
04/29/02	Office conference with CB Rogers regarding benchmarking; worked together on template for benchmarking developed by OIG; telephone conference with K Richardson	3.00
04/30/02	Office conference with CB Rogers regarding benchmarking; conference call with K Richardson, etal.	3.25
05/01/02	Reworked Model 2 template for benchmarking	7.50
05/02/02	Continued work on Model 2 template for benchmarking	2.50
05/03/02	Continued work on Model 2 template for benchmarking	6.50
05/06/02	Continued work on Model 2 template for benchmarking	2.50
05/07/02	Continued work on Model 2 template for benchmarking	.60
06/26/02	Office conference with CB Rogers regarding benchmarking and carryforwards	.70
07/01/02	Conference call with CB Rogers, K Ricahrdson, OIG people, and L Vassar regarding carryforwards and benchmarking	1.50
07/02/02	Drafted Stipulated Order to clarify June 1, 2001 Order on benchmarking; telephone conference with CB Rogers	2.50
07/03/02	Finalized draft Stipulated Order; worked with CB Rogers	2.50
07/29/02	Meetings with OIG and Counsel in Santa Fe regarding benchmarking/carry forwards issues	4.00
07/30/02	Meetings with OIG and Counsel in Santa Fe regarding benchmarking/carry forwards issues	6.00
07/31/02	Meetings with OIG and Counsel in Santa Fe regarding benchmarking/carry forwards issues	4.00

**TOTAL HOURS:**

**111.23**